MEMORANDUM

COUNTY OF PLACER

ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES DEPARTMENT
PROCUREMENT SERVICES DIVISION

TO: Honorable Board of Supervisors
"FROM:  Jim Boggan, Purchasing Manager Q[ﬁ
DATE: June 8, 2010

SUBJECT: Approve the Award of Competitive Bid No. 9969 to Blain Stumpf Trucking,
Hansen Bros. Enterprises, Sutter Transfer Service, Cinderlite Trucking, and JC
Osoy Trucking for Aggregate Materials and Hauling in the Maximum Aggregate
Amount of $474,720.00

ACTION REQUESTED

Approve the award of competitive Bid No. 9969 to Blain Stumpf Trucking of Shingle Springs,
Hansen Bros. Enterprises of Grass Valley, Sutter Transfer Service of Sutter, Cinderlite Trucking
of Carson City, and JC Osoy Trucking of Yuba City, for aggregate materials and hauling
services as detailed in Exhibit A in the maximum aggregate amount of $474,720.00, and
authorize the Purchasing Manager to sign the resuiting blanket purchase orders (BPO) and to
transfer funds between BPOs as necessary to meet the County’s needs.

BACKGROUND

The Department of Public Works — Road Maintenance Division requires annual blanket
purchase orders for the purchase and delivery of aggregate materials as-needed for various
road maintenance projects. Bid No. 9969 was distributed via the County’s E-Bid system to
sixty-four potential bidders and was also posted on Procurement’s website. A total of eight
responsive bids were received. Local vendor preference was considered but did not affect the
outcome. A summary of the recommended awards and contract amounts is submitted as
Exhibits A and B. The complete bid evaluation is on file with the Clerk of the Board.

FISCAL IMPACT

Upon your Board's approval, five blanket purchase orders resulting from this recommendation
will be issued in the maximum aggregate amount of $474,720.00 for the period of June 8, 2010
through March 31, 2011. The Department of Public Works’ Fiscal Impact Statement is
attached.

Attachments: 1) Exhibits A and B — Summary of Recommended Awards and Rankings
2) Public Works’ Fiscal Impact Statement :

cc: Ken Grehm, Department of Public Works Director

Cynthia Taylor, Department of Public Works Senior Administrative Services Officer
Kevin Taber, Department of Public Works Road Maintenance Division Manager
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Bid No. 9969 - Aggregates

Attachment 1

Exhibit A
, Page 1 of 1
SUMMARY OF RECOMMENDED AWARDS
Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs $ 377,340.00 |

Hansen Bros., Grass Valley $ 23,210.00
Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter $ 9,160.00
JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City $ 8,850.00
Cinderlite Trucking, Carson City $ 56,160.00
TOTAL AWARD AMOUNT: $ 474,720.00
5/18/2010
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Bid No. 9969 - Aggregates

Category A - 3/4" Class Il Aggregate Base :
Destination: Roseville, Granite Bay/Cavitt Stalliman, Lincoln, Auburn, Foresthill, Colfax

_Rank

Bidder

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Hansen Bros., Grass Valley

Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln

Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn

JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City
Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
Cinderlite Trucking Corp., Carson City

Category C - 1/2" Crushed Drain Rock

Destinations: Roseville, Lincoln, Auburn, Foresthill, Colfax

Rank

J. Manning

Bidder

~ Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter

Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln

Robinson Sand‘& Gravel, Auburn

Hansen Bros., Grass Valley
JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City, CA
Cinderlite Trucking Corp., Carson City

RANKINGS

WESTERN PLACER COUNTY

Mine 1D Information

Western Aggregates, ID #91-58-0001 (A.1 -
A.4), Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09-0005

{A.5), and Chevreaux Aggregates, ID #91-31-

0004 (A.6)

Western Aggregates, ID #91-58-0001

Hansen Bros., ID #91-29-0006

Waestemn Aggregates, ID #91-58-0001 (A.1 -

A 3), Teichert Aggregates, ID #04-05503 (A.4 -
A.6)

Waestern Aggregates, ID #91-58-0001 (A.1 -

A 3), Teichert Aggregates, ID #04-05503 (A.4 -
A.6) .

Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09-0005

Mine ID Information

Western Aggregates, ID #91-58-0001 (C.1 -
C.3), and Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09-
0005 (C.4) and ID #91-58-0006 (C.5)

Western Aggregates, ID #91-58-0001
Granite Construction, ID #91-34-0043 (C.1 -
C.2), and Teichert Aggregates, 1D #04-05503
(C.3-C.5)

Knife River Hallwood, ID #04-01698
Westem Aggregates, ID #91-58-0001 (C.1 -
C.2), and Teichert Aggregates, ID #04-01819
(C.3-C.5)

Hansen Bros., ID #91-29-0006

Knife River, ID #04-04772, and Teichert
Aggregates, 1D #91-09-0005 (C.1 - C.5)

Name of Haul
Biain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle
Springs

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Hansen Bros., Grass Valley

Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln

Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn

JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City

Name of Hauler
Blain Stumnpf Trucking, Shingle
Springs

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter

Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel,
Sacramento

Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Aubum

Hansen Bros., Grass Valley

JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City, CA .

Combined Total Price

$ 89,995.00
$ 97,520.00
$ 99,560.00
$ . 103,710.00
$ 107,895.00
$ 117,095.00
Non-Responsive Bid
No Bid

Combined Total Price

$ 22,687.50
$ 24,037.50
$ 26,340.00
$ 26,687.50
$ 27,470.00
$ 34,667.50
$ 38,102.50
No Bid

Attachment 1
Exhibit B
Page 1 of 5
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Bid No. 9969 - Aggregates

J. Manning

Category D - 3/4" Crushed Drain Rock
Destinations: Roseville, Granite Bay/Cavitt Stallman, Lincoln, Auburn, Foresthill, Colfax

Rank

Bidder

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter

Robinson Sand & Gravel, Aubum
Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento

Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln

JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City, CA
Cinderlite Trucking Corp., Carson City
Hansen Bros. Ent., Grass Valley

Category F - 1-1/2" Crushed Drain Rock

Destinations: Roseville, Lincoln, Auburn, Foresthill, Colfax

Rank
1

D DWW N

Bidder

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs

Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln
Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn

Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento

JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City, CA
Cinderlite Trucking Corp., Carson City
Hansen Bros. Ent., Grass Valley

Cateqory H - 4 x 12 Rip Rap

Destinations: Roseville, Lincoln, Auburn, Foresthill, Colfax

Rank
1

2

3

Bidder
Hansen Bros., Grass Valley
Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Aubum

Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln

JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City, CA
Cinderlite Trucking Corp., Carson City
Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento

RANKINGS

Mine ID Information

Western Aggregates, ID #91-58-0001 (D.1 -
D.3), and Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-31-
0004 (D.4 and D.6) and 1D #91-09-0005 (D.5)

Western Aggregates, ID #91-58-0001
Western Aggregates, ID #91-58-0001 (D.1 -
D.3), and Teichert Aggregates, ID #04-05503
(D.4-D.6)

Granite Construction, ID #91-34-0043 (D.1 -
D.3), and Teichert Aggregates, ID #04-05503
(D.4-D.6)

Western Aggregates, ID #91-58-0001 (D.1 -
D.3), and Teichert Aggregates, ID #04-05503
(D.4-D.6)

Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09-0005

Mine ID Information

Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-58-0006 (F.1 -
F.2) and ID #81-31-0004 (F.3 - F.5)

Knife River Hallwood, ID #04-01698

Teichert Aggregates, ID #04-05503

Teichert Aggregates, ID #04-001819

Granite Construction, 1D #91-34-0043
Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09-0005

Mine ID Information

Hansen Bros., ID #91-29-0007

Hansen Bros., ID #91-29-0007 (H.1, H.3, and
H.5) and Teichert Aggregates, 1D #91-09-0005
(H.2and H.4)

Teichert Aggregates, ID #04-05503

Teichert Aggregates, ID #04-05503

Western Aggregates, 1D #91-58-0001 (H.1 -
H.2), and Teichert Aggregates, ID #04-05503
(H.3-H.5)

Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09-0005

Name of Hauler
Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle
Springs
Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter

Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn

Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel,
Sacramento

Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln

JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City, CA

Name of Hauler

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle
Springs

Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln
Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn
Hastie's Capitol Sand & Grave!,
Sacramento

JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City, CA

Name of Hauler
Hansen Bros., Grass Valley
Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn

Larry Newrnan Trucking, Lincoln

JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City, CA

Combined Total Price

$ 50,381.00
$ 53,699.00
$ 58,108.00
$ 58,125.00
$ 60,147.00
$ 63,530.00

No Bid

No Bid

Combined Total Price

38,005.00

40,405.00
43,219.00
44,075.00

44,474.00

52,830.00
No Bid
No Bid

¥ P BN 0

Combined Total Price

$ ) 23,210.00
$ 23,744.00
$ 26,490.00
$ 26,708.00
$ 33,446.00
$ 37,120.00

No Bid

No Bid

Aftachment 1
Exhibit B
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Bid No. 9969 - Aggregates

J. Manning

Category J -4 x 12 Cobble

Destinations: Roseville, Foresthill

Rank
1

2
3
4
5
6

Bidder

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs

JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City, CA

‘Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento

Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Aubum
Cinderlite Trucking Corp., Carson City
Hansen Bros. Ent, Grass Valley

Cateqgory L - 5/16" x 8 Chips

Destinations: Roseville, Lincoln, Auburn, Foresthill, Colfax

Rank

1

2

Bidder

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs
Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln

Robinson Sand & Gravel, Aubum

JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City

Cinderlite Trucking Corp., Carson City
Hansen Bros. Ent,, Grass Valley

Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento

RANKINGS

Mine ID Information

Western Aggregates, |D #91-58-0001
Western Aggregates, |D #91-58-0001
Western Aggregates, ID #91-58-0001
Western Aggregates, ID #91-58-0001

Knife River Hallwood, ID #04-01698
SR, ID #04-05403

Mine ID Information

Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-34-0006 (L.1 -
L.2) and ID #91-31-0004 (L.3 - L.5)

Teichert Aggregates, ID #04-001819

Western Aggregates, ID #91-58-0001 (L.1 -
L.2), Teichert Aggregates, ID #04-05503 (L.3 -
L.4) and ID #04-01679 (L.5)

Teichert Aggregates, ID #04-001819

Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09-0005

Name of Hauler

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs

JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City, CA
Hastie's Capito! Sand & Gravel,
Sacramento

Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Aubum

Name of Hauler

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle
Springs

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln

Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn
JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City

Combined Total Price

$ 9,156.00
$ 9,188.00
$ 9,256.00
$ 9,638.00
$ 9,852.00
$ 11,836.00

No Bid

No Bid

Combined Total Price

$ 176,265.00
$ 181,925.00
$ 182,705.00
$ 186,030.00
$ 243,260.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Attachment 1
Exhibit B
Page 3 of 5
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Bid No. 9969 - Aggregates

J. Manning

Category B - 3/4" Class Il Aggregate Base

Destination: Soda Springs/Serene Lakes and Tahoe City

Bidder
Rank

1 Cinderlite Trucking, Carson City

2 JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City

3 Hansen Bros., Grass Valley

4 Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln
Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs
Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn

Category E - 3/4" Crushed Drain Rock
Destination: Tahoe City

Bidder

Rank

1 JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City

2 Cinderlite Trucking, Carson City

3 Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs
Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter

Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn

Hansen Bros., Grass Valley

Category G - 1-1/2" Crushed Drain Rock
Destination: Tahoe City

Bidder
Rank
1 Cinderlite Trucking, Carson City
2 JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City
3 Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs
Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter

Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn

Hansen Bros., Grass Valley

RANKINGS

EASTERN PLACER COUNTY

Mine ID Iinformation

Cinderlite, ID #26-02647

Western Aggregates, 1D #91-58-0001
Hansen Bros., ID #91-290006
Teichert Aggregates, ID #04-01679

Mine ID Information

Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09-0005
Cinderlite, 1D #26-02647
Teichert Aggregates, ID #04-01679

Mine ID Information

Cinderlite, ID #26-02647
Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09-0005
Western Aggregates, ID #91-58-0001

Name of Hauler

Cinderlite Trucking, Carson City
JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City
Hansen Bros:, Grass Valley

Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln

Name of Hauler

JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City
Cinderlite Trucking, Carson City
Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln

Name of Hauler

Cinderlite Trucking, Carson City
JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City
Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoin

©¥ éhHH»

@ H»

©¥ H W

Attachment 1
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Combined Total Price

13,518.00
16,629.00
18,771.00
19,075.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Combined Total Price

4,330.00
4,394.00
6,172.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Combined Total Price

2,614.00
2,961.00
3,140.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

5/18/2010
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Bid No. 9969 - Aggregates

Category | -4 x 12 Rip Rap
Destination: Tahoe City
Bidder

1 Cinderlite Trucking, Carson City

2 Hansen Bros., Grass Valley

3 JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City

4 Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln
Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs
Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn

Category K -4 x 12 Cobble
Destination: Tahoe City

Bidder
Rank
1 JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City
Cinderlite Trucking, Carson City
3 Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln
Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs
Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Hastie's Capito! Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn
Hansen Bros., Grass Valley

N

Category M - 5/16" x 8 Chips
Destinations: Soda Springs/Serene Lakes and Tahoe City
Bidder -

Rank

I

1 Cinderlite Trucking, Carson City

2 Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln

3 JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City
Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs
Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter
Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn
Hansen Bros., Grass Valley '

J. Manning

RANKINGS

Mine ID Information

Cinderlite, 1D #26-02647

Hansen Bros., iD #91-290006
Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09-0005
Teichert Aggregates, |1D #04-01679

Mine ID Information

Teichert Aggregates, ID #91-09-0005

Cinderlite, ID #26-02647
Knife Biver Hallwood, ID #04-01698

Mine ID Information

Cinderlite, ID #26-02647
Knife River Hallwood, ID #04-01698
Granite Construction, ID #26-02204

Name of Hauler

Cinderlite Trucking, Carson City
Hansen Bros., Grass Valley

JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City
Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln

Name of Hauler

JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City
Cinderiite Trucking, Carson City
Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln

Name of Hauler

Cinderlite Trucking, Carson City
Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln
JC Osoy Trucking, Yuba City

Attachment 1
Exhibit B
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Combined Total Price

8,202.00
10,749.00
11,136.00
15,264.00

No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid

“ H H W

Combined Total Price

$ 4,430.00
$ 5,468.00
$ 6,928.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Combined Total Price

$ 31,818.00
46,776.00
46,920.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

©* P
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Aftachment 2

MEMORANDUM

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
County of Placer

TO: Honorable Board of Supervisors | DATE: June 8, 2010
FROM: Ken Grehm, Director
SUBJECT: FISCAL IMPACT STATEMENT

Supply and Deliver Aggregate Materials

Sufficient funding has been budgeted in the amount of $474,720.00 in the FY 2009-10
Roads Division budget.
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