MEMORANDUM

OFFICE OF THE
AUDITOR-CONTROLLER
COUNTY OF PLACER
TO: Board of Supervisors _
FROM:  Katherine J. Martinis 43//”

DATE: September 14, 2010

SUBJECT: . Replacement of Stale Dated Warrant

Action Requestéd/Recommendation

Authorize the Auditor-Controller to issue a warrant payable to Anne Staines in the amount of $9,134.92
replacing the original warrant # 10196069 dated July 23, 2007. '

Backg' round

The Auditor—Controller's Office processes (voids) stale dated warrants not presented to the bank for
payment six months from date of issue as specified in CA Government Code Section 29802 (a). The
process also moves voided warrant funds to the general fund. In this case, the original warrant
10196069 was cancelled on February 1, 2008. '

On July 21, 2010, the Auditor-Controller's Office received a payment request to re-issue the warrant
from Asset Management, assignee of Anne Staines.

The CA Govemmment code Section 29802 (c) states “If, at any time after a_period of two years from
the date on which the original warrant became void, or during such other period of time as specified
by ordinance, the payee or assignee presents such warrant to the governing body of the agency on
- which the warrant was drawn, the governing body may adopt an order instructing the county auditor
to draw a new warrant in favor of the payee or assignee in the same amount as the original warrant,”
...and if “money is available in the county treasury to make payment on the indebtedness.”

Fiscal Impact
Funds are available in the General Fund, Appropriation 09992, where the voided funds were placed at

the time of cancellation on February 1, 2008.
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e ASSET MANAGEMENT

Consultant

To: Ms. Katherine Martinis : July 15, 2010
From: Ms. Mimi Roscll

Fax: (530)889 4163

Subject: Request to Reissue an Uncashed Check

Dear Ms. Martinis:

‘Please consider this to be a request that you reissue an uncashed check for my client
STAINES, ANNE C.

" The original check amount was $9,135 and was originhlly issued and mailed on or about
7/23/2007. A copy of the Powcr of Attorney authonnng this request is available foz your
review. ,

Details:
Check# 10196069

Please reissue that check and forward it to my client at:

PROPROSE, LLC
Attn: Ms. Anne C. Staines

If you have any questions cohccming this request, then please feel free to contact me directly
at (800) 336-1857. _ :

Sincerely,

Wleme fonsel/

Mimi Rosell
Asset Management Consultants

!

12841 Fitzwatcr Drive - Nokesville - VA 20181-2734 « (703) 594-3100 -Fax (703) 594-2187
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Date: July 6, 2010 S B
- ProProse
To:  Jerald £ Jacobs . Social Marieting Solutions
From: Ms. Anne C. Stalnes

Fax:  (703) 594-2187 -

Subject:STAINES, ANNE G / PROPROSE, LiC
Client |1D: STAILZA

Oear Mr. lacabs

This letter sarves as formal autharizatlon for you, Asset Management Consultants of Virginia, In¢. (“AMCY), and
the AMC employeas you directly supervise {collactively, “AMC; tn‘c."j to serve a5 my anemey-ln-féct with
respect to the recovery of monetary assets in which i'have a legal or aquitable Intarest. Thosa assets currently
are In the possesslon of a local, state or federal governmentat entity and are being heid for STAINES, ANNE C/

PROPROSE, LLC.

~ ARG Inc,, Is hergby authorred to take any. and all actions necessary to-effect the.recavery of such assats, ...
including, without limitation, making demand for Lhe:r;iem of such assets, praparing all necessary raledse
documents, submitting same to tha custodlan of such assets, and executing any and oll release Instruments If
recovery of such assets Is contingent upon the submission of same. The assets may be in the form of such
negotiable firanclal untes as cradit balances, overpayments, depasits, guaranties, and surcties.

It is further noted that the assets now at Issue and saught ta be recovered through AMC are presumed o have
~ been eligiile for and subject to recovery for a:period of ar least twelve {12) months, éxcepting any funds
specificaily ldentifled and listed below as belng exampted from this grant of authority.

EXEMPT FUNDS: Any funds held by the State of Californla
:A.nnac,suines. -
" Dwinér, ProPrase LLC (formerky Anne C. Stairies dba ProProse)

STATE OF California,

CITY/COUNTY OF Sacramento, to-wit:

On this ﬁﬁ?d&y of Ayoqusk , 201 03, the foregoling Letter of Autharizetion was personally

acknowledged and_signed hefore me, 8 Notary Public; In-my presonce and Jurlsdiction aforesald, by
Anng C Steinesy, & person known by.me, who dld first aflim In my

preicﬁoe that the same wa's dong voluntacily and of her/his own free will. /.-\> '

T
NOTARY PUBLIC

My commission expires: Mﬁ‘j 25 2o}

www.f’mf*mm.“.nm ~ Wra=da gyl -~ umc&'ﬂpmp roge,Com
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