
MEMORANDUM 
COUNTY OF PLACER 
ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES DEPARTMENT 
PROCUREMENT SERVICES DIVISION 

TO: Honorable Board of Supervisors 

FROM: Brett Wood, Purchasing Manager 

DATE: July 23, 2013 

SUBJECT: Bid No. 10273 for Patrol Vehicle Equipment and Supplies- Lehr Auto Electric 

ACTION REQUESTED 

1. Approve the award of competitive Bid No. 10273 to Lehr Auto Electric of Sacramento (CA), for 
patrol vehicle equipment and supplies in the maximum amount of $97,000, funded by the 
Sheriff's Office Budget with a net County cost of $97,000, for the period of July 23, 2013 through 
June 30, 2014; 

2. Approve the option to renew the resulting agreement on a year-to-year basis for three additional 
one-year terms provided that each renewal amount does not exceed 1 0 percent of the 
recommended contract amount of $97,000; and 

3. Authorize the Purchasing Manager to sign the resulting blanket purchase orders. 

BACKGROUND 

The Placer County Sheriffs Office (PCSO) requires an annual BPO for the as-needed purchase of 
patrol vehicle equipment and supplies including, but not limited to, lightbars, sirens, and vehicle 
partitions. The department's most recent BPO expired on June 30, 2013. 

The Procurement Services Division developed Invitation for Bids (IFB) No. 10273 to solicit competitive 
bids for the various patrol vehicle equipment and supplies required by PCSO. The bid was distributed 
via the County's e-Procurement platform, Public Purchase, to 26 potential bidders and was advertised 
on the County's website. A total of 24 bidders viewed the bid online and two bids were received. None 
of the bidders that participated in the solicitation are certified to receive local vendor preference credit 
nor did they offer any prompt payment discounts. As the result of the bid evaluation Procurement 
recommends the award of Bid No. 10273 to the department's most recent contract vendor, Lehr Auto 
Electric. A complete bid evaluation summary is submitted as Attachment A. 

FISCAL IMPACT 

Upon your Board's approval, a BPO will be awarded to Lehr Auto Electric in the maximum amount of 
$97,000. The new BPO will be effective for the period of July 23, 2013 through June 30, 2014. The 
department's Fiscal Impact Statement is attached (refer to Attachment B). 

Attachments: A. Bid Evaluation and Recommended Award 

cc: 

B. Placer County Sheriff's Fiscal Impact Statement 

Captain Don Hutchinson, Sheriff's Office Administrative Captain 
Judy LaPorte, Sheriffs Office Administrative Services Manager 
Liz Zmyslowski, Sheriff's Office Senior Administrative Services Officer 1&3 



COUNTY OF PLACER, AUBURN, CA 
BID EVALUATION & AWARD RECOMMENDATION 

Attachment A 
Page 1 of 2 

Bid No. 
Title: 

10273 Buyer Name/Phone: Jon Manning, 530-889-4290 

Due Date: 
Patrol Vehicle Equipment and Supplies 
6/20/13 @ 2:30:00 PM (Pacific) 

Name of Firm 
City/State 

Contact Person 
Telephone 

Email 

FOB 
Delivery Time 

LVP Certified? (ll 

Invoice Terms f2) 

Item 
No. Item Description 

Lightbar with the following options/modifications: Add (2) 
LR11 Flashing Alley Lights, LED (SRALF1): Add (2) 500 
Series inboard LED. one red and one blue (SLDBR); Add 

1 (2) 500 Series inboard LED, one red and one blue 
(SLDBR); Add (2) TIR high output LED take downs, 
flashing or steady (SXTDLED); and Add (2) 500 Series 
inboard LED, amber/amber (SLDAA). 

Strap Kit for LFL Liberty SW WeCan Series Super-LED 
2 54" Lightbar. Strap Kit shall be compatible with Chevrolet 

Tahoe Police SUVs. 

CenCom Sapphire Siren with amplifier control module with 
3 pigtails, traffic advisor module, and microphone with 

CCMICX20 included (20' microphone cable). 

4 
Full Aluminum Push Bumpers. Push bumpers shall be 
compatible with 2011 +Chevrolet Tahoe Police SUVs. 

Patrol Car Seat. black, with Laguna Seat Belts and Rear 
5 Cargo Cage. Patrol car seat shall be compatible with 

2011+ Chevrolet Tahoe Police SUVs. 

Stationary Vinyl Coated Partition with Full Lower Extension 
6 Panel. The partition shall be compatible with 2011+ 

Chevrolet Tahoe Police SUVs. 

7 Shotgun Gun Lock 

8 Ratchet Lock 

9 Muzzle Up Partition Mount 

10 Siren Speaker 

11 Speaker Bracket Kit for Whelen SA315P Speaker 

12 
Plug In Headlight Flasher for 2007+ Chevrolet Tahoe 
Police SUVs 

13 
Vertex Super·LED Light. Single Self·Contained 
Hemispheric Light. Color: BLUE 

14 
Vertex Super-LED Light, Single Self-Contained 
Hemispheric Light, Color: RED 

15 
LIN3 Series Super-LED Lighthead, Horizontal Mounting, 
Color: BLUE 

Qty 

10 

10 

10 

10 

10 

10 

10 

10 

20 

10 

10 

10 

30 

30 

10 

(Recommended award is highlighted) 

Professional Police Supply Lehr Auto Electric 
Hayward CA Sacramento CA 

Mike Cooper Jim Stommel 
510·723-0643 916-646·6626 
mcooper@policeproducts.com jim@lehrauto.com 

Destination Destination 
30-45 Days ARO 10 Days ARO 

No No 
Net 30 Net 30 

Unit Price Extension Unit Price Extension 

1,775.08 17,750.80 1,425.00 14,250.00 

0.00 0.00 50.00 500.00 

676.47 6,764.70 550.00 5,500.00 

195.76 1,957.60 240.00 2,400.00 

724.00 7,240.00 800.00 8,000.00 

526.78 5,267.80 550.00 5,500.00 

58.24 582.40 64.35 643.50 

90.59 905.90 100.10 1,001.00 

58.24 1,164.80 58.50 1,170.00 

150.09 1,500.90 160.00 1,600.00 

0.00 0.00 20.00 200.00 

55.06 550.60 62.40 624.00 

58.52 1,755.60 68.00 2,040.00 

58.52 1,755.60 68.00 2,040.00 

51.31 513.10 50.00 500.00 



25 

26 

27 

28 

(1) 

(2) 

City/State 

Contact Person 
Telephone 

Email 

FOB 
Delivery Time 

Series Super-LED Lighthead, Horizontal Mounting, 
RED 

Bracket for LIN3 Series Super-LED Lighthead 
I Mounting) 

i ISO Relay 12V SPOT/Form C 40 Amp Continuous 

Shut-Off Timer 

Continuous Duty Solenoid 200 Amp 

12" Gooseneck Lamp with Rehostat Control, 
Extends From End of Chassis, Lead Extends 

Bottom of Chassis. 

off list price for other Hella USA products not 
above. 

off list price for other SoundOff products not 
above. 

Discount off list price for other Federal Signal products not 
above. 

Discount off list price for other Setina products not 
above. 

Discount off list price for other Cole Hersee products not 
above. 

Discount off list price for other Whelen Engineering 
products not specified above. 

10 

20 

20 

10 

20 

10 

100.00 

100.00 

100.00 

100.00 

100.00 

100.00 

100.00 

Local Vendor Preference is granted to those firms who file an LVP Affidavit with the 
County prior to the close of the bid. 

Invoice Terms of less than 10 days were not considered in this evaluation. 

Hayward CA 

Mike Cooper 
510-723-0643 
mcooper@policeproducts com 

Destination 
30-45 Days ARO 

51.31 

6.93 

NO BID 

62.89 

NO BID 

41.09 

35.00% 

NO BID 

42.00% 

35.00% 

41.00% 

NO BID 

43.00% 

59.00 

EVALUATION NOTES: The Lighthouse Inc. and R-SAFE Specialty each submitted "No Bid" responses. 

EVALUATION SUMMARY- LISTED BY LOW BIDDER: 
1-
2-

Lehr Auto Electric 
Professional Police Supply 

CA 

0 DaysARO 

50.00 

7.71 

4.17 

68.00 

41.96 

44.45 

30.00% 

50.00% 

40.00% 

40.00% 

25.00% 

57.00% 

40.00% 

$52,769.39 
$53,433.20 

Attachment A 
Page 2 of 2 
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PLACER COUNTY 

SHERIFF 
CORONER-MARSHAL 

MAIN OFFICE 
2929 RICHARDSON DR. 
AUBURN, CA 95603 
PH: (530)889-7800 FAX: (530) 889-7899 

TAHOE SUBSTATION 
DRAWER 1710 
TAHOE CITY, CA96145 

Attachment B 

PH: (530)581-6300 FAX: (530)581-6377 

EDWARD N. BONNER 
SHERIFF-CORONER-MARSHAL 

DEVON BELL 
UNDERSHERIFF 

TO: 

FROM: 

DATE: 

SUBJECT: 

FISCAL IMPACT STATEMENT 

Honorable Board of Supervisors 

Sheriff Edward Bonner 

July 23, 2013 

Fiscal Impact Statement 
BPO Renewal for Lehr Auto Parts for the period 07-23-13- 06-30-14 

Funds are included in the current FY 2013-14 Sheriff's Office budget for these expenses resulting in 
Budgeted Net County Costs of$97,000. 

The Lehr Auto Electric, Inc. BPO is used by the Jail, Auburn and Tahoe Patrol, and Vehicle Units 
for Code 3 equipment, vehicle repair, electrical parts and new builds. The Sheriff's Vehicle 
Maintenance Unit handles the coordination and management of the build ups for Sheriff's vehicles, 
including lease vehicles and replacement patrol cars. The amount of this request is based on history 
and projections of the planned activity factoring in the work that will be done in-house and the work 
to be completed by other county departments. Based on current usage, we are requesting $97,000.00 
for this BPO for FY 13114. 


