
MEMORANDUM 
COUNTY OF PLACER 
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES 
PROCUREMENT SERVICES DIVISION 

TO: Honorable Board of Supervisors 

FROM: Brett Wood, Purchasing Manager 

DATE: January 10, 2012 

SUBJECT: Approve the Award of Competitive Bid No.1 0117 to Various Vendors for Herbicides, 
Fertilizers and Grass Seeds in the Maximum Aggregate Amount of $75,000.00 

ACTION REQUESTED 

Approve the award of competitive Bid No. 10117 to various vendors for herbicides, fertilizers, and grass 
seeds in the maximum aggregate amount of $75,000.00, and authorize the" Purchasing Manager to sign 
the resulting BPOs. " 

BACKGROUND 

The Facility Services and Public Works Departments have a continuing need to purchase herbicides, 
fertilizers, and grass seeds on an as-needed basis to support their operations. The departments' blanket 
purchase orders for these products expired on September 30,2011. 

Procurement Services developed Invitation for Bids (IFB) No.1 0117 for herbicides, fertilizers, and grass 
seeds. The IFB was distributed via the County's E-Bid system to thirty-three potential bidders and 
advertised on the County's website. A total of eight bid responses were received. The bids were 
evaluated on a line item basis and for compliance with the bid specifications, terms, and conditions. 
Prompt payment discounts and local vendor preference were also considered. Attachment A provides a 
comparison of the bids submitted by the responsive firms. Procurement Services recommends the 
following BPO awards: 

Bidder 
Helena Chemical Company 
Crop Production Services 
John Deere Landscapes 
Wilbur-Ellis Company 
Crop Production Services 
Aggregate Total 

FISCAL IMPACT 

BPOAmount 
$33,000.00 
$18,000.00 
$11,000.00 
$3,000.00 
$10,000.00 
$75,000.00 

Department 
Facility Services 
Facility Services 
Facility Services 
Facility Services 
Public Works 

Upon your Board's approval, blanket purchase orders will be awarded in the total aggregate amountof 
$75,000.00. Fiscal Impact Statements for Facility Services and Public Works are attached (refer to 
Attachments B and C). 

Attachments: A. IFB 10117 Evaluation $preadsheet 

cc: 

B. Department of Administrative Services' Fiscal Impact Statement 
C. Department of Public Works' Fiscal Impact Statement 

Valerie Bayne, Administrative Services Manager 
Kevin Taber, Public Works Manager 



• 
Bid No. 10117 
Title: Herbicides, Fertilizers & Grass Seeds 
Close Date: Odober 7,2011 
Buyer Name: Sob Blgney 
Phone: 630-889-4265 
Estimated Award 0*: Januarv 10 2012 

Item 

• 1 

Item 
Descfiotion 

Monsanto Round·U Pro Concentrate 30- aI., 
Price per 30.gal. drum 

Bld~ Crop Producuon Services 
Ad(lress pO BOK 1954 

CilylStatelZlp Greeley, CO 80632-1954 
Conlact person ScoU P. Canfield 

Telephone 916·369·2891 
FAX Number 916-369·70-46 

Invoice Terms Net GO days delivered 
- Cellve 2·3 days 

COUNTY OF PLACER, AUBURN, CA 

Bid Evaluation Award Recommendation - Attachment A 

Ewing IrrigltlOn Hetena Chemtcll Company John Deere Landscapes. SieITol Pacfflc Turf SUppty rervet Specliity Productfl 
3441 E. Harbour Dr 3155 Southgate Lane 24110 Netwotk PI 510 5almar Ave. 15.415 S. Marquardt Ave. 
Phoenix,l\Z 85034 Chico, CA 95928 Chicago, IlB0673 CampbeD, CA 95008 Santa Fe Springs, CA 90670 
Jerry,Kaylor Paul Smith Keith O. McGinty Craig Thordsen Patricia Cresps" 
916-652·9530 530-342·4786 216-706·9250 916-997·4278 533-0816-1650 
916-652·9533 530·343·9047 248·581·1433 916-434-0607 916-374·0900 

Unlvaf USA Inc. 
File No_ 56019 
Los Angeles. CA 90074-5019 
JazminPhan 
916-371-3854 

~~_ ~W_ ~~ ~~ ~~ ~W 

tweek 2e1ays 7·10daysARO 5daysARO 3-7dt1ys Not stated 
lVP Cerllrl8d? no lVPCertified7 s LVPCertlfied? no LVPcertified? no lVPCertffied? no lVPCertlfiod? 00 LVPCertlrled? no 

Wllbur<lIIs Company 
PO Bo.ll 45326 
San F,ancisco. CA 94145·0326 
Scott Johnson 
888-932-6486 
916-991-1837 
Net 30 days 
10 days or rewer ARO 

LVPCertin 1 
Tenns Discount· 0.00% erms Dlscol1l11· 0.00% enns Discount" 0.00% erms Discount" 0.00% entIS Discount" 0.00% erms Discount" 0.00% erms DIscount" 0.00% erms DIscount" 0.00% 

01 
30 

7.25% sales lax 

Bid Extension Bid extension Bid Extension Bid Extension Bid Extension Bid Extensloll Bi1:I extension Btd extension 
39«.50 S 11835.00 S 1319.475 3958<U5 S 405.00 12 150.00 S 600.00 18000.00 S 549.00 S 16470.00 S 523.00 S 15690.00 $ 727.80 $ 21 834.00 S 4SO.00 13 SOO.OO 

: 858.04 2,869.86 880.88 S 1,305.00 S 1.194.08 $ 1,137.53 $ 1,582.97 978.75 

:~~ _______ $~~12~6~9~3.0~4+_------_f~4~~.4~1~~i7~1~+--------1--'~3~0~~.~~ ______ ~$~~19~3~OS~.OO~--------f:.~1~7~~.0~.~-------1:~1~6~~~7~.53~ ______ ~:~~23~'~16~.9~7t-------_1~1~'~47~ •. ~75'1 

Pr.Ml'lpJPa Disc S : S S $ 
Ref. Pnce S 12,693.04 40,331.40 13,030.88 S 19.305.00 S 1 ,664.08 S 16,827.53 S 23,416.97 14,478.75 

2 MonsantoRound·U ProMax.l.67- al.comai; 50 52.605 2630.25 S 76.755 3837.75 S 53.44 2672.00 S 54.61 2730.50 S 60.60 S 3030.00 S 60.00 3000.00 S 65.41 3 70.50 $ 55.11 2755.50 
Price per 1.67-gal. conlainer 7.25% sales tax 190.69 27824 193.72 197.96 S 219.68 217,50 237,11 199:77 

3 Surflan AS .. 2.5· at container 
Price per 2.5-g81. container 

:~~ ______ ~~2~.~20~'~~ ________ ~_'~~~:~~::~~+_------_1--~2~ •• ~5.~724---____ ~~~2~.~2.~ .• ~.+_------_fS--3~2~~~~~.+_------_1--~3~21~7.~ro4_------~~~3~5~07~ .• ~1+_-------}--~2.9~5~5.~2711 

-~~ ! Ref, nee 2,820.94 3,910.19 2 B6 . 2 2.928.46 $ ,49.68 ,21 . 0 3,0 1 2,955,27 

32 105.25 3368.00 S 139.104 $ 4451.33 $ 100.00 .00 S 125.32 4042.24 S 121.00 3872.00 S 109.00 $ 3488.00 S 126.82 4058.24 S 115.00 3,680.00 
7.25% sales tax 3 !~::~: -SUbSltlUle": 322.72 232.00 293.06 280.72 : 252.88 294.22 266.80 

~~'~ ______ ~ __ ~~4-______ -4$ __ ~4~~~~::~~4-______ ~~~3~'3~2~.OO~ ________ ~~'~~~s~.~~ ________ ~~'~15~2.~724-------~~~3~~~0~ .• ~.~------~~'~3~~~.~~ ________ ~~3~9~~.~.0,1 

Promot Pov Disc S 
Ref. ee 3,612.18 S 4,535.35 4,33.30 4,52.2 3,740.88 ,352.46 3,946.80 

4 Dow-AroGalle 75DFPre·emerenll·lb.c( 48 SOO.60 24028.80 S 572.32 27471.36 S 472.00 22656.00 S 140.00 26880.00 S 544.00_$ 26112.00 S 542.80 S 26054.40 S 151.10 29011.20 S 496.00 23808.00 
Price per case of 4 x I-lb. containers 7.25% sales tax 1.742.09 1.991.67 1,642.56 unO price per 1,948.80 S 1,893.12 S 1.888.94 unit price per 2,103.31 1,726.08 

~~~~ ______ ~~2SW7~ro~'.~.+-______ ~-22:~.!~~~~:~~:+-______ -}~2~'~2'~ •. ~OO42'~lb~.b~~~I.~~~2~.~'~~~ .• ~O~------~:-2~~~~.1~2+_-------}'~2~7~94~3.~M42'~lb~.b~~~~~~~~3'~1~14~.5~1+_ __ ----~~~~5~M~.O~·4I 

Prompt Pay Disc $ . : 
Rer.Price 25 0.89 2 ,989.88 24,298.56 28,828.80 28, .12 27943.34 31114. 1 25 34.08 

5 S enlaBanicade 65WG 100lb.conlainer 25 209.00 5225.00 S 112.00 5600.00 $ 230.00 5750.00 $ 116.n 2919.25 261.00 6,525.00 S 235.54 5888.50 S 226.00 5700.00 
Price per 10-1b. conlainer 7.25% sales tax 378.81 $ubslitule" 406.00 416.88 Subsltlule" 211.65 473.06 428.92 S 413.25 

~~~ ______ _f~5~6~O~3 .• ~1+_------_f--~6~~:~:OO~30H--------1--~6~1.~.~ .•• ~ ____ ~~~~3~1~~~.~~--------f-~6.~~~.OO~--------~~6~31~5~ .. 2~------~.~--~_t--______ f-~.~11~3.~25~ 

Promot Pay Olsc : 
Re'. Price 5,603.81 5705.70 6,166.68 3,130.90 6,998.06 6,315.42 No Bid 6,113.25 

6 DowA roSn shol 2.5TGPre·emer ent.50- 40 93.25 S 3730.00 S 125.928 5037.12 $ 84.50 $ 3380.00 88.81 $ 3552.40 93.50 3740.00 $ 87.56 $ 3502.40 117.50 S 4,700.00 $ 89.00 3,560.00 
Price par 50-lb. sack 7.25% sales tax 270.43 365,19 S 245.05 S 257.55 271.15 S 253.92 :. 340.75 258.10 

:~~ ______ ~~'~.0~OO~.'~3+_-------f--~S;~~~~:3~,~+--------1:_,~3~.2e5~.05~ ______ ~.;~~3~ .• ~0'~.'~5+-------_f--~4.0~1~1.~15~------_1·:~~3~.7$~.~~------~.~~5~~~0~.7~5t--------1--~3~.'~'.~10'1 

7 BEST Dimension 270G Pre-arner enl 50-lb. s, 
Priceper50.lb.sack 

PromtPayDisc S S $ S 
Ref. Price 4,000.43 5132.20 $ 3,62 .0$ $ 3,809.9 4,011.1 S 3,756.32 5.040.75 3,616.10 

40 38.00 1520.00 S 4369 1747.60 S 39.25 1570.00 S 36.46 1458.40 $ 39.75 1590.00 S 38.46 1538.40 S 34.00 1360.00 S 37.97 1,518.80 
7.25%salesta.ll 110.20 12670 113.83 S 105.73 115.28 111.53 98.60 110.11 

1,705.28 

:~~~ __ ~ __ -t __ '~6~30~.2~0+-______ -f __ ~1'.~~~3'~~2+-------~--~1~6.~3.~.3~ ______ ~$$.~~1~OO~'~.'~3+--------t--h17~0~5'~~--------1-~1~64~9~.W~--____ ~r-_'~.~5.~.6~0t-------_t--~16~2~ •. ~9'11 

Prom tPavDlsc 
Rer, Pnce 1,630.20 1.780. 9 1.683.83 $ 1,564.13 1,628.91 1,649.93 1,458.60 

Bid No. 10117 _ Herbicides. Fertilizers and Grass Seed 
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Bid No. 10117 
Title: Herbicides, Fertilizers & Grass Seeds 
Close Date: October 7, 2011 

. Buyer Name: Bob Blgnev 
Phone: 630-889 .... 255 
Estimated Award Date: Januarv 10 2012 

S Remed Herbicide. 1- allon container 
Price per 1·gal. comainer 

Bidder Crop PrOduct on Services 
Address PO Box 1954 

City/State/Zip Greeley, CO 80632·1954 
Contact person scon P. Canfield 

Telephone 916-369-2891 
FAX Number 916·369·7046 

In'Joice Terms Nel60 days delivered 
Delive 2·3davs 

LVPCertified? 

Ewing 1n1li1allon 
3441 E. Harbour Or. 
Phoenix, AZ. 85034 
JenyKaylor 
916-652·9530 
916.652·9533 
NelJOdays 
1 week 

LVP Certified? 

COUNTY OF PLACER, AUBURN, CA 

Bid Evaluation Award Recommendation - Attachment A 

Helena Chemical Company 
3155 Southgate Lane 
Chico, CA 95928 
Paul Smith 
530-342-4786 
530-343-9047 
Nel30days 

2."" 
LVP Certified? 

John Deere Landscapes 
24110 Netwol1( PI 
ChIcago, IL 60673 
Kellh O. McGinty 
216·706·9250 
248-581-1433 
Nel30 
7-10 days ARO 

LVPCertified7 

Sle". Pactfic TUJ1' SUPPlY 
510 Salmar Ave. 
Campbell, CA 95008 
Craig Thomsen 
916-997-"278 
916-434-0607 
Nel30 
5davsARO 

LVP Certified? 

arget Specialty Products 
154155 Marquard! Ave. 
Santa Fe Springs, CA 90670 
PatriciaCrespan 
533-0816-1650 
916-374-0900 
Nel30 
3-1 dayS 

LVPeertified7 

Un var USA Inc. 
File No. 56019 
Los Angeles. CA 90074-6019 
JazminPhan 
916-371-3854 

Nel30 
Not Slated 

LVP Certified? 

WII ur.£lIis Company 
PO Bo)(45326 
San Francisco, CA 941.5-0326 
Scot! Johnson 
688-932·6486 
916-991-1837 

~:~~ d~r:ewer ARC 
LVP Certified? no 

10 64.95 6.9.50 S 164.00 656.00 $ 64.50 645.00 $ 81.50 815.00 S 90.50 905.00 S 84.-46 844.60 S 88.00 880.00 
7.25% sales lax 47.09 S\lbstllule" 47.56 46.76 $ 59.09 65.61 6123 6380 

~~~~ ______ ~ __ ~6~'6~.5~9+-______ ~--_7~~~::~~:~-------1~~69~1~.76~------~:~ __ ~-+ ________ +-__ 8~7~'.~094-__ ~~-1~~'7~0~.6~1~ ______ ~ __ 2'~05~.8~3+-______ ~--~ •• ~3.~80,1 

Prom I Pay Disc S 
Ref. rice 696.9 668.38 691.76 No Bid 87 •. 09 970.61 905.83 943.80 

9 XL2GPre-emer em Herbicide 50-lbsack 12 60.55 726.60 S 6U8 778.56 S "5.00' 540.00 S 51.50 618.00 $ 53.98 647.76 S 50.00 600.00 
Price per 50-lb. sack 7.25% sales tax 52.68 56.45 39.15 S 4481 46.96 $ 43.50 

10 SDeedzone Southern 1.Oa1. conlalner 
Price per I-gal. container 

11 A uarnasler 2.5- at container 
Price per 2.5-gal. conlainer 

:~~~ ______ ~ __ ~7~7'~2~8+-______ ~--_8~!~~:0~7;H--------1~~57~.~.15~------~:~ ___ ~-+ ________ +-~~~2.~814-______ -1~~6~~.72~ ______ ~:~ __ ~-+ ________ +-__ ~64~3.~SO'I 

Prom I Pay Disc S S 
Ref, 79.2 793.26 579.15 No I 662.81 694.72 No d 643.50 

40 51.90 2076.00 S 72.598 2903.92 S 56.50 2260.00 S 59.62 2384.80 S 58.35 2,33(.00 S 52.12 2084.80 S 54.50 2180.00 S 53.89 2.155.60 
7.25% sales tax 150.51 239.57 163.85 172.90 169.22 151.15 158.05 156.28 

~:~~ ______ ~ __ ~22~~~.S~1+-______ ~ __ ~3~~:~~:~~;~ ______ ~L-~2~'2~3~.8~S~ ______ ~~2~S~S7~.7~0+-______ ~ __ ~2~SO~3.~~4-______ ~~~2~2~3S~.~~ ____ ~ __ ~~2~3~38~.0~S+-______ ~ __ d2~31U1~.88~1 

PromDI Pay Disc 
.co 2,226.51 2,986.32 2,.23.65 2,57.70 2,503.22 2,23 .95 2,338.05 2.311.8 

40.625 325.00 $ 69.405 555.24 S 46.26 370.08 S 52.19 .17.52 S 68.50 5-48.00 $ 48.00 384.00 S 47.50 380.00 
7.25% sales lax 23.56 .0.25 26.83 Subshlute ,. 30.27 39.73 27.84 $ 27.55 

:~:~ ______ ~ __ ~3~'8~.S~'+-______ ~--~~~~:~j~~-------1~~3.~'~.9~1~------~ __ ~4~'7~.7~.+-______ ~--~S8~7.~734-------~~~4~11~.M~------~:~--~-+--------7-__ ~40~7.~55~1 

Promn! PAV DIsc S 
Ret'_ 8. 565.72 396 1 447.79 587.73 411.8-4 No Bid 407.55 

12 Gar10n 4 Ultra Herbicide 2.5- a!. container 12 194.125 2329.50 S 16".00 1968.00 S 207.50 2490.00 S 269 .• 2 3233.04 S 255.00 3,060.00 $ 209 50 2514.00 S 277.60 3331.20 S 235,00 2820.00 
Price per 2.5-gal. container 7.25% sales tax 168.89 Subshhr!e ., 142.68 lBO.53 234.40 221.85 182.27 2.'.51 204.45 

promm~v1~~l'--------+--&24~'~8.~394-------~~d2+~~~~~:=~------~~~2~'~70~.5~3}-______ -} __ ~3'~.~7.~~ ________ ~-23~28~1~.85~ ________ ~~2~6~OO~.2~7}-______ -} __ ~3S~7b2.7U14-____ ~~~23~~~'~.4~S 

Ref.Pltce 2.98.39 2. 5.1 2,670.53 3.4 7.« 3,281.85 2,695.27 3.72. 1 3,024.45 

13 FoamFj hlerOefoamln A enl,1- t.con1aine! 10 12.90 129.00 $ 9.72 S 97.20 S 9.15 91.50 S 12.27 122.70 S 10.50 105.00 S 56.00 560.00 
Pricer per 1-qt. contaIner 725% sales tax 9.35 SlIhshtlile" S 7.05 6.63 Substitute" 8.90: 7.61 S 40.60 

prommp~~~'~------~---E'3~8.~35~------~:--~'~~5~~~4-------~~--~.8U.'~3~ ______ ~ ___ 1~3~1.6~0+-______ ~: ____ ~~ ______ ~~~1~12~~~1}-______ ~: ____ ~+-~ ____ -1~~6°O~ .• 0~1 

Ret'.P ce 138.35 S· 99.03 98.13 131.60 No Bid 112.61 o Bid 

14 19-.·4 Nitra Kin Fertillzef 200 16.75 3350.00 S 18.957 3791.440 $ 19.20 3840.00 S 16.32 S 3264.00 S 17.50 3,500.00 S 18.20 3640.00 S 17.50 $ 3500.00 $ 17.50 3500.00 
Priceper50·lb. sack 7.25% sales lax 242.88 27 •. 88 27840 S 236.64 253.75 263.90 253.75 253.75 

::'~ ______ ~ __ 3~.S~9"2.8,!!!8+-_____ ~ __ ~4~~~~:~;~4-______ ~L-~'.J.1l!18~.4!!.0~ _______ $~~3~.S!!!00!C'.'~4+-______ ~ __ ~3.J;.7S,"3 . .!!754-______ ~~-,3", .• ",03"."-0~ ______ ~~3".7",-S3~.7",5+-______ -1 __ -"-3 . .!.'7S,,,3,,,.7S'-l 

PrornotPe Disc : 
Ref.Pl1ce 3,592.88 3,862.96 4,118 .• 0 3,500.64 3.753.75 3.90390 3,53.75 3.753.75 

Bid No. 10117 - Herbicides, Fertilizers and Grass Seed 

Page 2 014 
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Bid Evaluation Award Recommendation· Attachment A 

Bid No. 10117 Herbicides, Fertilizers and Grass Seed 



I) 

Bid No. 10117 
Title: Herbicides, Fer1i11zers & Grass Seeds 
Close Date: October 7, 2011 
Buyer Name: Bob Bigney 
Phone: 530·889-4255 
EsHmated Award Date: Januarv 10 2012 

Bidder Crop reduction Servlells 
Address PO Box 1954 . 

City/stale/Zip Greeley. CO 80632,1954 
Contact person Scan P. Canfield 

Tl!!lephone 916·369·2891 
FAX Number 916-369-7046 

Invoice Terms Nel 60 days delivered 
Delive 2·3 days 

lVPCertined? 

Ewing Imgltlon 
3441 e. Harbour Dr. 
Phoenix, /4Z. 85034 
JenyKaylor 
916·652·9530 
916-652-9533 
Nel 30 days 
1 week 

LVPCertlfied? 

COUNTY OF PLACER, AUBURN, CA 

Bid Evaluation Award Recommendation - Attachment A 

Helena Chemical Company 
3155 Sou!hgate Lane 
Chico. CA 95928 
Paul Smith 
530-342-4786 
530-343-9047 
Net 30 days 
2 days 

LVP Certified? 

John Deere l.a~uscape5 
24110 Network PI 
Chicago, IL 60673 
Keith O. McGinty 
216·706·9250 
246-581·1433 
Nel30 
7·10 da~.ARO 

LVPCertlfied? 

~~rTa Pac nc Turf Supply 
510 Salmar Ave. 
Campbell, CA 95008 
Cnlig Thornsen 
916·997·4278 
916·434·0607 
Nel3D 
5 • ..,ARO 

LVP Certified? 

Target Specialty Proaucts 
154155. Marquardt Ave 
Santa Fe Springs, CA 90670 
PatJielaCrespan 
533-0816-1650 
916·374·0900 
Net 30 
3-7dm 

LVP Certified? 

Unlvar USA Inc. 
File No. 56019 
los Angeles, CA 90074·6019 
JazmlnPhan 
916·371·3854 

Nel30 
NolSiated 

LVP Certified? 

WUbur-l:lIIs Company 
PO Box 45326 
San Frantlseo. CA 94145·0326 
Scot! Johnson 
886-932·6486 
916-991·1837 
Net 30 days 
10 days Of fewer ARO 

LVPCertlfied? 

22 2% Zinc Phos hide Bail S()'lb. sack 
Prieeper50.lb. sack 

3s1.SO 1406.00 $ 75.00 300.00 69.50 278.00 $ 74.68 299.52 S 72.50 290.00 $ 71.00 284.00 
7.25% sales tax 101.94 S 21.75 20.16 21.72 21.03 20.59 

~~:r-__ ~ __ -f __ '~5~~~.9~'t-______ _f:----~~------~--~32~1~.75~------~~--~-t----____ f-~2~9~'.~16~------~~~32~1=.24~------~~~3~11~.O~3t_------_f--~3~~.~59~1 

Promlll Pav Qise $ 
Ref. Price 1,507.94 No Bid 321.75 a id 29B.16 321.24 311.03 

DIscount not used In evaluatIOn If less than 10 days per 
• Purchasing Policy Manual Section 3.12(b) . 

•• Per the bid. substItutes are not allowed for Ihese line Items 

Bid No. 10117 Herbicides. Fertilizers and Grass Seed 
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Rank 
1 
2 
3 
4 
5 
6 
7 
8 

Rank 
1 
2 
3 
4 
5 
6 
7 

Rank 
1 
2 
3 
4 
5 

Rank 
1 
2 
3 
4 
5 
6 
7 
8 

Rankings and Recommended Awards - Attachment A 
Bid No. 10117 

Herbicides, Fertilizers and Grass Seed 
(This is not an order) 

Line Item No.1 
Monsanto Round-Ue Pro Concentrate, 30-gal 

Reference 
Bidder Price 

Crop Production Services $ 12,693.04 
Helena Chemical Company $ 13,030.88 
Wilbur-Ellis Company $ 14,478.75 
Target Specialty Products $ 16,827.53 
Sierra Pacific Turf Supply $ 17,664.08 
John Deere Landscapes $ 19,305.00 
Univar USA Inc. $ 23,416.97 
Ewing Irrigation $ 40,331.40 

Line Item No.3 
Surflan AS, 2.5-gal 

Reference 
Bidder Price 

Helena Chemical Company $ 3,432.00 
Crop Production Services $ 3,612.18 
Target Specialty Products $ 3,740.88 
Wilbur-Ellis Company $ 3,946.80 
Sierra Pacific Turf Supply $ 4,152.72 
John Deere Landscapes $ 4,335.30 
Univar USA Inc. $ 4,352.46 

Line Item No.5 

RANKINGS BY PRODUCT 

Rank 
1 
2 
3 
4 
5 
6 
7 
8 

Rank 
1 
2 
3 
4 
5 
6 
7 
8 

Line Item No.2 
Monsanto Round-Ue ProMax, 1.67-gal 

Bidder 
Crop Production Services 
Helena Chemical Company 
John Deere Landscapes 
Wilbur-Ellis Company 
Target Specialty Products 
Sierra Pacific Turf Supply 
Univar USA Inc. 
Ewing Irrigation 

Reference 
Price 

$ 2,820.94 
$ 2,865.72 
$ 2,928.46 
$ 2,955.27 
$ 3,217.50 
$ 3,249.68 
$ 3,507.61 
$ 3,910.19 

Line Item No.4 
Dow-Agro Gallef\! 75 DF Pre-emergent 1-lb. 

Bidder 
Helena Chemical Company 
Wilbur-Ellis Company 
Crop Production Services 
Target Specialty Products 
Ewing Irrigation 
Sierra Pacific Turf Supply 
John Deere Landscapes 
Univar USA Inc. 

Reference 
Price 

$ 24,298.56 
$ 25,534.08 
$ 25,770.89 
$ 27,943:34 
$ 27,989.88 
$ 28,005.12 

.$ 28,828.80 
$ 31,114.51 

Line Item No.6 

Page 1 of 3 

Sllngenta Barricade, 65 WG, 10-lb. Dow-Agro Snaeshot, 2.5 TG Pre-emergent 50-lb. 

Reference Reference 
Bidder Price Rank Bidder Price 

Crop Production Services $ 5,603.81 1 Helena Chemical Company $ 3,625.05 
Wilbur-Ellis Company $ 6,113.25 2 Target Specialty Services $ 3,756.32 
Helena Chemical Company $ 6,166.88 3 John Deere Landscapes $ 3,809.95 
Target Specialty Products $ 6,315.42 4 Wilbur-Ellis Company $ 3,818.10 
Sierra Pacific Turf Supply $ 6,998.06 5 Crop Production Services $ 4,000.43 

6 Sierra Pacific Turf Supply $ 4,011.15 
7 Univar USA Inc. $ 5,040.75 
8 Ewing Irrigation $ 5,132.20 

Line Item No.7 Line Item No.8 
Best Dimension 270G Pre-emergent, 50-lb. Remedll Herbicide, 1-gal. 

Reference Reference 
Bidder Price Rank Bidder Price 

Univar USA Inc. $ 1,458.60 1 Helena Chemical Company $ 691.76 
John Deere Landscapes $ 1,564.13 2 Crop Production Services $ 696.59 
Wilbur-Ellis Company $ 1,628.91 3 Sierra Pacific Turf Supply $ 874.09 
Crop Production Services $ 1,630.20 4 Univar USA Inc. $ 905.83 
Target Specialty Products $ 1,649.93 5 Wilbur-Ellis Company $ 943.80 
Helena Chemical Company $ 1,683.83 6 Target Specialty Products $ 970.61 
Sierra Pacific Turf Supply $ 1,705.28 
Ewing Irrigation $ 1,780.59 

Bid No. 10117 - Herbicides, Fertilizers and Grass Seed 
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Rank 
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Rankings and Recommended Awards - Attachment A 
Bid No. 10117 

Herbicides, Fertilizers and Grass Seed 
(This is not an order) 

Line Item No.9 
XL 2G Pre-emergent Herbicide. 50-lb. 

Bidder 
Helena Chemical Company 
Wilbur-Ellis Company 
Sierra Pacific Turf Supply 
Target Specialty Products 
Crop Production Services 
Ewing Irrigation 

Reference 
Price 

$ 579.15 
$ 643.50 
$ 662.81 
$ 694.72 
$ 779.28 
$ 793.26 

Line Item No. 11 
Aquamaster, 2.5-gal. 

Bidder 
Crop Production Services 

. Helena Chemical Company 
Wilbur-Ellis Company 
Target Specialty Products 
Ewing Irrigation 
Sierra Pacific Turf Supply 

Reference 
Price 

$ 348.56 
$ 396.91 
$ 407.55 
$ 411.84 
$ 565.72 
$ 587.73 

Line Item No. 13 
Foam Fighter Defoaming Agent. 1~gl 

Bidder 
Helena Chemical Company 
Target Specialty Products 
Crop Production Services 
Wilbur-Ellis Company 

Reference 
Price 

$ 98.13 
$ 112.61 
$ 138.35 
$600.60 

Line Item No. 15 

Rank 
1 
2 
3 
4 
5 
6 
7 
8 

Rank 
1 
2 
3 
4 
5 
6 
7 

Rank' 
1 
2 
3 
3 
3 
6 
7 
8 

Line Item No. 10 
Seeedzone Southern, 1-gal. 

Reference 
Bidder Price 

Crop Production Services $ 2,226.51 
Target Specialty Products $ 2,235.95 
Wilbur-Ellis Company $ 2,311.88 
Univar USA Inc. $ 2,338.05 
Helena Chemical Company $ 2,423.85 
Sierra Pacific Turf Supply $ 2,503.22 
John Deere Landscapes $ 2,557.70 
Ewing Irrigation $ 2,986.32 

Line Item No. 12 
Garlon 4 Ultra Herbicide, 2.5-gal. 

Reference 
Bidder Price 

Crop Production Services $ 2,498.39 
Helena Chemical Company $ 2,670.53 
Target Specialty Products $ 2,696.27 
Wilbur-Ellis Company $ 3,024.45 
Sierra Pacific Turf Supply $ 3,281.85 
John Deere Landscapes $ 3,467.44 
Univar USA Inc. $ 3,572.71 

Line Item No .. 14 
19-4-4 Nitra King Fertilizer 

Reference 
Bidder Price 

John Deere Landscapes $ 3,500.64 
Crop Production Services $ 3,592.88 
Sierra Pacific Turf Supply $ 3,753.75 . 
Univar USA Inc. $ 3,753.75 
Wilbur-Ellis Company $ 3,753.75 
Ewing Irrigation $ 3,862~96 
Target Specialty Products $ 3,903.90 
Helena Chemical Company $ 4,118.40 

Line Item No. 16 
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Best One Shot Turf Fertilizer, 50-lb. Grass Seed, 90% Kentucky Blue,10%Perennial, 10-lb. 

Bidder 
John Deere Landscapes 
Wilbur-Ellis Company 
Crop Production Services 
Sierra Pacific Turf Supply 
Helena Chemical Company 
Target Specialty Products 
Ewing Irrigation 

$ 
$ 
$ 
$ 
$ 
$ 
$ 

Reference 
Price 

6,127.84 
6,294.29 
6,306.30 
6,435.00 
6,606.60 
6,803.94 
7,527.61 

Line Item No. 17 
Grass Seed. 90% Kentucky Blue. 10% Perennial, 25-lb. 

Bidder 
Wilbur-Ellis Company 
Ewing Irrigation 
Target Specialty Products 

Reference 
Price 

$ 325.29 
$ 635.27 
$ 723.94 

Rank 

1 
2 

Rank 
1 
2 
3 

Bidder 
Wilbur-Ellis Company 
Target Specialty Products 

$ 
$ 

Reference 
Price 

353.93 
787.75 

Line Item No. 18 
Grass Seed, 90% Kentucky Blue, 10% Perennial, 50-lb. 

Bidder 
Wilbur-Ellis Company 
Ewing Irrigation 
Target Specialty Products 

Reference 
Price 

$ 305.93 
$ 656.91 
$ 700.73 

Bid No. 10117 - Herbicides, Fertilizers and Grass Seed 



Rankings and Recommended Awards - Attachment A 
Bid No. 10117 

Line Item No. 19 

Herbicides, Fertilizers and Grass Seed 
. (This is not an order) 

Line Item No. 20 
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Grass Seed. 50% Perennial Rye. 25% Kentucky. 25% Tall Fescue.10·lb. Grass Seed. 50% Perennial Rye. 25% Kentucky. 25% Tall Fescue. 25·lb. 

Rank 
1 
2 

Bidder 
Wilbur-Ellis Company 
Target Specialty Products 

Reference 
Price 

$ 318.00 
$ 586.66 

Line Item No. 21 
Grass Seed. 50% Perennial Rye. 25% Kentucky. 25% Tall Fescue. 50-lb. 

Rank 
1 
2 
3 

Bidder 
Wilbur-Ellis Company 
Target Specialty Products 
Ewing Irrigation 

Reference 
Price 

$ 271.56 
$ ,439.08 
$ 700.48 

Rank 
1 
2 

Rank 
1 
2 
3 
4 
5 
6 

Bidder 
Wilbur-Ellis Company 
Target Specialty Products 

Reference 
Price 

$ 278.85 
$ 492.06 

Line Item No. 22 
2% Zinc Phosphide Bait 50-lb. 

Bidder 
Sierra Pacific Turf Supply 
Wilbur-Ellis Company 
Univar USA Inc. 
Target Specialty Products 
Helena Chemical Company 
Crop Production Services 

Reference 
Price 

$ 298.16 
$ 304.59 
$ 311.03 
$ 321.24 
$ 321.75 
$ 1,507.94 

RECOMMENDED SLANKET PURCHASE ORDER (SPO) AWARDS 

Recommended 
Recommended Award Recommended 

Award Facility Svcs .. Award 
Line # Description Bidder FacilifJ! Svcs. (Roundedl Public Works 

1 Monsanto Round-Up Pro Concentrate Crop Production Services $ 5,986.54 $ 6,706.50 
2 Monsanto Round-Up ProMax Crop Production Services $ 2,820.94 
5 Syngenta Barricade, 65 WG Crop Production Services $ 5,603.81 
10 Speedzone Southern Crop Production Services $ 2,226.51 
11 Aquamaster Crop Production Services $ 348.56 
12 Garlon 4 Ultra Herbicide Crop Production Services $ 1,249.19 $ 1,24'9.20 

Crop Production Services $ 18,235.55 $ 18,000.00 $ 7,955.70 

3 Surflan AS Helena Chemical Company $ 3,432.00 
4 Dow-Agro Gallery 75 DF Pre-emergent Helena Chemical Company $ 24,298.56 
6 Dow-Agro Snapshot 2.5 TG Pre-emergent Helena Chemical Company $ 3,625.05 
8 Remedy Herbicide Helena Chemical Company $ 691.76 
9 XL 2G Pre-emergent Helena Chemical Company $ 579.15 
13 Foam Fighter Defoaming Agent Helena Chemical Company $ 98.13 

Helena Chemical Company $ 32,724.65 $ 33,000.00 

7 Best Dimension 270G Pre-emergent John Deere Landscapes * $ 1,564.13 
14 19-4-4 Nitra King Fertilizer John Deere Landscapes $ 3,500.64 
15 Best One Shot Turf Fertilizer John Deere Landscapes $ 6,127.84 

John Deere Landscapes $ 11,192.61 $ 11,000.00 

16 Grass Seed, 90% Blue, 10% Rye, 10 Ib Wilbur-Ellis Company $ 353.93 
17 Grass Seed, 90% Blue, 10% Rye, 251b Wilbur-Ellis Company $ 325.29 
18 Grass Seed, 90% Blue, 10% Rye, 50 Ib Wilbur-Ellis Company $ 305.93 
19 G.S., 50% Rye, 25% Blue, 25% Fescue, 10 Ib Wilbur-Ellis Company $ 318.00 
20 G.S., 50% Rye, 25% Blue, 25% Fescue, 25 Ib Wilbur-Ellis Company $ 278.85 
21 G.S., 50% Rye, 25% Blue, 25% Fescue, 50 Ib Wilbur-Ellis Company $ 271.56 
22 2% Zinc Phosphide Bait Wilbur-Ellis Company ** $ 304.59 

Wilbur·Ellis Company $ 2,158.15 $ 3,000.00 

Total Recommended BPO Awards: Facility Services $ 65,000.00 DPW 

Recommended 
Award 

Public Works 
(Rounded! 

$ 10,000;00 **** 

$ 10,000.00 

* Considering the County's cost to issue and maintain blanket purchase orders (BPO), Procurement recommends awarding Line Item 7 to John Deere 
Landscapes, the next lowest bidder for Line Item 7. An award to Univar, the lowest bidder for Line Item 7, will result in a BPO in the approximate amount 
of $1 ,458.60 

** Considering the County's cost to issue and maintain blanket purchase orders (BPO), Procurement recommends awarding Line Item 22 to Wilbur-Ellis 
Company, the next lowest bidder for Line Item 22. An award to Sierra Pacific Turf Supply, the lowest bidder for Line Item 22, will result in a BPO in the 
approximate amount of $298.16. 

*** Rounded to $3,000 due to Wilbur-Ellis's minimum order quantities for grass seed. 

**** Rounded to $10,000 per DPW's request. 

Bid No.1 0117 - Herbicides, Fertilizers and Grass Seed 



MEMORANDUM 

DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 
County of Placer 

TO: Honorable Board of Supervisors 

FROM: Ken Grehm, Director 

DATE: January 10, 2012 

SUBJECT: Fiscal Impact Statement 

Sufficient funding is in the FY2011/2012 Budget to cover the Crop Production Services 
herbicide BPO for the Road Maintenance department. 

031 



FISCAL IMPACT STATEMENT 

TO: Honorable Board of Supervisors 

FROM: Valerie Bayne, Administrative Services Manager 

DATE: January 10, 2012 

SUBJECT: Fiscal Impact Statement 
Placer County Herbicides and Fertilizer Service 

The Department of Facility Services requires an annual blanket purchase order for herbicides and fertilizers on 
an as-needed basis throughout Placer County. The department utilizes this BPO to provide the most commonly 
purchased herbicides and fertilizers for the Parks & Grounds Division and to acquire the necessary Material 
Safety Data Sheets for use of these products. The Department has budgeted appropriately for these services 
for FY11/12. 
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