
MEMORANDUM 
COUNTY OF PLACER 
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES 
PROCUREMENT SERVICES DIVISION 

TO: Honorable Board of Supervisors 

FROM: Brett Wood, Purchasing Manager 

DATE: March 27, 2012 

SUBJECT: Approve the Award of Competitive Bid No. 10145 to LN Curtis & Sons and Allstar 
Fire Equipment for Firefighting Equipment and Supplies in the Total Aggregate 
Amount of $130,000.00 

ACTION REQUESTED 

Approve the award of Competitive Bid No. 10145 to LN Curtis & Sons of Oakland, CA, and 
Allstar Fire Equipment of Arcadia, CA, for firefighting equipment and supplies in the total 
aggregate amount of $130,000.00., and authorize the Purchasing Manager to sign the resulting 
Blanket Purchase Orders (BPOs) and to transfer funds between the BPOs as necessary to meet 
the County's needs. 

BACKGROUND 

The Placer County Fire Department (PCFD) requires annual BPOs for the purchase of firefighting 
equipment and supplies on an as-needed basis. It was determined that a new competitive bid be 
solicited to consolidate the number of BPOs and to update the department's firefighting 
equipment and supplies requirements. 

The Procurement Services Division solicited competitive bids for firefighting equipment and 
supplies on behalf of PCFD. Sixty-four bidders were notified electronically of Invitation for Bid 
(IFB) No. 10145 which was also posted on the County's website. A total of seven bids were 
received. The bids were evaluated in accordance with the terms and conditions of the IFB. LN 
Curtis & Sons submitted the lowest responsive bid for Bid Packages 1, 2, and 4 and Allstar Fire 
Equipment submitted the lowest responsive bid for Bid Package 3. A complete bid evaluation is 
submitted as Attachment A. 

FISCAL IMPACT 

Upon your Board's approval, BPOs will be awarded to LN Curtis & Sons in the total amount of 
$56,500.00. and Allstar Fire Equipment in the total amount of $73,500.00.. The new BPOs will be 
effective for the period of April 1, 2012, through March 31, 2013. PCFD's Fiscal Impact 
Statement is attached (refer to Attachment B). 

Attachments: A -IFB 10.145 Recommended Award and Bid Evaluation Spreadsheet 
B - Placer County Fire Department's Fiscal Impact Statement 

cc: Kim Davis, CEO Administration Senior Account Auditor 
Scott Lindgren, Placer County Fire Division Chief-South Operations 



Attachment A 

AWARD RECOMMENDATION 
Line Items Bidder's % of Recommended BPO 

Bidder Bid Package Ref. Price Per Bid Package Total Bid Line Items Award Amounts (Rounded) 

LN Curtis & Sons 1 $ 2,431.36 5 
2 $ 26,208.15 17 
4 $ 1,515.44 18 

$ 30,154.95 40 43% $ 56,500.00 

AI/star Fire Equipment 3 $ 25,435.95 52 57% $ 73,500.00 

Totals: $ 55,590.89 92 100% $ 130,000.00 
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Bid No. 
Title: 
Due Date: 

10145 
Firefighting Equipment & Supplies 
1/27112 @ 2:30 PM (Pacific) 

Name of Firm 

City/State 

Telephone 

Fax Number 

Estimated Delivery Time 

COUNTY OF PLACER, AUBURN, CA 

BID EVALUA TlON 

Buyer Name: 
Phone: 
Estimated Award Date: 

Curtis & Sons 
I . CA 

510·839·5111 x3326 

510·839·5325 

15-30 Days ARO 

800·625·5679 

916·861·0310 

14 Days ARO 

LVP Certified? (1i No 

Invoice Terms ;2) Net 30 

Item 

Package 1 - Flashlights 
MAG-UTE LED 3 D-Gell Power. 3 Walt. Red 
MAG· LITE 3~-Cell Power with MAG-NUM Star 
Bright Star Responder RA Reqhargeable #500222 

Pelican 3750PL Big Ed Rechargeable 
Photoluminescent 4 C-Cel! Power 

Ii Litebox Standard #45111,20 Watt Spot 
Si-Pin Bulb 

Package 2 - Various Tools and Equipment 
Porter 0290MCX Heavy Duty Boll Cutters 

Mechanical 20050, 36" Squeegee W/Handle 
Brass 448 Aluminum Dual Wrench Holder with 

Shovel Designed for Fire-Fighting 
Designed for Fire-Fighting 

Tool Designed for Fire-Fighting 

147.50 
79.50 

116.00 

719.60 

No Bid 

173.00 
97.20 
32.00 
37.00 

1998.00 

57.50 39.95 
49.50 35.25 
56.00 49.10 

Jon Manning 
530·889·4290 
3/27/12 

701121, Refuse Bag, 16x18x17.5 29.00 No Bid . 

Turtle PlastICS Lincoln Log Crib. 4" x 4" x 18" 
Turtle Plastics Lincoln Log Crib, 2" x 4" x 18" 
Turtle Plastics Lincoln Log Crib - Standard Wedge. 
4" x 4" x 20" 

Package 3 ~ Rope Rescue Equipment 
12.5mm (1/2 in.) CMC Lifeline Rescue Rope, CMC 
#273210 - Orange (per foot) 

12.5mm (lf2 in.) CMC Lifeline Rescue Rope, CMC 
#273210 - Orange (per spool) 

12.5mm (1/2 in.) CMC Lifeline Rescue Rope. CMC 
#273220 - Blue (per foot) 

12.5mm (1/2 in.) CMC lifeline Rescl!e Rope. CMC 
#273220 - Blue (per spool) 

12.5mm (1/2 in.) CMC Lifeline Rescue Rope. CMC 
#273230 - Red (per foot) 

J. Manning 

26.50 
13.00 

0.95 

1.900.00 

0.95 

1,900.00 

0.95 

25.67 
12.34 

0.95 

1.840.00 

0.95 

1.840.00 1.840.00 

0.95 190.00 

Allstar Fire Equipment 

Arcadia, CA 

28 Days ARO 

No 

Net 30 

160.00 
85.00 

65.00 

385.00 

100.00 

195.00 
105.00 

0.83 

1.760.0'J 

0.83 

1,760.0) 

083 

176.00 

1.760.00 

176.00 

1. 

Municipal Emergency Services lure·""" ... 
Chicago, IL 

0.99 0.99 

1.980.00 1,980.00 

0.99 0.99 

1.980.00 1.980.00 

0.99 . 0.99 

198.00 

1.980.00 

198.00 

1. 

AHS Rescue & Arizona Hiking 
Shack 
Phoenix, AZ 

30 Days ARO 

. No 

Net 30 

1.02 

2.040.00 

1.02 

2.040.00 

1.02 

Attachment A 

Dive Rescue International 
Fort Collins, CO 

Page 2 of 4 



Bid No. 
Title: 
Due Date: 

10145 
Firefighting Equipment & Supplies 
1/27112 @2:30 PM (Pacific) 

Name of Firm 

CityfState 

Telephone 

Fax Number 

Estimated Delivery Time 

COUNTY OF PLACER, AUBURN, CA 

BID EVALUATION 

Buyer Name: 
Phone: 
Estimated Award Date: 

LN Curtis & Sons 

Oakland, CA 

510-839-5111 x3326 

510·839·5325 

15-30 Days ARO 

Mallory Fire 
Longview, WA 

800-625·5679 

916-861-0310 

14 Days ARO 

Jon Manntng 
530-889-4290 
3/27112 

LVP Certified? [1; No No 

Net 30 Invoice Terms 12) Net 30 

Item 

No. Hem Desert Hon 

Package 3 4 Rope Rescue Equipment (Continued) 

3.6 ~~753~~ ~1~e~'lp~~s~oL~!~line Rescue Rope, CMC 

3.7 ~~753~~ ~1~~~~ (~~r~o~:~line Rescue Rope, CMC 

3.B ;;753~~ ~1~~~~ (~~rCs~~f:l~ine Rescue Rope, CMC 

3.9 ;;753~~0 ~1~e:~~ ~~e~ f~!~;ine Rescue Rope, CMC 

3.1 0 ~~753~~O ~1~e:~~~ ~~e~ ;~~e~il~e Rescue Rope, CMC 

3 11 ~P:~f::~sefies Escape Line, CMC #292017 - Tan 

3.12 ~;~s:~~~eries Escape Line, CMC #292017 - Tan 

3.13 ~~~ ~ ~:~!~~ ~~:~~~ ~;hU~~n~ain Line Chicago 

3.14 Large Drop Bag with 100 ft. of 3/8" Kevlar Rope 
3.15 Personal Search Bag wilh 20 ft. of Kevlar Webbing 

Qt 

200 

200 

200 

3.16 Bmm Prusik Cord, CMC #293018 - Green (per foot) 200 
3.17 Bmm Prusik Cord, CMC #293018 - Green (per spool) 1 
3.18 8mm Prusik Cord, CMC #293038 - Red (per foot) 200 
3.19 8mm Prusik Cord, CMC #293038 - Red (per spool) 1 

3.20 ~'r~~~:~;e~~~~~ebbing, Nylon, CMC #200111 - 200 

3.21 ~~~~~:7~e~~a~o~~bbing, Nylon, CMC #200111 -

3.22 ~'~~I~~~;~r~~a~t~ebbing, Nylon, CMC #200117-

323 1" (25mm) Flat Webbing, Nylon, CMC #200117-
. Yellow (per spool) 

3.24 1H (25mm) Flat Webbing, Nylon, Blue (per yard) 
3.25 1" (25mm) Flat Webbing, Nylon, Blue (per spool) 
3.26 1" (2smm) Flat Webbing, Nylon, Green (per yard) 
3.27 1" (25mm) F!at Webbing, Nylon, Green (per spool) 

12.5mm (1/2 in.) New England KMIII General Use 

200 

70 
1 

70 

3.28 Static Kernmantle Rescue Rope. Safety Green/Blue 200 
(per foot) 

12.5rhm (1/2 in.) New England KMIII General Use 
3.29 Static KernmanUe Rescue Rope, Safety GreenlBlue 

(per spool) 

3.30 Pick-Off Strap, 54 in. Extended Length, Blue 
3.31 Load Release Strap, 32 in. Extended Length, Blue 

332 1/2 in. Steel ~tandard 0 Style 5 NFPA Gold Screw- 10 
. lock Side Swmg Gate Carabiner 

3.33 ~~~~~i:t:~~~~~num Key:Lock 0 Carabiner. Screw- 10 

3.34 Pn.JSeries Pulley, Single. Blue 
3.35 ProSeries Pulley, Single, Red 
3.36 ProSeries Pulley, Double. Gold 

.37 Anchor Plate, Stainless Steel 10 
3.38 Anchor Plate, Aluminurn, Blue 10 
3.39 Steel 0 Ring 10 

.40 Petzl Rescucender 

J. Manning 

Unit Price 

1.900.00 

0.95 

.1.900.00 

0.95 

1.900.00 

155 

3.100.00 

610.00 

273.00 
8550 

0.47 
564.00 

0.47 
564.00 

0.39 

58.50 

0.39 

58.50 

. ·No'8id:' . 

. ''''~ ':~~,Bid:~;:_v' 
~~~·.:l~,:·:': 

0.98 

1.764.00 

31.00 
37.60 

NO'Sid 

21.95 

67.00 
84.00 
87.00 
42.00 
36.00 

8.50 
54.70 

Extension 

1,900.00 

190.00 

1.900.00 

190.00 

1.90000 

310.00 

3,100.00 

61000 

273.00 
342.00 

94.00 
564.00 

94.00 
564.00 

78.00 

58.50 

78.00 

58.50 

196.00 

1.764.00 

124.00 
150.40 

21950 

268.00 
336.00 
348.00 
42000 
360.00 

85.00 
218.80 

Unit Price 

1.840.00 

0.95 

1.840.00 

0.95 

1.840.00 

1.53 

2.960.00 

782.00 

No""Sld 
~u~.Bid 

0.48 
920.00 

0.48 
920.00 

0.37 

720.00 

0.37 

720.00 

1.27 . 

60.00 
1.27 

60.00 

0.98 

1.710.00 

31.28 
40.39 

22.93 

22.42 

68.39 
88.51 
92.53 
44.25 
38.62 

8.97 
57.01 

Extension 

1,840.00 

190.00 

1.840.00 

190.00 

t .840.00 

306.00 

2.960.00 

782.00 

9600 
920.00 

96.00 
920.00 

74.00 

720.00 

74.00 

720.00 

88.90 
60.00 
88.90 
60.00 

196.00 

1.710.00 

125.12 
161.56 

229.30 

224.20 

273.56 
354.04 
370.12 
442.50 
386.20 

89.70 
228.04 

Allstar Fire Equipment 

Arcadia, CA 

626·652-0900 

626·652·0920 

28 Days ARO 

No 

Net 30 

Unit Price 

1,760.00 

0.811 

1.760.00 

0.811 

1.760.00 

1.44 

2.880.00 

No Bid 

No Bid 
No Bid 

0.4'1 
528.00 

0.44 
528.00 

0.3!l 

52.50 

0.3!) 

52.50 

1.54 
73.21l 

1.54 
73.20 

0.9:2 

1.656.01l 

29.50 
37.80 

No Bid 

20.9:") 

64.2:5 
83.1"5 
86.90 
41.55 
36.25 

8.45 
54.05 

Extension 

1.760.00 

176.00 

1.760.00 

176.00 

1.760.00 

288.00 

2,880.00 

88.00 
528.00 

88.00 
528.00 

70.00 

52.50 

70.00 

52.50 

184.00 

1.656.00 

118.00 
151.20 

209.50 

257.00 
332.60 
347.60 
415.50 
362.50 

84.50 
216.20 

Municipal Emergency Services Life-Assist, Inc. 
Chicago, IL 

858·715·4639 

No 

Net 30 

Unit Price 

1.980.00 

0.99 

1,980.00 

0.99 

1.980.00 

1.69 

3,380.00 

515.00 

225.00 
78.00 

0.48 
576.00 

0.48 
576.00 

0.41 

61.50 

0.41 

61.50 

1.02 

1.836.00 

35.00 
45.00 

N·O.Bid·-

24.90 

76.40 
98.90 

103.25 
49.20 
43.00 

9.95 
46.40 

Extension 

1.980.00 

198.00 

1.980.00 

198.00 

1.980.00 

338.00 

96.00 
576.00 

82.00 

61.50 

82.00 

6150 

204.00 

1.836.00 

140.00 
180.00 

:., .~ 

249.00 

305.60 
395.60 
413.00 
492.00 
430.00 

99.50 
185.60 

Rancho Cordova. CA 

916·635·3822 

916·638·5131 

5-7 Days ARO 

No 

Net 30 

Unit Price 

1,980.00 

0.99 

1.980.00 

0.99 

1.980.00 

1.61 

0.39 

58.50 

0.39 

58.50 

1.03 

1.854.00 

32.96 
42.25 

--,.;'", ... -
: Ncd3id" 

23.40 

71.83 
92.95 
97.18 
46.48 
40.56 

9.36 
60.45 

Extension 

1,980.00 

198.00 

1.980.00 

198.00 

1,980.00 

322.00 

98.00 
588.00 

78.00 

58.50 

78.00 

58.50 

206.00 

1.854.00 

131.84 
169.00 

234.00 

287.32 
371.80 
388.72 
464.80 
405.60 

93.60 
241.80 

Attachment A 

AHS Rescue & Arizona Hiking 
Shack Dive Rescue International 
Phoenix, AZ Fort Collins, CO 

602·944· 7723 

602-861-0221 

30 Days ARO 

No 

Net 30 

Unit Price 

2.040.00 

1.02 

2.040.00 

1.02 

2.040.00 

1.66 

0.51 
612.00 

0.40 

60.00 

0.40 

60.00 

1.40 
66.28 

1.40 
66.28 

1.06 

1.908.00 

33.80 
43.34 

26.52 

24.00 

73.67 
9534 
99.67 
47.67 
41.60 

9.60 
49.56 

416.00 
96.00 

19824 

970·482·0887 x15 

970·482·0893 

30 Days ARO 

No 

Net 30 
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Bid No. 
Title: 
Due Date: 

10145 
Firefighting Equipment & Supplies 
1/27112 @2:30 PM (Pacific) 

Name afFirm 

City/State 

Telephone 

Fax Number 

Estimated Delivery Time 

COUNTY OF PLACER, AUBURN, CA 

BID EVALUA TlON 

Buyer Name: 
Phone: 
Estimated Award Date: 

LN Curtis & Sons 
Oakland, CA 

510·839·5111 x3326 

510·839-5325 

15-30 Days ARO 

Mallory Fire 
Longview, WA 

800·625·5679 

916-861-0310 

14 Days ARQ 

LVP Certified? (1) No No 

Net 30 Invoice Terms 12) Net 30 

Item 
No. Item Deseri tian 

Package 3 - Rope Rescue Equipment (Continued) 
3.41 Rescue B, Steel 
3.42 Rescue 8, Alummum 
3.43 Rescue Rack with Tie-Off Pin 
3.44 Rope Bag, Medium, 200 fl.. Capacity, Orange 
3.45 Rope Bag, X-Large, 300 ft. Capacity, Orange 
3.46 Ferno Fastrap Quick Restraint System 
3.47 Lifesaver Victim Harness 
3.48 Titanium Rescue Litter 
3.49 Radio Harness 
3.50 Avatar Harness with Diamond Chest Harness 
3.51 RAiSMC Edge Roller 
3.52 Ro e Markin 10 Kit 

Package 4 - Manufacturer's Discounts 
4.1 Cascade Fire Equipment Company 
4.2 Duo-Safety Ladders 
4.3 Fire Hooks Unlimited 
4.4 Gosport Manufacturing Co., Inc. 
4.5 Nupla Corporation 
4.6 Pelican Produqts ·Inc. 
4.7 Red Head Brass, LLC 
4.8 Streamlight 
4.9 MAG Instrument Inc. MAG-UTE 

4.10 Turtle Plastics 

Qt Unit Price 

61.25 
39.75 
76.00 
68.75 

101.00 
83.75 

14p5 
1.759.00 

33.50 
'No Bid 
il6Sid: 

7.25% Sales Tax 
Freight 
Bid Total 
LVP 
Prom t Pa Disc 
Ref. Price 

10% 
15% 
15% 
25% 
35% 
47% 
25% 
47% 

5% 

Extension 

245.00 
159.00 
304.00 
343.75 
505.00 
167.50 
289.50 

1.759.00 
167.50 

25,103.95 Subtotal 

Unit Price 

64.37 
41.85 
95.63 
72.41 

106.21 
86.95 

152.07 
1.753.74 

35.40 
288.20 
120.69 

4.79 

1,820.04 7.25% Sales Tax 
0.00 Freight 

26,923.99 Bid Total 
0.00 LVP 
0.00 Prom t Pay Disc 

$26 923.99 Ref. Price 

5% 
10% 
10% 

5% 
10% 
10% 
10% 
10% 
5% 

10% 

Jon Manning 
530-889-4290 
3/27112 

Extension 

257.48 
167.40 
~82.52 

362.05 
531.05 
17~.90 

304.14 
1.75374 

177.00 
576.40 
12069 

4.79 

Alistar Fire Equipment 
Arcadia, CA 

626·652·0900 
626-652-0920 

28 Days ARO 

No 

Net 30 

Unit Price 

60.45 
39.30 
89.30 
68.00 
99.75 
82.75 

142.85 
1.669.75 

33.25 
330.00 
147.25 

5.50 
27.717.30 Subtotal 

2,009.50 7.25% Sales Tax 
0.00 Freight 

29,726.80 Bid Total 
0.00 LVP 
0.00 Prom t Pa Disc 

$29,726.80 Ref. Price 

95.00 ,._. 

90.00 
90.00 

;NciBkt 
"20% 

95.00 0% 
90.00 30% 
90.00 35% 
90.00 0% 
90.00 35% 
95.00 ~- ;~~N{)Bid;~. 
90.00 . O~fo<- < 

Extension 

241.80 
157.20 
357.20 
340.00 

Municipal Emergency Services Life-Assist, Inc. 
Chicago,lL Rancho Cordova, CA 

858-715·4639 

No 

Net 30 

Unit Price 

71.90 
46.70 

106.00 
80.90 

118.00 
98.00 

169.00 
1.790.00 

Extension 

287.60 
"\88.BO 
424.00 
404.50 
590.00 
196.00 
338.00 

916-635·3822 

916-638·5131 

5-7 Days ARO 

No 

Net 30 

Unit Price 

67.60 
43.95 
99.84 
76.05 

1.114.54 
103.25 
159.71 

1.795.00 

4.11 Akron Brass 
4.12 Task Force Tips 

100 
100 
100 
100 
100 
100 
100 
100 
100 
100 
100 
100 
100 
100 
100 
100 
100 

5% 
30% 
28% 
15% 
20% 
20% 
20% 
20% 

90.00 
85.00 
85.00 
75.00 
65.00 
53.00 
75.00 
53.00 
95.00 
95.00 
70.00 
72.00 
85.00 
80.00 
80.00 
80.00 
80.00 

... ~~ ·:~~:~;f:~;\-·- ", ,~~ :'~~':':. ,"' ,.-' .I'::lg.s\~t ' 

4.13 CMC Rescue Harnesses 
4.14 CMC Hardware (e.g. carabiners, pulleys, etc.) 
4.15 CMC Rescue Rope and Webbing 
4.16 CMC Swift Water Rescue Equipment 
4.17 CMC Bags, Packs, and Personal Gear 

CMC Systems'and Kits,.Auxifiary EqUipment. and 
4.18 Patient Care and Transport 

(l) Local Vendor Preference IS' granted to those firms who file an 
LVP Affidavit With the County pllor to the close of the bId 

(2) InVOice Terms of less than 10 days cannot be considered. 

J. Manning 

100 5% 

Subtolal 
7.25% Sales Tax 

Freight 

Bid Total 

LVP 
Prom t Pa Disc 

Ref. Price 

95.00 

1,413.00 Subtotal 

10% 
10% 
10% 
10% 
10% 

10% 

102.44 725% Sales Tax 

0.00 Freight 

1.515.44 Bid Total 

0.00 LVP 

0.00 Prom t Pa Disc 

$1,515.44 Ref. Price 

90.00 
90.00 
90.00 
90.00 
90.00 

90.00 

1,455.00 Subtotal 
105.49 7.25% Sales Tax 

0.00 Freight 

1,560.49 Bid Total 

0.00 LVP 

0.00 Prom I Pa Disc 

$1,560.49 Ref. Price 

1,363.00 Subtotal 
98.82 7.25% Sales Tax 

0.00 Freight 

1,461.82 Bid Total 

0.00 LVP 
0.00 Prom t Pa Disc 

$1,461.82 Ref. Price 

10% 
10% 
10% 

10% 

19.94 7.25% Sales Tax 

0.00 Freight 

294.94 Bid Total 

0.00 LVP 

0.00 Prom t Pa Disc 

$294.94 Ref, Price 

Attachment A 

AHS Rescue & Arizona Hiking 
Shack Dive Rescue International 
Phoenix, AZ Fort Collins. CO 

Extension 

270.40 
175.80 
399.36 
380.25 

5.572.70 
206.50 
319.42 

1.795.00 

602·944-7723 

602·861·0221 

30 Days ARO 

No 

Net 30 

Unit Price 

69.34 
45.08 

102.40 
78.00 

114.40 
89.00 

163.80 
1.690.00 

38.14 
303.82 
133.31 

5.04 

0.00 LVP 

0.00 Prom t Pa Disc 

$750.75 Ref. Price 

Extension 

970·482·0887 x15 

970-482-0893 

30 Days ARO 

No 

Net 30 

Unit Price 

133.31 148.75 
5.04 28.05 

27,065.55 Subtotal 
1,962.25 7.25% Sates Tax 

0.00 Freight 
29,027.80 Bid Total 

0.00 Bid Total 

0.00 LVP 

0.00 Prom I Pa Disc 

$0.00 Ref. Price 

Page 4 01 4 

Extension 

1,430.34 
103.70 

0.00 
1.534.04 

0.00 
0.00 

$1,534.04 

0.00 

0.00 
$0.00 



= 

TO: 

FROM: 

DATE: 

SUBJECT: 

COUNTY OF PLACER 

BOARD MEMBERS 

JACK DURAN 
District 1 

ROBERT M. WEYGANDT 
Distrtct2 

JIM HOLMES 
District 3 

KIRK UHLER 
Districl4 

JENNIFER MONTGOMERY 
District 5 

Attachment B 

OFFICE OF 
COUNTY EXECUTIVE 

HOLLY L. HEINZEN, 
Interim County Executive Officer 

175 FULWEILERAVENUE 1 AUBURN, CALIFORNIA 95603 
TELEPHONE: 530/889-4030 

FAX: 530/889-4023 
www.placer.C8.gov 

Honorable Board of Supervisors . . .... ~ 
Kim M. Davis, Senior Accountant Audnor ~ . 
March 6,2012 

Fiscal Impact Statement 
Bid #10145 - BPOs for Fire Fighter Equipment & Supplies 

The Bid would generate BPOs totaling $130,000. The department has budgeted correctly for 
purchases on these BPOs and funding is available in the 2011/12 budget for Fire and Fire 
CSA Appropriations. 
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