MEMORANDUM

COUNTY OF PLACER

ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES DEPARTMENT
PROCUREMENT SERVICES DIVISION

TO: Honorable Board of Supervisors N

A
FROM: Brett Wood, Purchasing Manager GM w
DATE: October 9, 2012

SUBJECT: Ice Control Sand and Hauling Services — Hansen Bros. Enterprises, Robinson Sand &
Gravel, Cinderlite Trucking Corporation, and Larry Newman Trucking

ACTION REQUESTED

1. Approve the award of competitive Bid No. 10204 to Hansen Bros. Enterprises of Grass Valley,
Robinson Sand & Gravel of Auburn, Cinderlite Trucking Corporation of Carson City, NV, and
Larry Newman Trucking of Lincoln for ice control sand and hauling services in the maximum
aggregate amount of $235,400, funded by HUTA revenue with no net county cost, for the period
of October 9, 2012 through September 30, 2013, and authorize the Purchasing Manager to sign
the resulting blanket purchase orders (BPOs) and to transfer funds between BPOs as needed.

BACKGROUND

The Department of Public Works (DPW) Road Maintenance Division requires annual BPOs for the
purchase and delivery of ice control sand throughout Placer County on an as-needed basis. The
department's most recent BPOs expired on June 30, 2012,

The Procurement Services Division developed Invitation for Bids (IFB) No. 10204 to solicit competitive
bids for ice control sand and hauling services on behalf of DPW. The bid was distributed via the
County's E-Bid system to 86 potential bidders and was also posted on the County’s website. A total of
6 bids were received. For Western Placer County, Hansen Bros. Enterprises submitted the lowest
priced responsive bid and Robinson Sand & Gravel submitted the next-lowest responsive bid. For
fastern Placer County, Cinderlite Trucking Corp. submitted the lowest priced responsive bid and Larry
Newman Trucking submitted the next-lowest responsive bid. The Award Recommendation, Bidder
Rankings, and Bid Pricing Evaluation are submitted as Attachment A.

FISCAL IMPACT

Upon your Board's approval, BPOs will be awarded to Hansen Bros. Enterprises, Robinson Sand &
Gravel, Cinderlite Trucking Corp., and Larry Newman Trucking in the maximum aggregate amount of
$235,400 for the period of October 9, 2012, through September 30, 2013. DPW's Fiscal Impact Statement
is attached (refer to Attachment B).

Attachments: A - Bid Pricing Evaluation, Bidder Rankings, and Award Recommendation
B — DPW Fiscal Impact Statement

cC: Cynthia Taylor, Public Works Senior Administrative Services Officer
Kevin Taber, Public Works Manager-Road Maintenance
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Bid No. 10204 - Ice Control Sand Hauling

Attachment A
Page 1 of 4

AWARD RECOMMENDATION FOR BID NO. 10204 - ICE CONTROL SAND AND HAULING

SERVICES
PRIMARY AWARD
Revised Aggregate Award
Bidder Category Ref Price *Factor Ref Price Usage Factor Amount (Rounded Up)
Hansen Bros. 1 - Western Placer § 4988198  80% § 39,905.58 14,000.00
County
. : . 2 - Eastern Placer o :
Cinderlite Trucking Corp. County $ 277,723.88 80% $222179.10 144,500.00
SECONDARY AWARD
Revised Aggregate Award
Bidder Category Ref Price *Factor Ref Price Usage Factor _Amount (Rounded Up)
Robinson Sand & Gravel - W‘"CS;Z’:WP lacer $ 57,388.43 20% $ 11,477.69 4,100.00
Newman Trucking 2 - Eastern Placer $ 559,845.00 20% $ 111,969.00 72,800.00

County

* - BPO's shall be awarded to a primary and secondary service provider in the maximum aggregate amount of $235,400.00. DPW Road
Maintenance Division anticipates services to be split approximately 80% and 20% between the primary provider and secondary provider.

“* . DPW Road Maintenance Division anticipates that ice control sand and hauling will be split approximately 65% and 35% between Eastern

Placer County and Western Placer County.

IS
N

J. Manning

9/20/2012



Bid No. 10204 - Ice Control Sand and Hauling RANKINGS Attachment A

Page 2 of 4
ICE CONTROL SAND FOR WESTERN PLACER COUNTY
Destinations: Roseville, Cavitt Staliman, Lincoln, Loomis, Auburn, Foresthill, Colfax
Bidder Mine ID Information Name of Hauler Combined Total Price
Rank
1 Hansen Bros., Grass Valley Hansen Bros. ID #91-29-0006 Hansen Bros., Grass Valley $ 49.881.98
2 Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn Hansen Bros. 1D #91-29-0006 Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn $ 57 388.43
) . Knife River Hallwood - 1D #91-58-0002 and . .

3 Newman Trucking, Lincoln Triangle Rock Products - ID #91-34-0038 Newman Trucking, Lincoln 3 66 146.44

4 Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs SRI Supreme - ID #91-58-0022 Biain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs 133 824.66
Cinderlite Trucking Corp., Carson City No Bid
MMC Trucking, Truckee No Bid

ICE CONTROL SAND FOR EASTERN PLACER COUNTY
Destinations: Kingvale, Northstar, and Tahoe City
Bidder Mine ID Information Name of Hauler Combined Total Price
Rank HName o naulet Combined Total Price
* MMC Trucking, Truckee Gopher Construction, Fernley, NV - Trico Pit MMC Trucking, Truckee
1 Cinderlite Trucking Corp., Carson City 022 - RT Donovan Pit Cinderlite Trucking Corp., Carson City $ 277,723.88
: . 019 - Granite Construction, 020 - Vulcan . . .

2 Newman Trucking, Lincoin Triangle, and 022 - RT Donovan Pit Newman Trucking, Lincain $ 559 845.00
Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs - No Bid
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn No Bid
Hansen Bros., Grass Valley No Bid

* - Bid was determined to be non-responsive because the bidder did not submit complete test results as required in Bid Attribute No. 11.

3

J. Manning 9/20/2012



Bid No. 10204 - Ice Control Sand Hauling Evaluation of Bid Prices Aftachment A

Page 3-5f 4
[BIDDER: BLAIN STUMPF TRUCKING - SHINGLE SPRINGS, CA 1 LVP: No | | invoice Terms: Net 30 -
Matorial Price  Mat. Sales Tax _ Haufing Price  Haul. Sajes Tax LVP Credit Prompt Pay, Discount Matl + Haul Est. Tons Total Price
Destinations
Roseville $ 4675 % 3.38938 § 1000 % 3 $ $ 60.13938 150 3 9,020.M
Cavitt Stallman 3 4875 $ 338938 % 1000 % 3 $ - $ 60.13938 100 $ 6,013,594
Lincoin $ 4675 % 338938 § 1000 $ - 3 - $ 3 60.13938 300 % 18041 81
Loomis $ 4675 % 338938 3 1100 & - $ - $ - $ 61,13938 100 § 6,113.94
Aubum L) 4675 $ 338938 § 12.00 § - 3 - 3 - $ 62.13938 500 $ 31,069.69
Foresthill 3 46.75 % 338938 §% 1385 % - $ - $ $ 63.98938 500 § 31,994.69
Colfax $ 4675 $ 338938 % 1300 % 3 - 3 $ 63,13938 500 % 31.569.69
f 133,824.66
BIDDER: CINDERLITE TRUCKING CORP - CARSON CITY, NV ! LVP: No | invoice Terms: Net 30
Material Price__ Mat, Sales Tax___Hauling Price  Haul. Sales Tax LVP Credit Prompt Pay. Discount Mati + Haul Est. Tons Tofal Price
BIDDER: MMC TRUCKING - TRUCKEE, CA | |t No ] | invoice Terms: 1% 15 Days
Materiai Price.  Mat _Sales Tax _ Hauling Price  Maul. Sajes Tax LVB Cradift Prompt Pay, Discount MatT+ Haul Est Tons Total Price
N0 BID ' R '
BIDDER: NEWMAN TRUCKING - LINCOLN, CA i | e wo | | imvoice Torms:  Net30
Material Price__Mat_Sales Tax___Hauling Price_ Haul. Sales Tax___LVP Credit___Prompt Pay. Discount ___Mat1 + Haul Est. Tons Total Price
Destinations ) .
Roseville % 1400 § 1.01500 1050 % 076125 % - % - 3 26.27625 150 % 3,941.44
Cavitt Stallman % 1400 § 1.0f65006 $ 100 $ 079750 § $ - 3 26.81250 100 § 268125
Lincoin $ 1400 § 1.01500 % 900 % 0.65250 $ 1 - $ 24 66750 300 $ 7,400.25
Looamis 3 14.00 $ 1.01500 % 1200 § 087000 $ $ - $ 27.88500 100 % 2,788.50
Auburm H 1400 § 101500 & 1600 § 116000 $ - $ $ 32.17500 500 § 16,087 50
Foresthill $ 1400 § 101500 § 1700 & 1.23250 % - $ - $ 33.24750 500 3 16,623.75
Colfax $ 1400 § 101500 % 1700 & 1232580 % - $ - $ 33.24750 500 % 16,623.75
3 66, 146.44
BIDDER: ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL - AUBURN, CA [ e Yes | | tvoice Terms: 1% 10 Days
Ma!w_fai Price _Mat. Sales Tax Hauling Price  Haul. Sales_‘]__’g _LVP Cradit Prompt Pay. Discount I'hﬁ + anl F_ct. Tonsl Total P‘rice
i . . R ; o RN :
Roseville $ 1604 $ 1.16290 % 1213 8 087943 § 151062 $ 030212 & 2839959 150 % 4,259.94
Cavitt Stallman $ 1604 § 1.16280 § 1213 8§ 087943 § 151062 $ 030212 % 28.39859 100 § 2.839.85
Lincoln $ 16.04 $ 1.16200 § 1213 8 0.87943 $ 151062 § 030212 § 28,39959 00 % 851968
Loomis $ 1604 § .1.18290 $ 1112 ¢ 0.80620 § 145646 § 0.29129 § 27.38135 100 $ 2,738.14
Aubum $ 1604 § 1.16290 § 9.10 § 065975 $ 134813 § 0.26963 $ 25.34489 500 § 12,672.45
Foresthill $ 1604 § 1.16290 § 1415 § 102588 §$ 161894 § 032379 $ 30.43605 500 $ 18,218.02
Colfax $ 1604 § 116290 §$ 8068 § 043935 § 118511 § 023702 % 22.28012 500 § 11,140 06
3384
BIDDER: HANSEN BROS. ENTERPRISES - GRASS VALLEY, CA LVP: No | | mnvoice Terms: Net 30 _
Material Frice _ Mat. Sajes Tax Hauling Price _Haul. Sales Tax LVP Credit Prompt Pay. Discount Mat'l + Haul Est, Tons Total Price
Destinations
Roseville 3 13.5¢ § 097875 § 860 3 062350 § $ - $ 23.70225 150 % 3,555 34
Cavitt Stallman § 1350 § 097875 § 1075 % 077938 § $ - $ 26.00813 160 § 2,600.81
Lincoln $ 1350 § 097875 § 860 § 062350 $ $ - $ 23.70225 300 § 7.110.68
Loomis 3 1350 097875 § 715 & 0.51838 % - $ - 3 22.14713 100 % 221471
P, Aubum 3 1350 % 097875 & 790 % 057275 $ - $ - - 2295150 500 $ 11.475.75
L)\ Foresthill $ 1350 § 097875 § 930 § 0.67425 ¢ $ - $ 24.45300 500 § 12,226.50
’t Colfax $ 1350 § 097875 § 645 § 046763 § - 3 $ 21.39638 500 § 10,698.18
% 49,881.58

J. Manning 9720/2012
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Bid No. 10204 - ice Control Sand Hauling Evaluation of

Bid Prices

Attachment A

Page 4 of 4
BIDDER: BLAIN STUMPF TRUCKING - SHINGLE SPRINGS, CA I LVP: No Inveice Terms: Net 30
Material Price_Mat. Safes Tax __Hauling Price_ Haul, Safes Tax___ LVP Credit __ Prompt Pay. Discoant  Matl + Haul Est. Tons Total Price
NO BID
BIDDER: CINDERLITE TRUCKING CORP. - CARSON CITY, NV i LVP; No [ Invoice Terms: Nat 30
Materjal Price_ Mat.Sales Tax __ Hauling Price _ Haul. Sales Tax___LVP Credit___ Frompi Pay. Discount____Matl+ Haul Est. Tons Total Price
Destinations
Kingvale $ 2950 § 213875 % 1575 § 114188 $ $ § 4853063 00 $ 14,559.19
Northstar $ 2050 § 213875 § 1575 § 114188 § $ - $ 4853063 2000 § 97,061.25
Tahoe City § 2950 § 213875 $ 1575 § 114188 § $ - $  48.53063 1750 § 84,926 59
Truckee $ 2050 $ 213875 $ 1375 § 0.098B8 § R - § 4638563 1750 _§ 81,174.84
3 277,723.88
BIDDER: MMC TRUCKING - TRUCKEE, CA | Lve: No [ | invoice Terms: 1% 15 Days
Matorial Price fing Pi Fro 2 “Matl+ Haul___E3t Tons Total Price
Destinations B e e
Kingvaie
Northstar
Tahoe City
Truckee
BIDDER: NEWMAN TRUCKING - LINCOLN, CA LVP: No involce Terms: Net 30
Matorial Frice _Mat. Sales Tax__Heullng Frice _Haul. Sajes Tax___LVP Credit___Prompt Pay. Discount ___Mat|+ Haul ___Est_Tons Total Price
Déstinaﬁuns . . — .
Kingvale $ 4900 § 355250 $ 4100 3 297250 % - % - $ 9652500 300 § 28.957.50
Northstar $ 4900 § 3.55250 § 4100 § 297250 % S - $ 9652500 2000 $ 193,050.00
Taho City $ 4900 $ 355250 $ 4100 5 297250 % -5 - $ 9652500 1750 $ 168,918.75
Truckee $ 4900 $ 355250 $ 4100 $ 297250 § -3 - $  96.52500 1750 $ 168,918.75
_ [ 558,845.00
BIDDER: ROBINSON SAND & GRAVEL - AUBURN, CA LvP: Yos I invoice Terms: 1% 10 Days
Matorial Price__ Mat. Sales Tax___Hauling Frice _Haul. Sales Tax___LVE Credi____Frompt Pay. Discouni __Mat]+ Haul____Est. Tons Total Price__|
: j ‘ ﬁqﬁb_ o SIS
BIDDER: HANSEN BROS. ENTERPRISES - GRASS VALLE Y, CA [ Lve: No Invoice Terms: Net 30 _
Materiai Price __ Mat. Sales Tax __ Hauling Price  Haul. Sales Tax LVP Credit Prompt Pay. Discount Mati + Haul Est. Tons Total Price
' — NOBID - ' - - : '
J. Manning g/20/2 12



Attachment B

MEMORANDUM
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS
County of Placer
TO: Honorable Board of Supervisors DATE: October 8, 2012
FROM: Ken Grehm, Director

SUBJECT: FISCAL IMPACT STATEMENT
Annual Furnish and Deliver Ice Control Sand Contract

1. Approve award of competitive bid #10204 Annual Furnish and Deliver ice Control
Sand Contract in the aggregate amount of $235,400, funded by HUTA revenue with
no net county cost, for the period of FY 2012-13, and authorize the Purchasing
Manager to sign the resulting Blanket Purchase Orders.

|5k



	01a

	02a

	03a

	04a

	05a

	05b

	06a

	06b

	07a

	08

	09a1

	09a2

	09a3

	10a

	11a

	11b

	11c

	11d

	11e

	12

	13a

	13b

	14a

	15a

	16a

	17a

	18a

	18b

	18c

	18d

	18e

	19a

	19b

	20a

	21


