
MEMORANDUM 
COUNTY OF PLACER 
DEPARTMENT OF ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES 
PROCUREMENT SERVICES DIVISION 

Honorable Board of Supervisors 

David Seward, Purchasing Manager 

December 19,2006 

SUBJECT: Award Bid No. 961 1 for Institutional Clothing & Bedding to Leslee Scott, Carolina 
Textiles, LC Textiles, and Charmtex in the Maximum Aggregate Amount of 

ACTION REQUESTED 

Award Bid No. 961 1 for institutional clothing & bedding to Leslee Scott of Utah, Carolina Textiles of 
North Carolina, LC Textiles of Arizona, and Charmtex of New York in the maximum aggregate 
amount of $75,500.00, and authorize the Purchasing Manager to sign the resulting blanket 
purchase orders. 

BACKGROUND 

Procurement solicited bids from 29 vendors and placed the Invitation for Bids on the County 
website on behalf of the Sheriffs' Corrections Division. The bid specifications described various 
articles of clothing and bedding used for the Jail's inmate population. Attachment A lists the prices 
offered by all 13 responding vendors. The bid listed 17 categories of clothing such as work shirts, 
work pants, jackets, and boots as well as mattresses, pillows, and sheets. The bid indicated that 
award may be made on a category basis. Responding bidders were instructed to supply samples 
for compliance evaluation. Samples from Team Safety did not meet specifications for Category "Dl' 
and Charmtex did not meet specifications for Category "E." Contract award for these categories is 
being recommended to the next lowest bidders whose samples met the specifications. Attachment 
B shows that 7 bidders submitted low bids on at least 1 category each. To simplify the ordering 
process and reduce administrative contract management time, Procurement and the Corrections 
Division recommend that it is in the best interest of the County, as allowed by Section 8 of the bid's 
General Terms and Conditions, to award to 4 vendors instead of 7. The total increase in cost of 
$269.74 will be more than offset by reduced contract management time. 

FISCAL IMPACT 

The blanket purchase order (BPO) with Leslee Scott will be valued at $33,250.00 per year. The 
BPO with Carolina Textiles will be valued at $8,533.00 per year. The BPO with LC Textiles will be 
valued at $22,956.00 per year. The BPO with Charmtex will be valued at $10,761 .OO per year. All 
of these BPOs will be effective from January I ,  2007 through December 31, 2007. The Sheriff's 
Office has budgeted sufficiently for these expenditures. 

Attachments 
Attachment A: Bid Evaluation and Award Recommendation 
Attachment B: Bid Cost Award Analysis 

cc: Barbara Besana, Sheriff Administration 
Jake Mucher, Sheriff Corrections Division 



COUNTY OF PLACER, AUBURN, CA 

BID EVALUATION & AWARD RECOMMENDATION 

Bid No. 961 1 Buyer Name: Steven McCredie 
Title: Institutional Clothing & Bedding Phone: 530-889-4257 Note: This spreadsheet is 2 pages wide. 
Due Date: 911 8/06 Estimated Award Date: left side - right side 
Page 1 (left side) 

Name of Firm 
CitylState 

Telephone 
Fax Number 

FOB 
Delivery Time 
LVP Certified? 'I' 
Invoice Terms '*' 

t e d  Description 1 Qty 

(Recommended 

Leslee Scott 
Ogden, UT 
800-398-1250 
801-622-5895 
Destination 
Various see below 
No 
Net 30 

Unit Price Extension 
Pants 

7 
36 each 

3.94 788.00 
3.94 788.00 
3.94 788.00 
3.94 788.00 
4.14 828.00 
4.14 149.04 
4.14 149.04 
4.14 149.04 
4.14 149.04 
4.14 149.04 
4.14 149.04 

LSllUNTP 
4,874.24 

3.94 788.00 
3.94 788.00 
3.94 788.00 
3.94 788.00 
3.94 788.00 
4.14 149.04 
4.14 149.04 
4.14 149.04 
4.14 149.04 
4.14 149.04 
4.14 149.04 
4.14 149.04 

4,983.28 

1 

2 

awards are shown 

Bob Barker 
FuquayNarina, NC 
800-334-9880 
800-322-7537 
Destination 
Various see below 
No 
Net 30 

Unit Price Extension 

5-30 
1 each 

4.68 936.00 
4.68 936.00 
4.68 936.00 
4.68 936.00 
5.63 1,126.00 
5.63 202.68 
5.63 202.68 
5.63 202.68 
5.63 202.68 
5.63 202.68 
5.63 202.68 

Bob Barker 
6,086.08 

3.55 710.00 
3.95 790.00 
4.03 806.00 
4.03 806.00 
4.03 806.00 
4.70 169.20 
5.00 180.00 
5.35 192.60 
5.65 203.40 
5.65 203.40 
5.90 212.40 
5.90 212.40 

5,291.40 

Category A: V Neck Shirts, 
Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Shirt, Size L(orange) 
Size XL 
Size 2XL 
Size 3XL 
Size 4XL 
Size 5XL 
Size 6XL 
Size 7XL 
Size 8XL 
Size 9XL 
Size 10XL 
Product Bid 
Subtotal 
Shirt, Size Med(yellow) 
Size L 
Size XL 
Size 2XL 
Size 3XL 
Size 4XL 
Size 5XL 
Size 6XL 
Size 7XL 
Size 8XL 
Size 9XL 
Size IOXL 
Subtotal 

Work 

200 
200 
200 
200 
200 
36 
36 
36 
36 
36 
36 

200 
200 
200 
200 
200 
36 
36 
36 
36 
36 
36 
36 

below high-lighted by category) 

Charmtex 
Brooklyn, NY 
71 8-252-8200 
71 8-258-8303 
Destination 
Various see below 
No 
Net 30 
Unit Price Extension 

7-30 
24 each 

4.08 816.00 
4.08 816.00 
4.08 816.00 
4.36 872.00 
4.36 872.00 
4.72 169.92 
5.18 186.48 
5.36 192.96 
5.36 192.96 
6.18 222.48 
6.18 222.48 

Charmtex, SOR 
5,379.28 

4.08 816.00 
4.08 816.00 
4.08 816.00 
4.08 816.00 
4.36 872.00 
4.36 156.96 
4.72 169.92 
5.18 186.48 
5.36 192.96 
5.36 192.96 
6.18 222.48 
6.18 222.48 

5,480.24 

There are 
Carolina Textiles 
Charlotte, NC 
704-525-1 272 
704-525-0607 
Destination 
Various see below 
No 
Net 30 
Unit Price Extension 

NIB 

13 bidders. 
Team Safety Apparel 
Crystal Springs, MS 
601-892-3571 
601-892-4427 
Destination 
Various see below 
No 
Net 30 
Unit Price Extension 

45 
? 

6.95 1,390.00 
6.95 1,390.00 
6.95 1,390.00 
7.95 1,590.00 
7.95 1,590.00 
9.00 324.00 
9.00 324.00 

12.00 432.00 
12.00 432.00 
15.00 540.00 
15.00 540.00 

Team Safety 63VN1 
9,942.00 

6.95 1,390.00 
6.95 1,390.00 
6.95 1,390.00 
6.95 1,390.00 
7.95 1,590.00 
7.95 286.20 
9.00 324.00 
9.00 324.00 

12.00 432.00 
12.00 432.00 
15.00 540.00 
15.00 540.00 

10,028.20 

Attachment A 
Robinson Textiles 
Gardena, CA 
800-421 -5582 
800-370-701 9 
Destination 
Various see below 
No 
Net 30 

Unit Price Extension 

15-35 
50 each (smaller sizes) 

4.52 904.00 
4.52 904.00 
4.52 904.00 
4.52 904.00 
4.52 904.00 
4.77 171.72 
5.02 180.72 
6.00 216.00 
6.00 216.00 
6.00 216.00 
6.00 216.00 

R. Textiles RTVS 
5,736.44 

4.00 800.00 
4.52 904.00 
4.52 904.00 
4.52 904.00 
4.52 904.00 
4.52 162.72 
4.77 171.72 
5.02 180.72 
6.00 216.00 
6.00 216.00 
6.00 216.00 
6.00 216.00 

5,795.16 



7 
36 each 

4.89 
4.89 
4.89 
4.89 
4.89 
5.34 
5.34 
5.34 
5.34 
5.34 
5.34 
5.34 

LSllUNPT 

Qty 
200 
200 
200 
200 
200 
36 
36 
36 
36 
36 
36 
36 

200 
200 
200 
200 
200 
200 
200 
36 
36 
36 
36 
36 

200 
200 
200 
200 
200 
200 
200 
36 
36 
36 
36 
36 

P a g e  
ten' 
3 

4 

5 

z (left s ide)  
Description 

Shirt, Size Med(red) 
Size L 
Size XL 
Size 2XL 
Size 3XL 
Size 4XL 
Size 5XL 
Size 6XL 
Size 7XL 
Size 8XL 
Size 9XL 
Size 10XL 
Subtotal 
Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Pants, Size M(orange) 
Size L 
Size XL 
Size 2XL 
Size 3XL 
Size 4XL 
Size 5XL 
Size 6XL 
Size 7x1 
Size 8XL 
Size 9XL 
Size 10XL 
Product Bid 
Subtotal 
Pants, Size M(yellow) 
Size L 
Size XL 
Size 2XL 
Size 3XL 
Size 4XL 
Size 5XL 
Size 6XL 
Size 7XL 
Size 8XL 
Size 9XL 
Size 10XL 
Subtotal 

788.00 4.52 
788.00 4.52 
788.00 4.52 
788.00 4.52 
149.04 4.52 
149.04 4.93 
149.04 4.93 
149.04 5.90 
149.04 5.90 
149.04 5.90 
149.04 5.90 

4,983.28 

978.00 
978.00 
978.00 
978.00 
978.00 

1,068.00 
1,068.00 

192.24 
192.24 
192.24 
192.24 
192.24 

7,987.20 
978.00 
978.00 
978.00 
978.00 
978.00 

1.068.00 
1,068.00 

192.24 
192.24 
192.24 
192.24 
192.24 

7,987.20 

904.00 4.08 
904.00 4.08 
904.00 4.08 
904.00 4.36 
162.72 4.36 
177.48 4.72 
177.48 5.18 
212.40 5.36 
212.40 5.36 
212.40 6.18 
212.40 6.18 

T e a m  Safety Apparel 
Unit Price Extension 

6.95 1,390.00 

5-30 
I each 

5.30 
5.60 
5.60 
5.60 
5.60 
6.68 
6.68 
6.68 
6.68 
6.68 
6.68 
6.68 

Bob Barker 

4.58 
5.09 
5.25 
5.85 
5.85 
5.85 
5.85 
7.15 
8.40 
8.40 
8.90 
8.90 

5,779.28 

1,060.00 
1,120.00 
1,120.00 
1,120.00 
1,120.00 
1,336.00 
1,336.00 

240.48 
240.48 
240.48 
240.48 
240.48 

9,414.40 
91 6.00 

1,018.00 
1,050.00 
1 , I  70.00 
1,170.00 
1,170.00 
1,170.00 

257.40 
302.40 
302.40 
320.40 
320.40 

9,167.00 

Robinson Textiles 
Unit Price Extension 

4.00 800.00 
6.95 1,390.00 
6.95 1.390.00 
6.95 1,390.00 
7.95 1,590.00 
7.95 286.20 
9.00 324.00 
9.00 324.00 

12.00 432.00 
12.00 432.00 
15.00 540.00 
15.00 540.00 

10,028.20 
45 
? 

7.95 1,590.00 
7.95 1,590.00 
7.95 1,590.00 
7.95 1,590.00 
8.95 1,790.00 
8.95 1,790.00 

10.00 2,000.00 
10.00 360.00 
12.00 432.00 
12.00 432.00 
16.00 576.00 
16.00 576.00 

Team Safety 60P0 
14,316.00 

7.95 1,590.00 
7.95 1,590.00 
7.95 1,590.00 
7.95 1,590.00 
8.95 1,790.00 
8.95 1,790.00 

10.00 2,000.00 
10.00 360.00 
12.00 432.00 
12.00 432.00 
16.00 576.00 
16.00 576.00 

14,316.00 

7-30 
24 each 

4.72 
4.72 
4.90 
4.90 
5.18 
5.54 
5.54 
6.04 
6.54 
6.54 
7.36 
7.36 

Charmtex POR 

4.72 
4.72 
4.90 
4.90 
5.18 
5.54 
5.54 
6.04 
6.54 
6.54 
7.36 
7.36 

4.52 904.00 
4.52 904.00 
4.52 904.00 
4.52 904.00 
4.52 162.72 
4.77 171.72 
5.02 180.72 
6.00 216.00 
6.00 216.00 
6.00 216.00 
6.00 216.00 

5,795.16 
15-35 

25 ea (smaller sizes) 
5.00 1,000.00 
5.45 1,090.00 
5.45 1,090.00 
5.45 1,090.00 
5.45 1,090.00 
5.45 1,090.00 
5.45 1,090.00 
6.50 234.00 
7.75 279.00 
7.75 279.00 
7.75 279.00 
7.75 279.00 

R. Textiles RTEP 
8,890.00 

5.00 1,000.00 
5.45 1,090.00 
5.45 1,090.00 
5.45 1,090.00 
5.45 1,090.00 
5.45 1,090.00 
5.45 1,090.00 
6.50 234.00 
7.75 279.00 
7.75 279.00 
7.75 279.00 
7.75 279.00 

8,890.00 



E - 
ter - 
6 

( 

7 

ae 3 (left sldel I 

size XL 
Size 2XL 
Size 3XL 
Size 4XL 
Size 5XL 
Size 6XL 
Size 7XL 
Size 8XL 
Size 9XL 
Size IOXL 
Subtotal 
Category A Total 
ategory B: Sweat SI 
Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Size Med (blue) 
Size L 
Size XL 
Size 2XL 
Size 3XL 
Size 4XL 
Size 5XL 
Size 6XL 
Size 7XL 
Size 8XL 
Size 9XL 
Size I OXL 
Product Bid 
Category B Total 

Leslee Scott 
Unit Price Extension 

4.89 978.00 
4.89 
4.89 
4.89 
4.89 
5.34 
5.34 
5.34 
5.34 
5.34 
5.34 
5.34 

10 
3 dozen 

57.21 
57.21 
57.21 
71.24 
73.98 
91.24 
96.24 

101.24 
106.24 
112.36 
138.94 
138.94 

JeneeslSSRO 

Bob  tlarker I Charmtex 
Unit Price ~xtensionl Unit Price Extension 

5.50 
5.50 
5.50 
5.50 
5.50 
6.30 
6.30 
6.95 
6.95 
6.95 
6.95 

No Bid 

1,100.00 
1,100.00 
1,100.00 
1,100.00 
1,100.00 
1,260.00 

226.80 
250.20 
250.20 
250.20 
250.20 

9,087.60 
44,825.76 

10-14 
3 doz 
52.67 
52.67 
52.67 
68.38 
70.36 
81.45 

107.25 
1 13.85 
121.00 
127.60 
134.20 
140.80 

Jersey 

Carolina Textiles Team Safety Apparel 

4.72 944.00 
4.90 980.00 
4.90 980.00 
5.18 1,036.00 
5.54 1,108.00 
5.54 1,108.00 
6.04 217.44 
6.54 235.44 
6.54 235.44 
7.36 264.96 
7.36 264.96 

8,318.24 
41.294.48 

Partial Bid 
10.00 

2 dozen 
61.90 1 , I  14.2C 
61.90 1,114.2C 
61.90 1,114.2C 
78.18 1,407.24 
78.18 1,407.24 

102.36 204.72 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 

Charmtex Sweats 
6,361.8C 

NIB 

Unit Price Extension 
Robinson Textiles 
Unit Price Extension 

5.00 1,000.00 
5.45 1,090.00 
5.45 1,090.00 
5.45 1,090.00 
5.45 1,090.00 
5.45 1,090.00 
5.45 1,090.00 
6.50 234.00 
7.75 279.00 
7.75 279.00 
7.75 279.00 
7.75 279.00 

8,890.00 
43,996.76 

NIB 

Unit Price Extension 
7.95 1.590.00 





Page 5 ( le f t  s ide)  
t e d  Description 
Category E: Men's Boxel 

delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 

Leslee Scot t  
Unit Price Extension 

I 

10 

11 

12 

5-7 
Small-XL= 20 dozen 
2XL-1 OXL=10 dozen 
11.44 915.2C 
1 1.44 1,144.0C 
11.44 1,349.92 
11.97 1,101.24 
12.24 244.8C 
12.39 272.5E 
15.74 15.74 
16.74 16.74 
17.74 17.74 
18.41 18.41 
18.41 18.41 
18.41 18.41 
LSllBXLSQ 

5,133.15 
r 

5 
20 dozen 

6.64 132.8C 
6.64 159.36 
6.64 159.36 
6.64 159.36 
7.74 278.64 
7.74 185.76 
7.99 79.90 
7.99 79.90 
LSllLBlS 

1,235.08 

Boxers, Med 
Size L 
Size XL 
Size 2XL 
Size 3XL 
Size 4XL 
Size 5XL 
Size 6XL 
Size 7XL 
Size 8XL 
Size 9XL 
Size 10XL 
Product Bid 
Category E Total 

Category F: Women Und 
Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Size 5 
Size 6 
Size 7 
Size 8 
Size 9 
Size 10 
Size 11 
Size 12 
Product Bid 
Category F Total 

Category G: Sports Bras 
Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Size 34 
Size 36 
Size 38 
Size 40 
Size 42 
Size 46 
Size 48 
Size 50 
Product Bid 
Category G Total 

5-7 
20 dozen 

22.98 
22.98 
22.98 
22.98 
22.98 
22.98 
22.98 
22.98 
LSllBASPLS 

B o b  Barker 
Unit Price Extension 

No Bid 

No Bid 

5-30 
12 dozen 

21.41 321.15 
23.41 280.92 
25.21 378.15 
25.21 302.52 
25.21 302.52 
25.21 100.84 
25.21 50.42 
25.21 50.42 

Bob Barker ESP 
1,786.94 

7-30 
5 dozen 

Charmtex 
Unit Price Extension 

14 
20 doz 

Carol ina Texti les 
Unit Price Extension 

9.90 792.00 
9.90 990.00 

10.18 1,201.24 
10.72 986.24 
11.18 223.60 
11.90 261.80 
13.90 13.90 
14.36 14.36 
16.90 16.90 
16.90 16.90 
17.90 17.90 
17.90 17.90 

Charmtex CLlBoxer 
4,552.74 

7-30 
24 dozen 

8.72 174.413 
8.72 209.2E 
8.72 209.2E 
8.72 209.2E 
8.72 313.92 
9.18 220.34 
9.18 91.8C 
9.18 91.8C 

Charmtex CLllPANT 
1,520.0f 

NIB 

14 
20 doz 

8.35 
8.35 
8.35 
8.35 
8.35 
8.35 
8.35 
8.35 

FM 

14-30 
12 doz 
20.79 
20.79 
20.79 
20.79 
20.79 
20.79 
20.79 
20.79 

FM SPBR 

NIB 

NIB NIB 



Pane 6 (left s~de) 
terr( Description 
Cateaorv H: Men's Tube 

IDe~iiery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Men's Tube Socks 
Product Bid 
?gory I: Deck Shoes 
Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Size 6 
Size 7 
Size 8 
Size 9 
Size 10 
Size 11 
Size 12 
Size 13 
Size 14 
Size 15 
Product Bid 
Category l Total 
?gory J: Men's T-Shi~ 
Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Size Med (orange) 
Size L 
Size XL 
Size 2XL 
Size 3XL 
Size 4XL 
Size 5XL 
Size 6XL 
Size 7XL 
Size 8XL 
Size 9XL 
Size 1 OXL 
Product Bid 
Subtotal 

- 
3 
ock 

250 

96 
96 
96 
192 
216 
208 
96 
96 
96 
96 

i 

4 
12 
12 
12 
12 
3 
3 
3 
3 
3 
3 
3 

Leslee Scott 
Unit Price Extension 

5-7 
20 dozen 

5.47 1,367.50 
LSllSJTW22 

5-7 
24 pair 

2.67 256.32 
2.67 256.32 
2.67 256.32 
2.67 512.64 
2.67 576.72 
2.67 555.36 
2.67 256.32 
2.67 256.32 
2.67 256.32 
2.67 256.32 

LSllSHDEO 
3,438.96 

7-10 
6 dozen 

24.24 96.96 
24.24 290.88 
24.24 290.88 
36.74 440.88 
37.94 455.28 
42.34 127.02 
42.34 127.02 
47.32 141.96 
97.32 291.96 

104.65 313.95 
11 2.32 336.96 
11 5.32 345.96 

GildanlFruit of the Loom 
3,259.71 

14-30 
20 doz 

4.68 
FM Tube 

14-30 
12-24 ~ O Z  

2.52 
2.52 
2.52 
2.52 
2.52 
2.52 
2.52 
2.52 
2.52 
2.52 

FM 210M-0 

Partial Bid 
14 

4-6 doz 
26.29 
26.29 
26.29 
26.29 
'26.29 
26.29 
32.89 
32.89 
32.89 
32.89 
32.89 
32.89 

FM 

Carolina Textiles 
Unit Price Extension 

NIB 

Team Safety Appa 
Unit Price Extens 

NIB 

Bob Barker 
Unit Price Extension 

5-30 
12 dozen ? each? 

4.56 1,140.00 
Bob Barker 1700-W 

5-30 
1 pair 
3.20 307.20 
3.20 307.20 
3.20 307.20 
3.20 614.40 
3.20 691.20 
3.20 665.60 
3.20 307.20 
3.20 307.20 
3.20 307.20 
3.20 307.20 

Bob Barker 80601 
4,121.60 

No Bid 

Robinson Textiles 
Unit Price Extension 

NIB 

15-35 
? 

4.24 407.04 
4.24 407.04 
4.24 407.04 
4.24 814.08 
4.24 915.84 
4.24 881.92 
4.24 407.04 
4.24 407.04 
4.24 407.04 
4.24 407.04 

R. Textiles RTHCS 
5.461.12 

NIB 

Charmtex 
Unit Price Extension 

7-30 
20 dozen 

5.36 1,340.00 
Charmtex 

NIB 

Partial Bid 
7-2 1 

72 dozen 
28.36 1 13.44 
28.36 340.32 
28.36 340.32 
38.18 458.'16 
38.18 458.16 

NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 

Fruit of the Loom 
1.71 0.40 



eft slde 

Size L 
Size XL 
Size 2XL 
Size 3XL 
Size 4XL 
Size 5XL 
Size 6XL 
Size 7XL 
Size 8XL 
Size 9XL 
Size IOXL 
Subtotal 

17 Size Medium (red) 
Size L 
Size XL 
Size 2XL 
Size 3XL 
Size 4XL 
Size 5XL 
Size 6XL 
Size 7XL 
Size 8XL 
Size 9XL 
Size IOXL 
Subtotal 

18 Size Med (yellow) 
Size L 
Size XL 
Size 2XL 
Size 3XL 
Size 4XL 
Size 5XL 
Size 6XL 
Size 7XL 
Size 8XL 
Size 9XL 
Size IOXL 
Subtotal 
Category J Total 

Leslee Scott 
Unit Price Extension 

24.24 242.40 

Bob Barker 
Unit Price Extensior 

Charmtex 
Unit Price Extension 

28.36 283.60 
28.36 283.60 
28.36 964.24 
38.18 839.96 
38.18 381.80 

NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 

2,753.20 
28.36 397.04 
28.36 425.40 
28.36 425.4C 
38.98 763.6C 
38.18 114.54 

NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 

2,125.9E 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 

NIB I 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 

NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 

NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 



NIB 1 NIB 

NIB 

Carolina Textile! 
Unit Price Extens 

NIB 

NIB 

NIB 

NIB 

30 
per order Sold by d 

Industrial 
3.81 381 
3.81 571 
3.81 571 

1,524 

NIB 

NIB 

-Page 8 ( lef t  side) 

NIB 

NIB 

t e d  

19 

20 

21 

22 

23 

24 

25 

26 

NIB 

NIB 

Charmtex 
Unit Price Extension 

7-21 
12 

4.18 2,090.00 
Charmtex 

8.18 490.80 
7-30 

12 dozen 
Charmtex 

22.36 648.44 
7-30 

5 dozen 
Charmtex 

9.18 918.00 
7-30 

25 dozen 
Charmtex 

2,057.24 

30.90 6,180.00 
7-30 

2 each 
Charmtex 

10.90 2,180.00 
7-21 

24 each 
Charmtex MC 

8,360.00 

9.90 1,782.00 
7-21 

4 each 
Charmtex 

21-36 
5 dozen Sold by doz 

Charmtex 24x36 
4.241666 424.17 

4.015 602.25 
4.241666 636.25 

1,662.67 

Qty 

500 

Sheets, 
60 

29 

100 

Mattress 
200 

200 

180 

100 
150 
150 

Description 
Category K: Pillows 

Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Pillows 
Product Bid 

Category L: Pillow Case, 
Pillow Cases 
Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Product Bid 
Sheets 
Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Product Bid 
Towels 
Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Product Bid 
Category L Total 

Category M: Mattress & 
Mattresses 
Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Product Bid 
Mattress Covers 
Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Product Bid 
Category M Total 

Category N: Blankets 
Blankets 
Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Product Bid 

Category 0: Mesh Bags 
Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Product Bid 
Size 26x26, Red 
Size 26x26, White 
Size 26x26, Blue 
Category 0 Total 

NIB 

NIB 

Leslee Scott 
Unit Price Extension 

14-21 
12 each 

4.04 2,020.00 
CarpenterlPll8 

Towels 
8.47 508.20 
5-7 

10 dozen 
LSllPCWM 

23.97 695.13 
5-7 

5 dozen 
LSIISTWM54 

9.37 937.00 
5-7 

25 dozen 
LSlrrWSEO 

2,140.33 
Cover 

33.47 6,694.00 
21-30 

2 each 
PleasantlMTPY 

14.97 2,994.00 
21-30 

2 each 
PleasantlMTPY 

9,688.00 

9.18 1,652.40 
2 1 

25 each 
BosallBLNY 

30 
72 each (24x30 size) 

MEBAIHBD, Inc. (Alternate; 
4.03 403.00 
3.61 541.50 
4.03 604.50 

1,549.00 

Bob  Barker 
Unit Price Extension 

5-30 
4 each 

7.07 3,535.00 
Bob Barker MV2026 

7.90 474.00 
5-30 
12 dozen 
Bob Barker PC4234 

28.05 813.45 
5-30 
12 dozen 
Bob Barker SH5490N 

7.55 755.00 
5-30 
12 dozen 
Bob Barker BT425 

2,042.45 

35.80 7,160.00 
5-30 
1 each 
Bob Barker PJM 

12.10 2,420.00 
5-30 
1 each 
Bob Barker VMC 

9,580.00 

9.75 1,755.00 
5-30 
4 each 
West Point Home 

5-30 24x30 or 36 
12 dozen 
Bob Barker 

4.10 410.00 
2.94 441 .OO 
3.49 523.50 

1,374.50 



NIB 

Robinson Textiles - 
Unit Price Extension 

NIB 

? 
NIB 
NIB 
Subtotal 49,457.88 
7.25% Tax 3,585.70 
Freight 0.00 
Bid Total 53,043.58 
LVP 0.00 
Prompt Pay 0.00 
Ref. Price $53,043.58 

Team Safety Apparel 
Unit Price Extension 

NIB 

NIB 

None 
NIB 
NIB 
Subtotal 77,365.40 
7.25% Tax 5,608.99 
Freight 0.00 
Bid Total 82,974.39 

0.00 LVP 
Prompt Pa) 0.00 
Ref. Price $82,974.39 

Carolina Textiles 
Unit Price Extension 

NIB 

30 
per order 

11.04 397.44 
11.04 794.88 
11.04 1,059.84 
12.58 1,207.68 
14.22 1,023.84 
15.95 1,148.40 
16.28 781.44 
17.48 419.52 

Chatham 
6,833.04 

Case qty shown above 
NIB 
NIB 
Subtotal 2931 1.20 
7.25% Tax 2,139.56 
Freight 0.00 
Bid Total 31,650.76 
LVP 0.00 
Prompt Pa) 0.00 
Ref. Price $31,650.76 

Bob  Barker 
Unit Price Extension 

NIB 

NIB 

NIB 
Yes 
Subtotal 84,613.25 
7.25% Tax 6,134.46 
Freight 0.00 
Bid Total 90,747.71 
LVP 0.00 
Prompt Pay 0.00 
Ref. Price $90,747.71 

P a g e  9 (left s lde) Charmtex 
Unit Price Extension 

NIB 

7-30 
24 each 

9.90 356.40 
9.90 712.80 
9.90 950.40 
9.90 950.40 
9.90 712.80 
9.90 712.80 
9.90 475.20 
9.90 237.60 

Charmtex JKT-Coach 
5,108.40 

Case qty shown above 
No 
No 

Subtotal 103,174.67 
7.25% Tax 7,480.16 
Freight 0.00 
Bid Total 110,654.83 
LVP 0.00 
Prompt Pa) 0.00 
Ref. Price $110,654.83 

Qty 

12 
12 
12 
36 
36 
36 
36 
36 
12 
12 
12 

36 
72 
96 
96 
72 
72 
48 
24 

ten1 

27 

28 

(1) 

(2) 

Leslee Scott 
Unit Price Extension 

5-7 days 
72 pair 

16.91 202.92 
16.91 202.92 
16.91 202.92 
16.91 608.76 
16.91 608.76 
16.91 608.76 
16.91 608.76 
16.91 608.76 
16.91 202.92 
16.91 202.92 
16.91 202.92 

LSllBOQBRD 
4,261.32 

14 
24 each 

9.94 357.84 
9.94 71 5.68 
9.94 954.24 

11.94 1.146.24 
11.94 859.68 
11.94 859.68 
12.94 621.12 
12.94 310.56 

AuburnlJAWB 
5,825.04 

None 
No 
No 
Subtotal 11 7,737.63 
7.25% Tax 8,535.98 
Freight 0.00 
Bid Total 126,273.61 
LVP 0.00 
Prompt Pay 0.00 
Ref. Price $126,273.61 

Description 
Category P: Work Boots 

Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Work Boots 
Size 5 
Size 6 
Size 7 
Size 8 
Size 9 
Size 10 
Size 11 
Size 12 
Size 13 
Size 14 
Size 15 
Product Bid 
Category P Total 

Category Q: Windbreaker 
Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Windbreaker 
Size Med 
Size L 
Size XL 
Size 2XL 
Size 3XL 
Size 4XL 
Size 5XL 
Size 6XL 
Product Bid 
Category Q Total 

Minimum Order Requirements 
T-shirt Letter? 
Mattress Docs? 
Local Vendor Preference 
who file an LVP Affidavit 
close of the bid. 
Invoice Terms of less 
considered. 



Bid No. 961 1 
Title: Institutional Clothing & Bedding 
Due Date: 911 8106 
Page 1 (right side) 

Name of Firm l~roforma ~nesourcel LC Textiles l ~ c m e  Supply 

Invoice Term: 
Descriotion 

CitylState 
Telephone 

Fax Number 
FOB 

Delivery Time 
LVP Certified? 'I' 

egory A: V Neck Shi 
Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Shirt, Size L(orange) 
Size XL 
Size 2XL 
Size 3XL 
Size 4XL 
Size 5XL 
Size 6XL 
Size 7XL 
Size 8XL 
Size 9XL 
Size IOXL 
Product Bid 
Subtotal 
Shirt, Size Med(yello1 
Size L 
Size XL 
Size 2XL 
Size 3XL 
Size 4XL 
Size 5XL 
Size 6XL 
Size 7XL 
Size 8XL 
Size 9XL 
Size IOXL 
Subtotal 

Roseville, CA 
916-781 -9363 
916-781 -6844 
Destination 
Various see below 
Yes 

NIB 

Scottsdale, AZ 
480-368-9324 
480-368-9324 
Destination 
Various see below 
No 

30 days 
48.00 
4.00 
4.00 
4.00 
4.24 
4.45 
4.45 
4.65 
4.65 
4.90 
5.20 
5.75 

LCT 523 

Port washirigion, NY 
800-567-8025 
800-567-8026 
Destination 
Various see below 
No 

Net 30 
Unit Price Extension 

Attachment A 

Net 30 
Unit Price Extensior 

NIB 

Bruxton C. Clothing 
K~llngworth, CT 
508-539-381 6 
508-539-4876 
Dest~nation 
Var~ous see below 
No 
Net 30 

Unit Price Extenston 
NIB 

Murray & Company 
Charlotte, NC 
704-333-5274 
704-332-7263 
Destinatron 
Var~ous see below 
No 
Net 30 

Unrt Price Extenston 
NIB 

BTWW Retail 
C~trus He~ghts, CA 
9 1 3  6-729-661 
91 6-729-6461 
Dest~nat~on 
Var~ous see below 
No 
2%10, Net 30 

Untt Prtce Extenston 
NIB 

Jinadasa 
New York, NY 
21 2-579-0868 
21 2-877-1 946 
Destination 
Various see below 
No 
1 % I  5, Net 30 

Untt Price Extensrc 
NIB 





P a g e  3 ( r ~ g h t  s lde)  
t e d  Description 
6 !Pants, Size Med(red) 

7 

Size L 
Size XL 
Size 2XL 
Size 3XL 
Size 4XL 
Size 5XL 
Size 6XL 
Size 7XL 
Size 8XL 
Size 9XL 
Size 1OXL 
Subtotal 
Category A Total 

Category B: Sweat Shir 
Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Size Med (blue) 
Size L 
Size XL 
Size 2XL 
Size 3XL 
Size 4XL 
Size 5XL 
Size 6XL 
Size 7XL 
Size 8XL 
Size 9XL 
Size lOXL 
Product Bid 
Category B Total 

Acme Supply 
Unit Price Extensio~ Qty 

200 
200 
200 
200 
200 
200 
200 
36 
36 
36 
36 
36 

; 

18 
18 
18 
18 
18 
2 
2 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 

BTWW Retail 
Unit Price Extensior 

Partial Bid 
10-14 

1 dozen 
81 .OO 1,458.00 
81 .OO 1,458.00 
81 .OO 1,458.00 
93.00 1,674.00 
93.00 1,674.00 

NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 

Fruit of the Loom 
7,722.00 

NIB 

Proforma Onesource 
Unit Price Extension 

Partial bid 
5 

3 dozen 
48.80 878.40 
48.80 878.40 
48.80 878.40 
62.56 1,126.08 
71.04 1,278.72 

NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 

Fruit of the Loom 
5,040.00 

30 
6 dozen 

50.60 
50.60 
50.60 

' 66.00 
67.00 

107.00 
114.00 
121.00 
129.00 
138.00 
145.00 
155.00 

Gildan G800 

Jinadasa 
Unit Price Exte 

LC Textiles 
Unit Price Extension 

4.89 978.00 

NIB 

4.89 978.00 
4.89 978.00 
4.89 978.00 
4.99 998.00 
4.99 998.00 
5.10 1,020.00 
5.24 188.64 
5.70 205.20 
6.00 216.00 
6.00 216.00 
6.25 225.00 

7,978.84 
39,893.76 

30 days 
48 (will sell partial case) 

60.00 1,080.00 
60.00 1,080.00 
60.00 1,080.00 
72.00 1,296.00 
72.00 1,296.00 
86.00 172.00 
89.00 178.00 
89.00 89.00 

1 17.00 11 7.00 
124.00 124.00 
140.00 140.00 
152.00 152.00 

LCT 700-0 
6,804.00 

NIB 



Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 

14 60 
2 dozen 1 24 ea 

8 

9 

Acme Supply I Bruxton C. Clothing 
Unit Price ~xtensionl Unit Price Extension 

11.6993 1,169.93 
1 1.6993 1,169.93 
1 1.6993 1,169.93 
11.6993 1,169.93 
11.6993 2,339.86 
11.6993 584.97 
1 1.6993 1,169.93 
1 1.6993 1,169.93 
11.6993 467.97 
11.6993 1,169.93 
11.6993 1,169.93 
11.6993 467.97 
11.6993 1 , I  69.93 
11.6993 1,169.93 
1 1.6993 350.98 
11.6993 233.99 
11.6993 233.99 
12.8758 257.52 
12.8758 257.52 

Dickies 9393NB 
16,894.05 

Partial Bid 
5 

3 dozen 
9.90 990.00 
9.90 990.00 

11.87 1 , I  87.00 
11.87 1,187.00 
11.87 1,187.00 
11.87 142.44 
13.86 166.32 

NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 

Cornerstone 
5,849.76 

Blue Jeans 32x32 
Blue Jeans 32x34 
Blue Jeans 32x36 
Blue Jeans 34x32 
Blue Jeans 34x34 
Blue Jeans 34x36 
Blue Jeans 36x32 
Blue Jeans 36x34 
Blue Jeans 36x36 
Blue Jeans 38x32 
Blue Jeans 38x34 
Blue Jeans 38x36 
Blue Jeans 40x32 
Blue Jeans 40x34 
Blue Jeans 40x36 
Blue Jeans 42x32 
Blue Jeans 42x34 
Blue Jeans 44x32 
Blue Jeans 44x34 
Product Bid 
Category C Total 

Category D: Work Shirts 
Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Size L (light blue) 
Size XL 
Size 2XL 
Size 3XL 
Size 4XL 
Size 5XL 
Size 6XL 
Size 7XL 
Size 8XL 
Size 9XL 
Size 1 OXL 
Product Bid 
Category D Total 

NIB 

30 
? 

9.00 
9.00 
9.00 
9.00 
9.00 
9.00 

15.00 
15.00 
25.00 
25.00 
25.00 

Acme 36242 

7.24 
7.24 
7.24 
7.24 
7.24 
7.24 
7.24 
7.24 
7.24 
7.24 
7.24 
7.24 
7.24 
7.24 
7.24 
7.24 
7.24 
7.24 
7.24 

LCT 60125 

14 
24 ea 
7.1 1 
7.1 1 
8.27 
8.27 
8.27 
8.27 
8.40 

12.94 
12.94 
12.94 
12.94 

LCT 501 

100 
100 
100 
100 
200 
50 
100 
100 
40 
100 
100 
40 
100 
100 
30 
20 
20 
20 
20 

100 
100 
100 
100 
100 
12 
12 
12 
12 
12 
12 

10-14 
1 each 

15.00 1,500.00 
15.00 1,500.00 
15.00 1,500.00 
15.00 1,500.00 
15.00 3,000.00 
15.00 750.00 
15.00 1,500.00 
15.00 1,500.00 
15.00 600.00 
15.00 1,500.00 
15.00 1,500.00 
15.00 600.00 
15.00 1,500.00 
15.00 1,500.00 
15.00 450.00 
15.00 300.00 
15.00 300.00 
17.00 340.00 
17.00 340.00 

Dickies 9393NB 
21,680.00 

30 
6 each 

900.00 
900.00 
900.00 
900.00 
900.00 
108.00 
180.00 
180.00 
300.00 
300.00 
300.00 

5,868.00 

20 
24 each 

7-1 0 
1 each 
10.00 1,000.00 
10.00 1,000.00 
10.00 1,000.00 
10.00 1,000.00 
10.00 1,000.00 
20.00 240.00 
20.00 240.00 
20.00 240.00 
20.00 240.00 
20.00 240.0C 
20.00 240.0C 

Bruxton 8618MN 
6,440.0C 

10.25 1,025.00 1 1 .90 1 , I  90.00 
10.25 1,025.00 1 1.90 1 , I  90.00 
10.25 1,025.00 11.90 1,190.00 
10.25 1,025.00 11.90 1,190.00 
10.25 2,050.00 11.90 2,380.00 
10.25 512.50 11.90 595.00 
10.25 1,025.00 11 .SO 1,190.00 
10.25 1,025.00 11 .90 1,190.00 
10.25 410.00 11.90 476.00 
10.25 1,025.00 1 1 .SO 1 , I  90.00 
10.25 1,025.00 11.90 1,190.00 
10.25 410.00 11.90 476.00 
10.25 1,025.00 11.90 1,190.0C 
10.25 1,025.00 11.90 1 , I  90.00 
10.25 307.50 11.90 357.06 
10.25 205.00 11.90 238.0C 
10.25 205.00 11.90 238.00 
12.75 255.00 11.90 238.00 
12.75 255.00 11.90 238.00 

Dickies 9393NB Dickies 9393NB 
14.860.00 17.1 36.0C 

NIB NIB 



J~nadasa 
Unit Price Extension 

NIB 

15 
20 dozen 

5.98 119.60 
5.98 143.52 
5.98 143.52 
5.98 143.52 
6.88 247.68 
6.88 165.12 
8.39 83.90 
8.39 83.90 

KOKA 1100 
1,130.76 

15 
20 dozen 

19.97 299.55 
19.97 239.64 
19.97 299.55 
20.97 251.64 
20.97 251.64 
20.97 83.88 
22.97 45.94 
22.97 45.94 

KOKA 2000 
1,517.78 

BTWW Retail 
Unit Price Extension 

NIB 

NIB 

NIB 

Page 5 (right slde) I 
tenj 

10 

11 

12 

Proforma Onesource 
Unit Price Extension 

14 
12 dozen 

15.00 1,200.00 
15.00 1,500.00 
15.00 1,770.00 
15.00 1,380.00 
15.00 300.00 
15.00 330.00 
18.75 18.75 
18.75 18.75 
21.25 21.25 
21.25 21.25 
25.00 25.00 
25.00 25.00 

Uniforms Mfg. 
6,610.00 

Partial Bid 
? 
? 

13.20 264.00 
13.20 316.80 
13.20 316.80 
13.20 316.80 
13.20 475.20 
13.20 316.80 

NIB 
NIB 

Fruit of the Loom 
2,006.40 

NIB 

Acme Supply 
Unit Price Extension 

NIB 

NIB 

NIB 

LC Textiles 
Unit Price Extension 

30 
144 ea 

10.80 864.00 
10.80 1,080.00 
10.80 1,274.40 
10.80 993.60 
10.80 216.00 
10.80 237.60 
12.00 12.00 
12.00 12.00 
12.00 12.00 
14.00 14.00 
15.00 15.00 
18.00 18.00 

LCT 330-1 
4,748.60 

30 
240 ea 

11.90 238.00 
11.90 285.60 
11.90 285.60 
11.90 285.60 
11.90 428.40 
11.90 285.60 
15.00 150.00 
18.00 180.00 

LCT FLD22030 
2,138.80 

30 
24 ea 
21.90 328.50 
21.90 262.80 
21.90 328.50 
21.90 262.80 
23.30 279.60 
23.30 93.20 
23.30 46.60 
25.00 50.00 

LCT 340-1 2 
1,652.00 

Description 
Category E: Men's Boxers 

Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 

Boxers, Med 
Size L 
Size XL 
Size 2XL 
Size 3XL 
Size 4XL 
Size 5XL 
Size 6XL 
Size 7XL 
Size 8XL 
Size 9XL 
Size lOXL 
Product Bid 
Category E Total 

Category F: Women 
Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Size 5 
Size 6 
Size 7 
Size 8 
Size 9 
Size 10 
Size 11 
Size 12 
Product Bid 
Category F Total 

Category G: Sports Bras 
Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Size 34 
Size 36 
Size 38 
Size 40 
Size 42 
Size 46 
Size 48 
Size 50 
Product Bid 
Category G Total 

( Qty 

80 
100 
118 
92 
20 
22 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 
1 

Underwear 

20 
24 
24 
24 
36 
24 
10 
10 

15 
12 
15 
12 
12 
4 
2 
2 

Bruxton C. Clothing 
Unit Price Extension 

NIB 

NIB 

NIB 

Murray & Company 
Unit Price Extension 
Partial Bid 

30 
15 dozen 

15.00 1,200.00 
15.00 1,500.00 
15.00 1,770.00 
20.50 1,886.00 
20.50 410.00 
22.50 495.00 
25.50 25.50 
35.00 35.00 

NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 

Else BXR 
7,321.50 

30.00 
12 dozen 

13.50 270.00 
13.50 324.00 
13.50 324.00 
13.50 324.00 
13.50 486.00 
13.50 324.00 
17.50 175.00 
17.50 175.00 

FOL D22030 
2,402.00 

30 
15 dozen 

24.00 360.00 
24.00 288.00 
24.00 360.00 
27.00 324.00 
27.00 324.00 
27.00 108.00 
30.00 60.00 
30.00 60.00 

New Age 15 
1,884.00 



NIB 
I 

Partial Bid 
5 

3 dozen 
29.28 
29.28 
29.28 
50.24 
55.36 

NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 

Hanes 5170 

h?-N.? Supply 
Unit Price Extension 

Page 6 (right slde) I I Proforma Onesource 
ted Description 1 Qty 1 Unit Price Extension 
Category H: Men's Tube Socks NIB 

30 
120 pair 

5.40 
LCT 5001 -22 

LC Textiles 
Unit Price Extension 

250 

96 
96 
96 
192 
216 
208 
96 
96 
96 
96 

4 
12 
12 
12 
12 
3 
3 
3 
3 
3 
3 
3 

13 

14 

15 

45 
24 ea 
2.53 
2.53 
2.53 
2.53 
2.53 
2.53 
2.53 
2.53 
2.53 
2.53 

LCT 4880 

Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Men's Tube Socks 
Product Bid 

Category I: Deck Shoes 
Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Size 6 
Size 7 
Size 8 
Size 9 
Size 10 
Size 11 
Size 12 
Size 13 
Size 14 
Size 15 
Product Bid 
Category I Total 

Category J: Men's T-shirts 
Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Size Med (orange) 
Size L 
Size XL 
Size 2XL 
Size 3XL 
Size 4XL 
Size 5XL 
Size 6XL 
Size 7XL 
Size 8XL 
Size 9XL 
Size 10XL 
Product Bid 
Subtotal 

117.12 
351.36 
351.36 
602.88 
664.32 

2,087.04 

NIB 

1,350.00 

45 
24 dz 
24.39 
24.39 
24.39 
32.00 
36.00 
36.00 
37.00 
39.00 
42.00 
45.00 
47.00 
50.00 

LCT 321-2 

Bruxton C. Clothing 
Unit Price Extensior 

5 
20 dozen 

5.00 1,250.00 

NIB 

NIB 

NIB 

Murrav & C o m ~ a n v  . . 
Unit Price Extension 

30 
20 dozen 

5.50 1,375.00 
Murray 161 50 

NIB 

30 
6 dozen 

24.00 
24.00 
24.00 
37.50 
39.50 
58.00 
62.00 
66.00 
70.00 
74.00 
78.00 
82.00 

Gildan G800 

BTWW Retail 
Unit Price Extensior 

NIB 

NIB 

NIB 

J~nadasa  
Unit Price Extensior 

NIB 

NIB 

NIB 



Page / (nght slde 

16 Size Med (blue) 

7 

Qty 
10 
10 
34 
22 
10 
3 
3 
3 
3 
3 
3 
3 

14 
15 
15 
20 
3 
3 
3 
3 
3 
3 
3 
3 

6 
6 
6 
20 
3 
3 
3 
3 
3 
3 
3 
3 

17 

18 

Size L 
Size XL 
Size 2XL 
Size 3XL 
Size 4XL 
Size 5XL 
Size 6XL 
Size 7XL 
Size 8XL 
Size 9XL 
Size 10XL 
Subtotal 
Size Medium (red) 
Size L 
Size XL 
Size 2XL 
Size 3XL 
Size 4XL 
Size 5XL 
Size 6XL 
Size 7XL 
Size 8XL 
Size 9XL 
Size I OXL 
Subtotal 
Size Med (yellow) 
Size L 
Size XL 
Size 2XL 
Size 3XL 
Size 4XL 
Size 5XL 
Size 6XL 
Size 7XL 
Size 8XL 
Size 9XL 
Size 1 OXL 
Subtotal 
Category J Total 

29.28 292.80 
29.28 995.52 
50.24 1,105.28 
55.36 553.60 

NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 

3,240.00 
29.28 409.92 
29.28 439.20 
29.28 439.20 
50.24 1,004.80 
55.36 166.08 

NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 

2,459.20 
29.28 175.68 
29.28 175.68 
29.28 175.68 
50.24 1,004.80 
55.36 166.08 

NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 
NIB 

1,697.92 
9,484.16 

Proforma Onesource 
Unit Price Extension 

29.28 292.80 

Jinadasa 
Unit Price Extensior 

Murray (L Company - LC Textiles 
Unit Price Extension 

26.00 260.00 
Unit Price Extension 

24.00 240.00 

Acme Supply 
Unit Price Extensior Unit Price Extension 





J~nadasa 
Unit Price Extension, 

NIB 

NIB 

? 
NIB 
NIB 
Subtotal 2,648.54 
7.25% Tax 192.02 
Freight 0.00 
Bid Total 2,840.56 
Lv? 0.00 
Prompt Pay 0.00 
Ref. Price $2,840.56 

P a g e  9 ( r i gh t  s ide) 

Qty 

12 
12 
12 
36 
36 
36 
36 
36 
12 
12 
12 

36 
72 
96 
96 
72 
72 
48 
24 

t enj 

27 

28 

(1) 

(2) 

Description 
Category P: Work Boots 

Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Work Boots 
Size 5 
Size 6 
Size 7 
Size 8 
Size 9 
Size 10 
Size 11 
Size 12 
Size 13 
Size 14 
Size 15 

Product Bid 
Category P Total 

Category Q: Windbreaker 
Delivery within (days) 
Quantity per case 
Windbreaker 
Size Med 
Size L 
Size XL 
Size 2XL 
Size 3XL 
Size 4XL 
Size 5XL 
Size 6XL 
Product Bid 
Category Q Total 
Minimum Order Requiremer 
T-shirt Letter? 
Mattress Docs? 
Local Vendor 
who file an LVP Affidavit 
close of the bid. 
Invoice Terms of less 
cons~dered. 

Proforma Onesource 
Unit Price Extension 

NIB 

5 
36 each 

12.4875 449.55 
12.4875 899.10 
12.4875 1,198.80 
13.7375 1,318.80 
16.2375 1,169.10 
17.4875 1,259.10 
19.9875 959.40 
21.2375 509.70 

Sanmar Sport Tek JP71 
7,763.55 

? 
Yes 

NIB 
Subtotal 55,500.92 
7.25% Tax 4,023.82 
Freight 0.00 
Bid Total 59,524.74 
LVP 2,976.24 
Prompt Pal 0.00 
Ref. Price $59,524.74 

LC Textiles 
Unit Price Extension 

NIB 

21 days 
42.00 

10.00 360.00 
10.00 720.00 
10.00 960.00 
12.00 1,152.00 
12.00 864.00 
12.00 864.00 
17.00 816.00 
17.00 408.00 

LCT 30-4 
6,144.00 

$100.00 
No 

NIB 
Subtotal 96,980.65 
7.25% Tax 7,031 . I 0  
Freight 0.00 
Bid Total 104,011.75 
LVP 0.00 
Prompt Pay 0.00 
Ref. Price $104,011.75 

BTWW Retail 
Unit Price Extension 

NIB 

14 
no minimum 

12.25 441.00 
12.25 882.00 
12.25 1,176.00 
13.25 1,272.00 
14.25 1,026.00 
15.25 1,098.00 
17.25 828.00 
18.75 450.00 

Sport Tek JP71 
7,173.00 

None 
NIB 
NIB 
Subtotal 24,309.00 
7.25% Tax 1,762.40 
Freight 0.00 
Bid Total 26,071.40 

0.00 LVP 
Prompt Pa) 0.00 
Ref. Price $26,071.40 

Acme Supply 
Unit Price Extension 

NIB 

NIB 

? 
No 

NIB 
Subtotal 13,713.00 
7.25% Tax 994.19 
Freight 0.00 
Bid Total 14,707.19 
LvP 0.00 
Prompt Pa: 0.00 
Ref. Price $14,707.19 

Bruxton C. Clothing 
Unit Price Extension 

NIB 

NIB 

12 ea on custom sizes 
NIB 
NIB 
Subtotal 35,842.00 
7.25% Tax 2,598.55 
Freight 0.00 
Bid Total 38,440.55 
LvP 0.00 
Prompt Pay 0.00 
Ref. Price $38,440.55 

Murray & Company 
Unit Price Extension 

NIB 

NIB 

250.00 
Yes 

NIB 
Subtotal 47,375.90 
7.25% Tax 3,434.75 
Freight 0.00 
Bid Total 50,810.65 
LvP 0.00 
Prompt Pa) 0.00 
Ref. Price $50,810.65 



Bid No. 961 1 - Institutional Clothing Bid Cost Award Analysis Attachment B 

Category I Description 
A (V Neck Shirt & Pants 

Award to 
Leslee Scott 

B 
C 
D 
E 
F 
G 
H 
I 
J 
K 
L 
M 
N 
0 
P 
Q 
0 

Murray & Company 
LC Textiles 
LC Textiles 
LC Textiles 

Jindasa 
Jindasa 

Bob Barker 
Carolina Textiles 

LC Textiles 
Leslee Scott 
Bob Barker 
Charmtex 

Leslee Scott 
LC Textiles 
Leslee Scott 
Charmtex 

Sweatshirts 
Blue Jeans 
Work Shirts 
Boxer Shorts 
Women's Underwear 
Sports Bras 
Tube Socks 
Deck Shoes 
T Shirts 
Pillows 
Pillow Cases, Sheets, Towels 
Mattress & Cover 
Blankets 
Mesh Bags 
Work Boots 
Windbreaker 

# of Categories 
as Low Bidder 

4 
1 
5 

2 

2 
1 

2 

Reducing # of Contracts 
I Bidder 

Leslee Scott 
B 

F 

Carolina 

Aggregate Total 
Dollars 

$46,736.12 

G 

H 
L 

Leslee Scott 
Carolina 

Next Lowest 

Murray & Company 
LC Textiles 
Jindasa 

Carolina 
Charmtex 

$6,256.40 
$33,120.28 
$1,130.76 

Jindasa 
Total 

Bob Barker 
Bob Barker 

Total 
Carolina Textiles 

I Charmtex 1 $13.468.40 1 

$1,517.78 
$2,648.54 
$1,140.00 
$2,042.45 
$3,182.45 
$3,245.76 

Bid Subtotal 
$38,802.40 
$6,256.40 

$1 0,425.60 
$4,724.16 
$4,748.60 
$1,130.76 
$1,517.78 
$1,140.00 
$3,245.76 
$1 1,921.92 
$2,020.00 
$2,042.45 
$8,360.00 
$1,652.40 
$1,300.00 
$4,261.32 
$5,108.40 

L 

3 

I I Carolina Textiles $12,310.57 
LC Textiles 1 $33.120.28 I : I 

Percentage 
44.039% 

Revised 

t Bidder 
Leslee Scott 

Aggregate Total 
Dollars 

$47,971.20 

Charmtex 
Total 

Total Requisition Amnt. 

Leslee Scott 

I Carolina Textiles 
LC Textiles 

1 - the bid subtotal for all low bidders by category. Attachment A indicates that the apparent low bidders for 
categories D & E provided inferior quality samples. The next low bidder in those cases are shown in graph 1 above. 
2 - shows that there is a preliminary number of 7 possible contract awards. This graph shows that if the number of 
awards is reduced to 4, there will only be an aggregate increase of $259.74. In some cases, the increased amount 
per category is less than $1 5. This decision was made to reduce the amount of additional work required to 
manage 7 contracts. 
3 -translates the bid category subtotals to the actual budgeted amount by the Sheriff. 

Charmtex 
Bid Award Aggregate 

$15,525.64 
$108,927.69 
$75,500.00 

Bid Award Amnt. 
$33,250 
$8,533 
$22,956 

Notes: There are 17 total categories in the bid. The graphs above document: 

$10,761 
$75,500 

14.253% 
100% 

Percentage 
44.039% 
11.302% 
30.406% 

Categories 
A, F, K, N, P 

B, G, H, I 
C, D, E, J, 0 

14.253% 
100% 

L, M, (2 I 
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