Second Reading

COUNTY OF PLACER
Coimmunity Development Resource Agen@ ;..»d FEE
John Marin, Agency Director d‘z?{ﬂUlLDlNG
‘ . ABST Martino

“oard o Superd tears

e

MEMORANDUM
TO: Honorable Board of Supervisors
FROM: Bob Martino. Chief Building Official

Building Department
DATE: Cctober 23, 2007

SUBJECT: Placer County Adaption of the 2007 California Bullding Cades along with Local
Amendments and Re-Adoption of the Building Department Fee Schedule.

e

ACTION REQUESTED:
The Building Department of Placer County respectfully requests your Board,

1) Adopt a resolution adopting express findings pursuant to Health and Safety Code Section
17958.5 authorizing local modifications to the California Building Standards Code (Exhibit A); 2}
Adopt an ordinance adepting the 2007 California Building Code, amending Article 15.04 of the
Flacer County Code in its entirety (Exhibit B); and 3) Adopt a resolution re-adopting the Building
Department Fee Schedule (Exhibit C).

BACKGROUND:

On January 1, 2008 Placer County will be mandated to enforce the 2007 Califernia Building
Standards Codes, based on the 2006 Edition of the International Building Code, by default
without local amendments, unless such amendments are specifically adopted by the governing
board. In order to seamlessly transition Placer County's existing Jocal amendments into the
new California Codes they must be specifically adopted by the jurisdiction with an effective
date by, or prior {0, the States enforcement date. The July 1, 2007 publication of the California
Codes set in motion the 180 day locail adoption cycle. Within this cycle state law permits the
locai adoption of the State Building Code, with local amendments. However, State law requires
these amendments be based on local climatic, topcgraphic, or geographic conditions of the
jurisdiction, and which are necessary for the preservation of the pubiic health, safety, and
welfare due to its unique circumstances. The attached resolution identifies those findings n
support of Placer County jocal amendments, such as the agricultural building exemption,
higher fire resistive roofing matenal, snow load factors, and local fire sprinkler reguirements,
based on Placer County's unigue local climate, geography, and topography.

In addition, in June of 2007 the Placer County Grand Jury released their 2006-2007 report.
included in that report were further recommendations, based on their findings of a review of
the Building Departrment, which focused on the development and utilization of a fee structure
that would provide automated permit fee calculation within the Placer County Land Use
System {(PLUS).

Blpser ...:@mef Building Official

84



Consistent with the recommendations of the Grand Jury's report the Building Depariment
moved forward with creating a separate fee schedule pulled from the ordinance. This included
a revised fee structure that would more smoothiy integrate within the PLUS system and
provide a mechanisim to meet that recommendation. Although the structure and method of
calculating fees has been changed, this does not result in an increase in the current rates.

The building department levies a combination of fees based on building valuation, hourly rates,
and flat rates 1o perform their services. A fee study was performed in 2002-2003, and as a
result, a fee adjustment proposed by then Building Official Ed Jenkins, established the current
hourly and valuation table rates, and was approved by the Board of Supervisors.

In April of 2007 the Board approved an increase in the valuation table rates and approved a
mechanism for annual adjustments based on the California Construction Cost Index {(CCCl)
which will be used to manage pericdic annual adjustments to the valuation table.

The proposed language and fee structure more clearly prescribes calculation of permit fees for
automation within PLUS and minimizes the discretionary nature of calculating the prescribed
fee amount, without an increase in building department fees.

FISCAL IMPACT:

Adoption of the Califorria Building Code with local amendments and a revised fee structure
would allow for maintaining the current level of service along with limiting the adverse affects to
general fund revenues.

Attachments:

1} Exhibit A — Resolution Adopting Findings {Health and Safety Code Section 17958.5)

2) Exhibit B - Ordinance adopting the 2007 CA Buiiding Code and amending Article 15.04
3) Exhibit C - Resolution re-adopting the Building Department Fee Schedule

4) Exhibit D - Placer County Building Department Building Valuation Data

5) Exhibit E - Building Permit Fee Comparison



Before the Board of Supervisors
County of Placer, State of California

In the matter of: Ord. No.:
FIRST READING; 10/23/07
AN ORDINANCE INCORPORATING THE SECOND READING:

CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE AMENDING

ARTICLE 15.04 OF THE PLACER COUNTY

CODE IN ITS ENTIRETY

The following Ordinance was duly passed by the Board of Supervisors of the County of

Placer at a regular meeting held ; by the following vote on

roil call:
Ayes:
Noes:
Absent:

Signed and approved by me after its passage.

Chairman, Board of Supervisors
Altest:

Clerk of said Board

Ann Holman

THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS CF THE COUNTY OF PLACER, STATE OF CALIFORNIA,
DOES HEREBY QORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Article 15.04 of the Placer County Code is hereby amended and
reinstated in its entirety as described on attached Exhibit A.

This ordinance shall be effective January 1, 2008

91



Article 15.04

BUILDING AND CONSTRUCTION CODES ADOFTED*

Sections:
15.04.010) Adoption.
15.04.020 Waiver of fees.
15.04.030 Compliance by special districts.
15.0d.040 Adoption and authorization for amendmentis to ihe uniform fire code.
15.04.050 Construction-—Buildings.
15.(4.060 Building permits during construction of subdivision improvements.
15.04,070 Building permits on agricultural property.
15,04.080 Electrical,
15.04.090 Uniform Mechanical Code,
15.04.100 Additions and amendments to the Uniform Flombing Code.*
15.04.110 Generally.

*  The 1958 Edition of the Uniform Building Code (17D was adapted 5-1%9-59 by Urdinance 435-B For other provisions see Ordipances 433-B, 459-B,
165-B, 48%-B

The 1958 Edition of the Uniform Building Code {UBC) was replaced on %-16-63 by the 1364 Edmion UBC wath Crdinance 68%-F For uther
provigions sec Ordinances 337-B, S4RD, 559-B, 565-1, 571-B, 624-B, 669-8

The 1564 Eduion of the Uniform Building Code {UBC) was replaced an 101 9-67 by the 1967 Editon UBC with Ordmance 963-B For other provi-
sions soe Uhidimances 870-8, 974-B, 1061-B, 1266-1, 1249115 1303-B, 1354-8

The 1967 UBLC wak replaced on 11-06-7T0 by the 1970 UBL with Ordinance 1342-B For ather provisions see 1385-K, 1355-13, 1411-8, 14)7-B,
146801 14740 1492.1 1498.B, 155243 1545-B 1602- B

The 1974 UBC was replaced on §2-02-74 by the 1973 UBC with Ordinance 1624-B For other provisions see 1747-B, 174%-B, 1758.0, 1772.1,
1840.B, 12848-B, 1849-B, [862-B, 1381-B, 1384-B, 1887-B, 1306-B, 1947-8, 1915.0, 195}-B, B-1979

The 1973 UBC was replaced on 09-14-76 by the 1976 UBC with Ordinance 2055-B. For other provisions see 2121-B, 7122-B, 2139.B, 214%7-B,
2303-B, 2314-B, 2357-B, 2415-B, 2434-B, 2454-RB, 2486.B, M27-B, 2488.B, 74898, 2490-1, 2491-1. 2576-B. 2508-H, 2663-B

The 1976 LIBC way replaced ob 11-16-79 by the 1970 UBC with Ordinance 2664-B. For other provisions see 271318 2826-B, 2R87-B, J489-B,
29464-1, 29085, 2909.B, 3014-B, W167-B, 50808 3102-B, 3106-B, 3114-B_ 1120-B, 31154-B, 31&0-8, 31206.8, 3207.H, 32328, 3153-8, 3754-B,
3188-B, 3297-B, 3310-B, 3320-B, 3326-B, 3328-R, 3337-R, 13338-B, 3340-B, 3359-B, 3360-B, 1427-B, 33428, 3481-B, 15i7-B

The 1979 UBC was replaced on 06-15-85 by the 1982 UBC with Ordinance 3574-B For other provigions see 1579-0_ 162)-R, 3685-B. 36871,
AM0A.B, 3T00-R

The 1982 UBL wag reptaced on 12-04-86 by the 1985 CRO with (hdinance 3736-B For other provisions sec 3805-B, 1862, 3848-B, 38046-B,
55018, W06-B, $017-B, 19298, 1947-B, 4075-B, 4013-B

The 1585 UBC was replaced on 01-01-90 by the L1988 UBC with Ordinance 4114-B For other provasions see 4133-B 4186-R, 42228, 42301,
4285-R, 4312-B, 4353-B The 1988 B was replaced on 08-14-92 by the 1991 /B

The 1948 T/BL was replaced an §-14-92 by the 1991 UBLC, wiik Crdimance 4432-13
The 1991 UBC was replaced on 1-1-96 by the 1994 UGBC with Ordinance 4689.1.

The 1994 IR was replaced on July 1. 1999 by the 1997 LR, wath Ordinance $555-B.



15.04.018 Adoption,

Pursuant to authority of Government Code Section 50022 .1 et seq.. no less than one copy of each primary code and each
secondary code pertaining thereto, all certified to be true copies by the clerk of the board of supervisors, having been filed in
the office of the clerk of the board within the time required by law, the latest published editions of each of the following
codes, and all volumes thersof and amendments thereto, are, in accordance with the California Health and Safety Code,
adopted by reference and modified herein, inciuding Yaiferm Inter national Building Code Appendix Chapter 1 - _Ad-
mlmstratmn, AE]:_IQI‘IC]II B- Bea rd ﬂf Aggeals Gh&p%er—&%—@#me&[—[—enh-—} Appcndm C Gmun U— Agrlcultu ral Build-

g pa i : -Appendix 1 -

Patm Covers, and Appendix J - Gradlng
A International Building Code 2006 Badesn-Badine-zade—a097 edition as adopted in The California Building
Standards Code ( The 20042007 California Building Code), which adopts those standards with state agency modifi-

cations within the scope of their authoriky,

B. National Electrical Code 1009 2005 edition as adepted in The Caiifornia Building Standards Code (The 26812007
California Electric Code), which adopts those standards with state agency modifications within the scope of their

-authority, published by the National Fire Proiection Association, Uniform California Admimstrative Code, Prowvi-
sions for the National Electrical Code, 28088 2007 Edition, published by Intermational Code Council (LC7).

. Uniform Flumbing Code 2868 2006 edition as adopted in The California Building Standards Code, including ap-
pendices (The 20684 20T California Plumbing Code), which adopts those standards with state agency modifica-
tions within the scope of their authenty, published by the International Association of Flumbing and Mechanicai
Officials,

D Uniform Mechanical Code 2000 2006 edition as adopted in The California Building Standards Code including
appendices { The 20642007 California Mechanical Code), which adopts those standards with stale agency modifi-
catigns within the scope of their authority, published by the Intemational Asseciation of Plumbing and bechanical
Oificials (1APMO).

Ir.  Upiferm-Codefor Building ConservationApperdin-Ghapter+ International Existing Building Code 2006 as
adopted in The California Building Standards Code (The 2007 California Existing Building Code), which adopts
those standards with state agency modifications within the scope of their anthority and as limited by Health and
Safery Code 19160 et seq., published by ICBO1CC,

F. Yaerdess luternational Fire Code 2088 206 edition as adopted m The Califorma Bujlding Standards Code (The
2601 247 Calrfornia Fire Code), which adcpls those stapdards with siate agency modifications within the scope of
theur autherity, pubhshed by ICC !CC tha—“-ef-iem—l;}re—(:lﬂeﬁa—&%eem

G_ o 007 B 1 o o

lnternahona! Pmperty Mmmenauce lee 2006 Etlmnn pubhshed bw {GBG [CC as modlﬂed bv The Cahfor

nia Health and Safety Code, Title 25 of the Califoria Code of Regulations, and as further modified in Article
15.56.

H. The following codes and standards are adopted as reference documents and may be used by the chief butiding
offivial in accordance with Califormia Building Code Sections 104.10 2.7 and 104.11 2.8 in a case by case review
process:_Uniform Building Code 1397 edition, Uniform Swimming Pool Code, Spa & Hot Tub Code,
publisbed by IAPMO, publmhed supp]ememq tor the Driform Internationat Codes, The mtematmnal Residential
Code: and The Iniernation i § ratioRal-Code-Couneil-Ine~ The 2006
lnternational Fuel Gas Code, The Lrban Wlld]and ]nterfacc Cc:-dc pubhshed by the Imematmnal Fire Code
Instituie; The Uniform Sign Code, published by \CBO, IBC UBC Appendix Chapters; Un%m@ede&r—&uldmg
Coaservation, published by ICBO; Nalional Fire Protection Association Standards; the Uniform Sojar Eperpy
Code, as published by 1APMO, the-Guidelines for Solar Brergy- Installation, published-byJGBE; American Na-
tionzl Standard, published by American Nanonal Standards Instinute, Ing.; Masonry Firepiaces, Masonry Institule,
and other Nationally recognized Standards, (Ord. 5200-B (pan), 2002: Ord. 4959-B (part). 1999 prior code § 4.1)

43



15.04.028 Waiver of fees.

It 15 realized that in regard to certain parcels of land, and ownerships thereof, it may work a particuiar hardship for the
owner to conform to the fee requirernents of this article. For that reason, an owner may make a written application to the
board of supervisors for waiver of the fee provisions of this article. (Ord. 5200-B (part), 2002: prior code § 4.3)

15.04.030 Complianee by special districts,

Each special district within the county of Placer with an elected goveming board, including, but not litaited to, districts,
cemetery districts, recreation and park districts, utlity districts, and sabitary districts, shall comply with all California
Caiferm Industry Codes ay heretofore or hereafter adopted by ordinance of the Placer County board of supervisors;
provided however, that each such special district is at its option delegated full authority 1o enforce each such code for its
own projects without obtaining a permit from, paving fees to, or obtaining inspections by the building department of the
counry of Placer. Special districts which require that the county enforce the California Baiferm Industry Codes shall pay
the normal fees. {Ord, 5200-B {part), 2002: prior vode § 4.5)

15.04.040 Adoption and authorization for amendments 16 the International uniferm Fire Code.

Al International Ueiform Fire Code (HRE 1FC) as adopted above with approved amendments and appendix chapters.
exetudingappendin A B HEVB-and V: and all Siate Fire Marshal codes delegated to Jocal agencies, are to
be enforced b the Chief of each fire district, C5A, or as designated by contract, In the absence of the above. the
Office of Emergency Services shall act as the County Fire Marshal Where provisions in the B3 IFC conflict with
State statutesregulations or County ordinances, including bul not limited to the Placer County Land Development
Manual, the State statute/regulation or County ordinance shall govern.

2. Pursuant 1o State Health and Sajety Code Section 138697, all fire district amendments to the GREC TFC will be
valid after such amendments are first authorized by the fire district board and then approved by the board of supet-
VISOrs.

B, Section 34 103.1 of the BEG IFC Supplemenial rulesand repulations Depariment of Fire Prevention —
General, i1s amended toreadasfollows by adding:
The Chief of a fire departmentidisirict, with the written approval of the Board of Directors of the particular fire
deparmment is authorized to make and entorce such rules and regulations for the prevention and contral of fires and
fire hazards as may be necessary from time to time 1o carry out the intent of this Code. Three certified copies of
such ruies and regulations shall be filed with the Clerk of the jurisdiction and shall be in effect immediately thercaf-
ter. Pursuant to State Health and Safety Code Section 1386597, rules and regulations that involve building standards
will be valid when approved by the Board of Supervisors,

C.  Section +83-3-4 108 of the U¥C IFC, Board of Appeals, is amended asfollows by adding:
In arder 1o determine the suitability of altemate materials and type of construction and to provide for reascnable
imerpretation of the provisions of this code, there is hereby appeinted a board of appeals consisting of the board of
direciors of zach fire protecion distriet for marters within their jurisdiction and the Placer County Butlding Board
of Appeals in the remaining arcas of the County. The Chief shall be an ex-officta member of the Board and shall
act as secretary to the Board. The Board shall adopt reasonable rules and regulations for conducting its
myvestipations and shall render all decisions and findings in writing 1o the chief with a duplicate copy to the
appeliant and may recommend to the Executive Body such new legislation as is consistent therewith.

D, Appendix Chapter ! Section 18344 104.2 of the UG IFC, General Notice of Violation, is amended to read add
the following:
The Chief of any fire department/district within the county or his‘her authorized representatives shall have author-
ity to enforce this code and issue citations for violations in their respective jurisdiction.

E.  The {following is added to Article2-207-F Section 202 — Definitions of the YEC IFC:

M



(3.

Fire Hydrant skall mean a hydram supplied by a 6 inch or larger branch line, one o1 more pumper connection (44
inch) and 2 or more 234 inch outlets, capable of supply required fire flow for ai least 2 hours.

Section HH3-2.2 9032 of the BRC1FC, All occupancies except Group R, Division 3 and Group U Occupancies, is
amended to read, Where Required, add the following:

An approved awiomatic sprinkler svstem shali be installed where the occupancy building has 3,600 or more square
{eet of total floor area. except where other sections of the HEC IFC or the California Siate Fire Marshals repula-
tioms, andror local fire district ordinances applicable to a project are more resiriciive, then the more restrictive shall
apply. Where additions mcrease the tota) size of the binlding to 3,600 square feet or more, the additton and the
gxistmg occupancy building shall be provided with an approved antomatic sprinklier svsiem. Fire separation areas
shall not be nsed to reduce this regquirement.

Section HWH33-1 903.4 of the EEE IFC, Sprinkler System Monitoring and Alarms whereregquired; is amended
10 read:

All valves controlling the water supply for avlornatic sprinkler systems and water-flow swiiches on all sprinkler
systern 5 shall be electrically supervised. Valve supervision and water-fiow alarm and trouble signals shall be dis-
tinetly different and shall be avtomatically fransmiited to an approved central station,

EXCEPTION: Group R, Division 3 Occupancies will ondy be monitored if required by the local jurisdiction.
Section 4086214 907.2 of the BFE LEC, whes Where Required - new buildings and structures. is amended to
read:

All occupancies except Group R, Division 3 and Group U occupancies shall have an approved automatic fire alarm
system installed when the oceupancy/building has 1,500 square feet or inore of total floor area unless other sections
of the UEC IFC or Cahifornia State Fire Marshals regulations are more restrictive, then the more restrictive shall
apply. Fire alarms systems shall be in accordance with Section 1887 907 of the WG IFC or NFPA 72 (1999) it the
specific ccoupancy is not covered in the UEC IFC. Addiiionally. all A, E, H and T occupancies shall have an
automatic smoke’heat detection system installed in addition to any other svstemn(s) required by this code, when
required by the local autherity having jurisdiction. Where additions increase the tofal size of the building to 1,500
square feet or more, the addition and the existing eccupancy/building shall be provided with an approved automatic
smoke/heat detection system.

Section 7802224 3404.2.9.5,10f the BEC IFC: “Locations where above ground tanks are prohibited™ is amended
1o read:

Storage of Class [ and Class IT flammable liguids in aboveground tanks outside of buildings is prehibited unless
approved by (he Fire Chief having junisdiction, using standards pot less than the JEC [EC or recognized equiva-
lent.

Section 700441 3406.4 of the HFC IFC, Geperal Bulk Plants or Terminals, is amended to read;

Mo new bulk plam shall be constructed within the limits established by the Placer County zoning ordinance, as
limits of the districts i which such plants are prohibited. Where allowed portions of properties where flammable
atd combuastible liquids are received by tank vessel, pipelines, tank cars or tank vehicles and are stored ot blended
in bulk for the purpose of distributing such liquids by tank vessels, pipelines, tank cars, 1ank vehicles or containers
shall be n accordance with IFC Section 359464-4 3406.4

Section F083-4-1 3401.1 ol the BEC TFC, Geneoral Scope and Application, is amended by adding the fallowing:
It shalt be unlawful to store flammable liquids as defined in SestianG-388 Chapter 34 of the Hadform lnterna-
tional Fire Code including gasoline and other motor fuels, in above ground storapge containgrs, either pottable or
installed, in a BS, R, RA, RF F or AE zoned area on a parcel of less than ten {10) acres. In areas where above
ground storage is permitied, minimurmn distances from property lines and structures for atank of any type shall be
not lass than 50 feet. The limitations/prohibitions of this section shall also apply to areas in Squaw Valley desig-
nated as Low Density Residential {I.DR), High Density Residential (FIDR), Foresi-Recreation or Conservation
Preserve. In addition, the limitations/ prohibitions of this section shall apply to areas in the Lake Tahoe Basin
which arc designated as Tourist! Residential. Tourist, Residential, Recreation and Conservatior.

Any above ground storage must be approved, in writing. by an official of the appropriate fire protection depart-
ment/district. This section shall not be applicable 1o portable conlainers sunable for such storage of 5 gallons or
less.
Section 3841 2301 of the BFE IFC, Gencral, 15 amended by adding the following:




Tires: No person shall pile, cause to be piled, or maintain agy pile of tires {of any manufactured maierial) at a
height greater than ten {10] feet, except in approved horizontal storage racks, measured in all cases from the
ground level. Tires shall be neatly piled and in no case shal] any ene pile occupy more than two hundred (2060}
square feet of floor or lot area. An aisle of at least ten (10 feet shall be maintained at all times between the piles in
such a manner as to allew free access,

M. Appendix 1B C, Table AH-B—1 C105.1 of the BFC IFC, Number and distribution of fire hydrants, is amended

(o read:
TABLE A1 B-1 C 105.1
NUMBER AND DISTRIBUTEON OF FIRE HYDRANTS
FIRE-FLOW T T | MAXIMUM DISTANCE FROM ANY |
REQUIREMENT | AVERAGE SPACTNG BETWEEN | POINT ON §TREET OR RQAD i
{gpm) ' HYDRANTS Y (feet)’ | FRONTAGE TO A HYDRANT® |
MINIMUR NO. |
. X 385 for Limin. OF HYDRANTS - X 3048 for mm
[ 1,000- 1,750 2 [ ST E 250 |I
_2,000 - 2,250 2 ! 300 ! 225 1
2,500 3 300 225 :
L 3,000 i 3 300 225
3,500 - 4,000 4 300 216
4,500 - 5,000 5 300 180
| 5,500 6 L 0 1 130
6000 | & 20 150
£.500 - 7,000 , 7 250 — 150 :
L 7500 or mote | % or more’ 201} 12}y

T Beduce by 100 (et for dead-end streets or roads
Where streels are provided with median dividers which can be crossed by hrefighters pulling hose lines, or anerial steeets are provided wuth four or
more traffic fanes and have atraffic count of more than 30,000 vetncles per day, hydrant spacing shall average 500 feef (152 Am) on cach side of the

steeet and be arranged on an alternating basis up o a fre-Qow reguiceoent of 7 000 gallons per minute {26 4Y5L/min tand 400 fect {122 o) for ugher
fire-flow requirements.

shadl be provided ar not less than 1,000-foo (305m) spacing w provide for wransportalign hazards

oA da

Reduse by 50 feet (15 140 mien) {ur dead wnd steeets or roads
{me hvdrant for 2ach 1000 galluns per ke (3785 L'min ) ar faction thereal
Spacing may be increased to 300" Yor Single Famidy Diwelling Residential Sub-Divisions

{Ord. 5200-B (part), 2002: Ord. 4959-1 {part). 199%: prior code § 4.10)

n

Where gew waler mams are extended along streets where hy drants are nol needed for protechion of stiwciures o similar fire problems, fire hydrants

Ot



15.04.050 Construction—Buildings.

The following sections of the Internation sl Heifors Building Code are madified by the following additions and dele-

Uons:

A

Board of Appeals.

Appendix_Chapter 1 Section 112 365 - Board of Appeals,

(4}

{5

(6}

Created
There is hereby created w the County a Board of Appeals.

Composition: Appointment

The Board of Appeals shall consist of nine members, not officials of the county, who are qualified by experience
and training to pass vpen matters pertaining e building constructien. Two members of the board shall be
physically hapdicapped disabled persons and twe members shall be Fire Officials or Fire Marshals in the county,
The Chiet Building Official or his designee shali be an ex-officio non-voting meraber. The Board shall be ap-
pointed by the Chabrman of the Board of Supervisors with the approval of the Board of Supervisors.,

When Lepaily Constituted

The Board of Appeals shall be legalty constituted to have jurisdiction te proceed to act upon the appointment of
the members thereof as hereinabove stated and evidenced by an order of the Board of Supervisors duly entered
upon the Minutes of such Board.

Terms of Office: Removal of Members; Filling Vacancies

a. Non-handicapped disabled Members: The term of affice of each member shall be four {4} yvears and until the
first appointment and qualification of his successor. The first members of the Board shall classify themselves by
lot 5o that the terms of office of two (2) members is two {2 vears and of three (3} members four (4) vears, Any
member, even though hefshe serves for a term, may be removed by the appointment avihority without canse, A va-
cancy is filled only for the unexpired term,

b, Hendicapped Disabled and Fire Official members: The tenins of office of each bandicapped disabed member
and Fire Official member shall be four {4} vears and uriil the first appointment and qualification of his successor.
The first members representing each group shall classify themselves by lot so that the term of office of one mem-
ber 1s two {2} vears and of the other member four {47 years. Any member, even though heishe serves for a term,
may be removed by the appointing authority without cause. A vacancy is filled only for the unexpired term.

Compensation of Members, Traveling Expenses
All members of the Board shali serve without compensation. The members of the Board shall receive their actual
and necessary travel expenses to and from the place of meeting of the Board aud while traveling in conpection

with the business of the Board.

Powers and Duties

The Board of Appeals shal):



ll—t

a.  Hear and determine appeals from Code interpretations of the Chief Building Official or histher assignee. De-
termination of appeal by Board of Appeals is final.

b. Have the authority to determine the sutiability of, and authorize the substitution of, materials and types of
construction equipmeni to those specified by this Code and the State Housing Law on a project specific basis,
Detarmination of appeal by Board of Appeals is final.

c.  Actas an advisory bady 1 the Board of Supervisors on all marters pertaining 1o the construction industry.
d.  Promulgate rezsonable rules and regulations for conducting its hearings and mectings. Determination of
appeal by Board of Appeals is final.
{7 Applications to the Board of Appeals shall be made to the Building Deﬁartmcnt on forms provided by thern and

shall be accompanied by a non-refundable fee as required by this code. All appeals shall be filed within thirty 130)
days of the decision of the enforcement agency.

BE. Violations.

Appendix Chapter_1 Section 113 483 - Viclations, HBE IBC Section 1131 183 add:

Any person, firm, or corporation violating any of the provisions of this Cods shall be deemed gulry of a mis-
demeancr, {first offense may be handled as an infraction pursuant to Section 1.7 & 1.8 Chpt 1, Placer County
Code} and each such person shall be deemed guilty of a separate offense for each and every day or portion thereof
duripg which any viotation of any of the provisions of this Code is committed, continued, or permitted;and upon
comviction of any such violations such person shall be punishable by a fing of not more than $500.00 or by
impriscnment for not more than s1x (6) months, or by both such fine and imprisenment. (REF. Section 1.7, and
Section 1.8, Chapter 1. Placer County Code, for general penalty provisions.) Any punishmem under this section
does not waive any requirements for Code compliance.

C Work Not Requiring a Building Permit:

Appendix Chapter 1 Section 336 105 - Permits, Delete IBC section 105.1.1 and 105.1.2.

+  Exempred-Yeork: Work exempl from permit. Add HBE 1BC Section 145.2 406211214) 1o read as follows: (See
UBE IBC Section Hé-2 105.2 for paragraphs 1 through 4+ 13}

1z Agncultaral buildings or structures as defined in WBE IBC Section 202, onany property “zoned F, RF, AE, pr RA,

consisting of 10 or more acres™ or California Land Conservation properties, when such property and building(’s) are
primarily used for agricnltural purposes or when such buildings or structures are necessary 10 the agricultural de-
velepment or use of such property, are exempl from a building permit when they comply with this section. The
provisions of this section shall not include the owner's or lessee’s dwelling or private garage, ner any human habi-
tation which is heid out for rent or lease or sale. An owner or lessee of such properry may obtain the services ofthe
Building Department for buildings herein exempt, provided hesshe applies for a building permit and pays the fees
therefore. Al buildings exempted under this section shall s1ill be governed by the provision of the Placer County
Plumbing, and Electrical Codes. A setback verification permnit for a structure, not herein exempted, will be issued
for an agriculooral building in the above zonres upon presentation of an acceptable plot plan, (2 copies), a
departmental approvat form indicating Planning Department approval, and which may also require approval by
the Apricultural Commissioner, and payment of $36-080 the current prescribed recording and handiing fee.

9%



fin
T

D.

Second exit seasonal snow mnnels for dwellings which comply with Placer County Zoning requirements, are
temporary buildings and are exenpted from building permit requiremens.

Gantry cranes and sumilar equipment used in conjuncrion with a valid building permit and removed upon expiration
of the permit or completion of the work covered by the permit.

Radio and televisiom antennas which do not exceed 45 feet ip height and ground supported dish antennas not
exceeding 15 feet in height above finished grade in any position.

Sheds. self-contained portable offices, or storage buildings. and other stuctures incidental to and for work
authorized by a valid building permit. Such structures must be removed upon expiration of the permit or comple-
tion of the work covered by the permuit,

Ptayground equipment.

Wire fences not over 12 feet in height tor residential uses and other fences nol over six feet in height.

Repairs which invelve only the replacement of component parts or existing work with similar materials only for
the purpose of maintenance and which do not aggregate over £1,000 in valuation inany 1 2-month period and do
not affect any glectrical or mechanical nor more than 1wo squares of roofing.

Repairs exemp? from permit requirements aré minor and shall ot include any addition. changs or modificationin
use or in construction. The determination of the applicability of this exemption shall be within the discretion of the
Chief Buoilding Official.

Specifically exempt from permit requirements without limit to valuation are:

{a) Painting and decorating.

{b} Installalion of floor covering.

{c} Cabinet work.

Permtit Issuance.

Appendix Chapier 1 Seciion +06-4-—Pepmitsissuance 105,3 Applicaticn for Permit:

Add the following to UBE TBC Section 103.3.1, Action on Application 1641 -Issuance:

a.  Prior (o the issuance of any building permit, approval from the Fire District is required for fire code items
adopted by State law, Caunty Code or by the Fire District when approved by the Beard of Supervisors.
b.  Prior to issuence of any building permit. a certificate of compliance is required from school districts {except

where exempt by State law) and from fire districts where a capital facilities plan has been approved by the Board
of Supervisors.

Change HBC IBC Section 10614 1055, Expiration, 10 read as follows:
Unless otherwise authorized, every permit issued by the Building Official under the provisions of this Code shall
expire and hecome nulk and void two years from the date of issuance. The Chief Building Official may tssue a

permit for a lesser time period when necessary 10 abate dangerous or sub-standard conditions. This lesser time pe-
ried may he appealed by the owner. Any permitiee holding an unexpired pennit say-apply gualifies for one exten-

9



el

L

sion of a current (2 vear) permit for one year, Upon approval of the Building Official 2 second one-vear
extension may he granted. The fee for extension shall be-the-astimated-cesob-the-building codeonfarcoment
pecacsaR-to-complete-inspectionofthe-poermit. a5 prescribed in the Building Department Fee Schedule.

Before any work can be recommenced on an expired pennit, a new permit shail be obtained. The Codes in effectat
the time a new permit is issued shall be the Codes which apply to that permnit through the point of cornplation or
expiration, whichever occurs first.

All permits issued under the provisions of the Placer County permit allocation ordinance, Placer County Code,
Article 15.24, and those permits extended berween the dates of July 28, 1982, and the date of Ordinance 3681, will
expire concurrently with the expiration of their respective TRPA permit. All permit holders who desire 10 extend
their permits beyond August 1, 1986, must pay the prescribed fees listed below to cover the cost of administration,
inspection, and‘or plan check,

a. Permits wherein no work has begun and which were issued prior to August 1, 1985, the eurrent fee schedule
applies as well as a plan check fee and plan check; current codes also apply. Eighty {80} percent of the unused
portion of the fees paid may be applied to the extension.

b. Permits issued on or after August |, 1985, the codes in effect at the time of the last extension shall apply. A ffty
dollar ($50.00% administrative extension tee shall be paid, and a fee equal to the cost of completing all inspections
(forty dollars (540.00) per inspection trip) shall be paid.

¢. Permits issued prior to August 1, 1985, where one or more inspections have been made, the codes ineffect at the
time of last extension shall apply. A fifty dollar (350 00) administrative exiension fee plus a fee equal to the costof
completing all inspections (forty dollars ($40.00) per inspection trip) shall be paid.

d. Permits issued after the date of Ordinance 3681 shall have the same time frame constraints and expiranon dates
as those established by TRPA.

e. Building permits will not he issued until approvals have been obtained from all county departments.

Expiration of Permits. All active Placer County building permits, for single-family dwellings in the Lake Tahoe
basin, due to expire on Angust 1, 1986, for which a foundation has been constructed since Janvary 1, 1976, are ex-
lended to tunie periods consistent with the policies of the Tahoe Regional Planning Agency.

Such projects are required 10 he completed {to the polnt of having a final inspection) within the tune frames
stipalated by the Tahoe Regional Planning Agency.

E. Permit Fees.

Add to Appendix Chapter 1 Section 187 108.2 - Permit fees Schedule of Permijt Fees —ButdinpSaluation-

All bulding valuation 1ables shall be as derermined by the chief building official based npon the ICB(Y Building
Standards valuation data dated April 2002 and adjusted each lanuvary 31 according to the “State of California Depart-
ment of General Services California Construction Cost Index (CCCI)” or as authorized by applicable [aws. Valuations
not listed in the ICBO Building Standards Valuation Data shall be valued per the Bujlding Valuation Data Sup-

plemental. The Building Valuation Data Supplemental may be expanded administratively by the Chief Building
Official ip order to clarify or cover additional tvpes of work and situations. Fees based oo hourly rates shall be ad-

jusied by the chief building official each Jamwary 31st according to the State of California Department of Tndusnial
Relations “Consumer Price Index - California for A1l Urban Consumers (CPIY for the most recently available twelve
(12) tmonth reponting period. Any fees also may be modified from time to tune by resolution of the board of supervisors,
The chief building official shall maintain the current fee schedule; the chief building official shall make the current fee

100



chief building official shall maintain the cwrrent fee schedule; the chief building official shal! make the current fee
schedule available for public review upon request.

The_valuation to be used in computing the building permil fee shafl be the total valuation of all construction
work jor which the permit is issued, as well as all roofing, mechanicai, electrical, plumbing, heating, air

conditiening, elevators, fire extinpwishing systems, racking systems, and any other permanently installed
equipment affixed to the building or siructure.

Deiete Appendix Chapter [ Sectign 198.3 — Building Permit Valuations,

Amend Appendix Chapter 1 Section 108.2 — Schedule of Permit Fees. Add:

Ruilding Department Fees shall be as prescribed in the Building Department Fee Schedule,

F. Fze Table.
Section 103 108.2 - Parmi fees - Fee tables, Add:

Fee Tables 3-A & 3-8 shall be used for the calculation of fees gs prescribed in the Building Department Fee

Schedule




i

Broding 355 x Permit Cost

Total 1504

{1her Building Permit Fees.

A reinspection fees may be assessed for each inspection or reinspection when such portion of work for which
an inspection is called is not complete or when e¢orrections called for are not made. This section is not to be

interpreted as requiring retnspection fees the first time a job is rejected for failure to comply with the re-
guirements of this code, but as controlling the practice of calling for inspections before the job is ready for
such inspection,

Reinspection fees may be assessed when the inspection record card is not posted or otherwise available on
the work site, the approved plans are not available {o the inspector, for failure to provide access on the date
for which the inspection is requested, or for deviating from plans requiring the approval of the building olfi-
cial,

In instances where reinspection fees have been assessed, no additiopal inspection of the work will be per-
formed until the required fecs have been paid.

When services for inspection or plan review are provided 10 the Counry by a consultant, the rate the applicant shall
be responsible to pay will be as determined by the conrractual agreement between the county and the consultant.
These fees apply in addition to any fees due the county.

11

/DZ



i

fe

g

iw-\.l

%mm&mgv&hmﬂeﬂ Subsequenl s[andard p]ans are not acccptable when th:} d]ffer ﬁ'um the prior set of p]anq
that were submitied, including but not limited to, ie., different subdivision, different snow Joad, different
topography, different soils conditions, different building in any respect. The standard plan approval shall expire be
reviewed one year from date of application to verify compliance with any newly enacted requirements. which
may be subject to additional plar review and associated fees. Because of snow conditions and differing
exposure coefficients, standard plans are not acceplable above five thousand {5,0007 feet elevation.

The cost of Inspection services provided by the building department that do not relate to the permits discassed in
section E, F, or G and to which no fee 1s specifically indicated, will be charged ninetyfive-doHars {§35:00] the fee
prescribed in the Building Department Fee Schedule pertrip. In instances where inspection trips are required
outside the county, an-houwrly rate-of pinet-{ive (585004 the fee prescribed in the Building Department Fee

Schedule (plus any additional costs to the Counny) will be charzed during normal business howurs,

Muobile home installation fees shall be based upon the latest version of Title 25 of the Califomia Administrative
Code,

Foaewalof Expired Permiis.

a. The cost of a new (two-year) permit to compiete a partially completed structure shall be the estimated cost to
complete inspections {at a rate efminetefive-dolars+505.00% presceribed in the Building Depariment Fee
Schedule, per inspection trip, but not to exceed the amount of the original building permit fee. and any appli-

cable plancheck fees, plus a—nmew—&miei-}al:{w the grescnhed admmlsuanve lee.

e l:-_. Permits may be granted an administrative ninety {309 day extension without fees upon approval of the chief
building official or assignee,

A grading fee as prescribed in the Building Depariment Fee Schedule eftbiryp-Bre—dollars—{$354000
(community development/resource agency’ will be charged of all new single-family dwellings and mobile homes
On private property outside the TRPA area. This does not include additions or replacement mobile homes when the

63



property outside the TRE A area. This does not include additions or replacement mobile homes when the same in-
stailation pad is being used.

A fire-safe regulation fee efeiphiy—five-dollarsL385-004 as preseribed in the Building Departmeni Fee Schadule
will be charged on all single-family dwelling applicarions except for additions/remodels and replacements of
existing legal dwellings.

Permit investigation fees {double fees) asautkorizedinthe UBE-HME HRC and P shall be assessed when
work is performed without a permit. The fee shall be based on the petbelessthanshe computed cost of the
permit fee, plancheck, plumbing, electrical, and mechanjcal fee. forthe-ewnerorauthorized-agent-or hconsed
contractor-afrecord-porforning the-work:

Exceptions:

a. When work was necessary in the opinion of chief building ofticial to correct an immediate hazard and an appli-
cati¢n is filed for a permit within the next three normal county workdays.

b. When work was performed by a previous owner and the current owner 1 obtaiting proper permit{s).

s nomrefundable foe-of one hundrad-doHars

Permit Fee Exemptions and Refunds.
Appendix 1 Section 108.6 107 —Pemit—Exemptionsand Retunds,
Add the following to HBE IRC Section -+ 108.6:-Generak

Exemption from Fees.

The County of Placer or any Department, Board, or Officer thereof, acting on behalf of said connry, any Municipai
or Quasi-municipal corporation or government shall not be required 1o pay any fees required by this Code. (Ref

The building official shall not anthorize refunding of any fee paid except on written application filed by the origi-
nal perminee not later than the date of expiration of the plan review or building permit, as applicable.

104



_b\..l

Inspections.
Appendix 1 Scction H9& 109 - Inspections.
Add the following o UBE IBC Section H3&-3 109.1, General:

Except where special mspection is specified in Section 1701, the building official may autharize alternative
inspection procedures requiring declarations from duly licensed professionals.

Certificate of Occupancy.
Appendiy 1 Section 309 110 - Certificate of Oecupancy,

Add the following prier 10 HBC [BC Section 383 11041, Use and occupancy:

Certificates of accupancy will not be issued without approvals of all appropriate Counry departnents and the Fire
DepartmentDistrict when such departments/districts have conditions of approval made pan of the permit by the
Board of Supervisors.

e3- Such a certificate shall not be

IShued unnl cc-mpham,e wn:h a]l Counn requ1rcmems has heen met, Occupx Ing or using a structure without rhis
approval shall constitute a public nuisance.

Add the following to BB IBC Section 110.2 Certificate Issued: 1005 Posting: and delete item 10.

The certificate of occupancy shall be posted in a conspicuous place an 'the premises and shall not be removed
except by the building official.

Exception: The Centificate of Occupancy need not be posted in 1} and R-3 occupancies.
Sraoke Detectors.

Section 3681 - Emoke detectors 907,210 Single- and Multiple-station smoke alarms.

Add the following to UBE [BC Section 348-81-4 307.2.140. Location within dwelling units:

Mﬂiﬂg— Smohe alanns ! addnmns and rem{:-dels are to be interconniected to alarms in the existing strugtare when
the wiring for such alarms is exposed in the constructionvrermnodel, or when otherwise accessible through an attic,
crawl space, or basement. Note: The local fire authority having jurisdiction may require additional safegoards when
adopted and enforced by the fire department/district pursuant to H&S Code 13869.7.

14

/65



2

[

fr

Residential Swimming Pool and Spa Barriers.

Amend [BC Section 3109.4.4.2 [tem 2. Change to read as follows:

The pool shall be equipped with an approved salety pool cover complying with ASTM Standard F 1346,

Amend IBC Section 3109.4.4.2 {tem 3. Change to read as foHows;

BemS. Where a wall of a Group R, Division 3 Occupancy (including attached garage) serves as part of the barrier
required by section 3109.4.4.3 and contains door openings benveen the dwelling unit'garage and the ouwtdoor
swimming pool that provide direct access to the pool, the residence shall be equipped with exit alarms on those
doors providing direct zecess ta the pocl. Doors provided with alarms shail make continuons and audible
sounds thronghout the dwelling when the door and its sereen. if present are opéned or lefi ajar. Alarmg may
be battery operated or mav he connecte«d tg the e]eclrtca! mrmg of the bulldme The alarm{s} can be
individual alarm(s} at each door, ases op-fenceH a-the FeauiFes OFH

In all cases, owners/occupants are responsible for maintaining all required enclosures/barriers and safety clerments.

Amend IRC Section 3109.4.4.3 Ttem 2. Change ta read as follows:

The top of the barrier shall be at least 60 inches above grade measured on the side of the barrier that Faces
away from the swimming popl. Refmairing portemrunchanized- Any gates other thap pedestrian access gates

15

JOb



_r._J

M.

shall be eguipped with jockable hardware or padlocks and shall remain locked 21 all time when not in wse. A
permanent sign shall be posted which reads: “this access to be kept locked at all times.”

Outdocr Lights Serene Lakes.

Section 312 - Requirementsfor Utility and Miscellaneouns Group U Qeeupancies Add the following as new
subsection 312.2 9, Outdoor lighis/Serens Lakes:

Any garage constructed after March 1, 1983, in the Serene Lakes Subdivision will be required 1o provide an exie-
rior light installed on the sireet side of the garage. This light shail be controlled by a photo cell and shall be in op-
eration between the months of November through Mareh.

Soil Types Conventional Construction.

IBC Section 23328:2 2308.1.1-- Desipn—of poriers  Portions exceeding limitations of conyentional
construction. Add the following:

Structures which otherwise gualify. for Conventiona! Construction may utilize spil profile tvpes 8C or 80 based
on the design professionals assessment of the site in combination with public records maps, such as maps ffom the
Califomia Division of Mines and Geology, This does not apply where a soils report identifies conditions sufficient
to classify the site as 8E o 8F as defined in the 199782406 [BC,

Building Addresses.
Section 502,2 - Address Numbers Buildingaddresses. Add as a new section to read as follows:

Approved numbers of addresses shall be placed on all new, remodeled and ahered buildings (commercial and:or
residential) in such a position ag to be plainly visible and legible from the street or road franting the property,
Whenever the numbers on the building will not be clearly visible from the access street of road fronting the prop-
erty, the numbers will be placed at the street or access road in a manner which 15 clearly visible from both direc-
tions of fravel on the road’street. Said numbers shall be a mimmum 3 nch letter height, 3:23 inch stroke,
reflectorized, and contrast with their background. or may be a munimum 5 inches high and contrast with their back-
ground.
Placer County Snow and Wind Design,

Wind and Snow Design Critena,

Fermits will not be permitted m high or moderate hazardous areas or sites as identified by Placer County Code,
Chapter 15 or Article 12 40 such as avalanche, flood, mud-slide or other designated hazardous areas unless an ar-
chitect, civil or structural engineer licensed in California certified that the stucture will be safe under the
anricipaied hazards, and the structure complies with anticipated loads and conditions.

Exception Structures exempt from the avalanche standards as described in Article 12.40, Placer County Code,
‘Those struciures which have received a structural design approval from Placer Cousty as well as those which are
repetitive in design and have received a structural design approval may at the permittec’s option, use either the
existing snow design criteria ar the snow design criteria in this subsection for a period of time not to exceed one
year from the effective date of the ordinance codified In this subsection.

Notice to builders—Wamning. Mew structures which are in a partially completed state during the winter months will

probably experience severe damage from snow. ice, and wind. It will be the responsibility of the permittee to
ensure that his or her partiaily completed structure is such as 1o restst all of the winter weather elements of Placer

16

167



1=

sure that bis or her partially completed structure s such as to resist all of the winter weather elements of Placer
County,

YBC IBC Section 1644 1008 - Snow Loads, Roofdesigrcriterin. DB Appendin-Chapier 16 DPivistont-is

adopted with the following:

a. Add the following to detennine snow loads action on structures in Placer County:

NOTE: Cecasionally there may be large local deviations from the tvpical data from which this Code was
developed. When applying these values to structures the designer should make every effort to determine if the
tabulated values should be adjusted because of local topographic effects. Loads for stuctures which have an
inherent need for a high degree of safety, or long life span, sheuld be carefully evaluated, and the desigrer shoold
always exercise his best professional judgmert. The following snow load and design requirernents are s minimum.

Fhelatafreb- LHAG Section2316) Any stress increase for load duration allowed by the NDS per IBC Section
2306.1 increaseforwoodand-for-fasteninaswith-woedvatues may not be used above 50007 elevation uniess an ar-

chiteer, civil or structural engineer, licensed in California can show that the design load will not exceed twa (2)
menths’ duration durimg the life of the structure.

Seismic leading for snow loads shall comply with ASCE-7 Section 12.7 2 Gab«Piredusedforphoh reed be
WWMM%MWW

Roaf and snow leads for all mobile homes, mobile home accessory buildings. commercial coaches, and factory
built housing shall comply with the snow loading for other structures. (Exception: Mobile homes in mobile home
parks and mobile hames where Pg is less than 100 PSF shall comply with Title 25 of the California Administrative
Code )

Appepdix IBC Chapter 16, Section #6843 1608 15 amended to read by adding:
I. Where PIis greater than or equal to 30 P.8.F, al] building exits shall be located where not subject to or
protected from sliding or impact snow and ice. Al building exits shall mean all required exits in Single Family

Dwellings and appurtenant structures, and all building exns in all other occupancies.

2. All unheated overhangs shall be designed for ice dams and accumulation by multiplving the Pfby 1,5, Heat
strips or other exposed heat methods may not be used in liew of this design.

3. Where Pgis 100 P S F. or greater, hot or cold mop underlayment roofing is required. as-neted-in Section1643-

"‘!’FE“EH“ ;haﬁ’“ﬂ lg* E;BE'HIEH '1'6389 “BE&H—BES, is-amended-toread:

Appendix [BC Chapter 16 Section 36351 1608, Add the following:

17

J0}



Desipn Requirements for Conventional Construction Strugtures:

Structwres nornally governed by Section 2326-2308, which are located in areas where the roofsnow load exceeds
50 pounds per square foot, shall have both the gravity and lateral structural system designed by duly licensed de-
sign professional{s). Such structures. which otherwise gualify for Conventional Light-Frame Construction in Sec-
tion 2320 2308, may wilize soil profile types of 8C of $D based on the design professional’s assessment of the site
i combination with public record maps, such as maps from the Californta Division of Mines and Geology. This
does not apply where a soils report has identified soils conditicons sufficient to classify the soil type as SE or 8F as
defined in the H9O7-UREC. 2044 IBC

1.5 AppendixChaprerts: IBC Section 1639 1608 —Ground snowloads. Add the following;
TABLE A-16-C
GROUND 1
FLEVATION ABOVE  SNOWLOAD Pg SNOW DENSITY  MAXIMUM ANTICIPATED
SEALEVEL  (PSF) D{(PCF)  _ SNOWDEPTHDg <‘
Use LB-C. IBC -cx 1607.1 l
Up to 1.600 fi. Table l
| 1,601 - 2,500 &, 295
[ 2,501 - 3,000 f. 55 200 30R
[ 3,001 - 3,500 f. 05 200 IR R
3,501 - 4,000 ft. 100K 20.0 50
| 4001 -4,500 fi 160 227 6.5 1,
| 4,301 - 5,000 fi. 200# 24 5 8.2 fr
| 3.001 - 5,500 ft. 2608 26.7 4.7 ft
5.501 - 6,000 fi. ESE 27.0 11.7 /.
| 6.001 - 6,500 ft. 3758 296 127 1,
© 6,501 - 7,000 ft. 430# 30.1 14.3 A,
7,001 - 7,500 fi. 490 306 16.0 ft.
7.501 fi. up 5458 32.4 168t |

* Lergoied h_‘ Odwance qgaﬁ B g_]l“n

Applicable West of the West Section line of Sections 20, 29, and 32 of Township 17 Morth, Range 16 East
and Sections 5, §, 17,20, 29, and 32 of Township 16 North, Range 16 East and Sections 4, 3,211, 14,23, 26, and
35 of Township 15 North, Range 16 East and Secticns 2, 11, 14, and 23 of Township {4 North Range 16 East.

TABLE A-16-D
ELEVATION ABOVE  GROUNDSNOW SNOW DENSITY  MAXIMUM ANTICIPATED
SEALEVEL LOAN Pg (P.SR) D (PCF} SNOW DEPTH Dg
5001 - 5,500 1304 23.6 55 fi. T
5,501 - 6,000 1504 23.8 79 ft.
6,001 - 6,500 2434 24 5 100 &
6,501 - 7,000 300k 25.0 120 £
7,000 - 7,500 3604 252 143 6,
7,501 - 8,000 4004 255 157 fi.
[ 8,001 fup 4457 25.7 173 fi, ]
18

Je1



Applicable East of the East Section lire of Sections 20, 29, and 32 of Township 17 North, Range 16 East and
Sections 5.8, 17. 20,29, and 32 of Township L6 north, Range 16 Eastand Sections 4, 3.2, 11, 14,23, 26, apd 35
of Township 15 lorth, Range 16 East and Sections 2, 11, 14, and 23 of Township 14 North Range 16 East.

NOTE: EBC 1BC roof live load reductions spectfied in Section +6073-and Fable-t6-C 1607.11.2 are not
permitied above 1600 fi. elevation. Roof load reductions for any structural member based on tributary areas greater
than 130 square feet or based on Method2Table16- section 1607.11.2, are not permitted above 1,000 fr
elevation. Interpolation may be made at 100 increments (any fraction of 100" will be considered as 100"

The ground snow loads within Sections 20, 29, and 32 of Township 17 North, Range 16 East and Sections 5,
8, 17, 20, 29, and 32 of Township 16 North, Range 16 East and Sections 4, 3, 2, 11, 14, 23, 26, and 35 of
Township 15 North, Range 16 East and Sections 2, 11, 14, and 23 of Township 14 North Range 16 East shall be

based upon a straight line proportion between the values shown in Tables 23-G-3 A-16-C and 23-62 A-16-D
based upon the distance of the site ffom the transition zone.

Appendix IBC Chapter 16, Section 16441608, Add the following Table A-16-E:

TABLE A-16-E*

(IMPACT LOADS TO BE USED IN CONJUNCTION WITH-SECTION 2350 Chapter 23 and Current Adepted

NDS)

| f IMPACT | BEFORE [MPACT o __'[
VERTICAIL DIFFERENCE : UFPER FACTOR LOWER ROCF OR
BETWEEN ROOFS OR ] ROOF DECK LOAD L TOTAL DESION LOAD LOWER
STRUCTLURES - LOaD 1 (Pfy l. ROOF OR DECK (DOWHNWARTH*® |
Lesz than or egual 1o .5 1ig Pl {Upper} 0.0 i Pf (Lower: _5 P.=Pf{Lower}
Grealer than .5 Heg bul Jess 04 ' PI(Lawer} ! P=[F1, (Upperd = 00 4] #Pf{Lower}
than or equal ta 190" Pf, (Lipper} |

| Greater than 1007 but less | .o P {Lower) B =P, (Uppert « 1.0)+ P (Lower)

| than or equal w 1510 PL(Upper) |

I Gireater than 18°-07 Ff, {Upper) E --- P {lower) Special Analysis Required

Sngw unloading need not be considered where the upper roof slope is less than 2712,
Diesepn up-Lfi lead {rebound) 15 calcelated bv Lhe following:

(Formula 204}
Pu = Impact {acter = PIupper)
Design snow [oad shall now be used 1w resist Pu

Pls = Designed roal load with pich reductton
See UBC Chaprer 16 for other symboi explanation.

. YEC 1BC Section 4618 160%.3—Basic wind speed. Section 1648 1609.3 and Chapter 16 Figure 16-1 1609 are
modified i read as {oliows:
The basic wind speed for Placer County shall be as follows:
' ELEVATION ABOVE MEAN SEA LEVEL ___BASIC WIND SPEED
Up to 5004 feet 85 20 mph
5001 1o 7000 feet 85 #8 mph
| 7001 1o BOOO feet T S0 mph
[ 8001 and Up 100 moph

19

10



i

Plumbing and Mechanical Requirements for Locations Above Five-Thousand (5,000) Feet Elevation.
Plumbing and Mechanical Applicable for Locations Above Five Thousand Feet.

Al new gas mstallations shall have equipment listed and approved for the conditions of anticipated use. Where
exposed to snow and ice, the equipment shall be listed for those conditions, Placer County building department
does not regulate the installation of liquefied petrolewm gas (LPG) tanks, however, location of (LPG) tanks shall be
in accordance with the Uniform Mechanical Code and the Usifesn International Fire Code, the Tocal fire
departrnent and 'or the State Fire Marshal and the Yaifors International Fire Code. Until fire disiticts adopt
approved standards, the requirements in Placer County Code Articles 15,12 and 15.16 or NFPA pamphlet 58, at the
discretion of the fire chief. are enforceable by the fire chiefs in areas sbove five thousand (5,000} foot elevatian.

Al or above five thousand (50007 foot elevation, water supply piping shall be protected from freezing by a
minimum of thirty-six (36) inches of eanh covering or equivalent insulation. Piping which 1s subject 10 freezing
shall not be installed in unheated areas or outside walls. Exception: In walis or floors adjacent to heated areas when

the structural design necessitates, piping may be installed within the assembly on the heated side of at least R- 19
insulatiom

The water supply svstem, including hot and coid, shall be designed and installed for winterization and frecze
protection, such as allowing for rontine drainage of the system 10 prevent freezing, The water supply shall be
equipped with a readily accessible shot off valve. Valve(s) and/or drain port{s) when used shall be readily
accessible, insulated for protection from freezing, and shall be protected from the potential for back flow,

All gas meters, valves, and equipment shall be protected from sliding, drifting, and impact snow and wce. There
shall be a gas shut off valve at cach stricture which is supplied with gas which is on the omtside of the building and
is readily accessible at all times. Where Pg is one hundred (100} PSF or greater, there shall be a sign directly above
the shut off vaive which i3 readily visible and located above the maximum anticipated snow depth

Uniform Plumbing Code Section 906 is amended to add subparagraph 906.8 o read as follows:
All plumbing vents projecting through the roof shall be protected from damage by sliding snow or ice. This
shall be accomplished by using guvs, formed metal guards (*Crickets"™), saddies, or other methods approved

by the Building Official. This seclion shall apply at elevations above 5,000 feet.

Roof Construction and Fire Retardant Requirements.

HRG IBC Section 2326420 21308.10.8, UBC IBC Section 1503, and IBC Section 1510 AppendinChaptar 15,
Fechentid—Reat-condruchonand-materials: Change URC IBC Sections 2326- 129 1308.10.8, 1593 and Sec-
tion 1510 - Reroofing Appesdvc-Chapter 5 -Sectien 1544 by adding following paragraph:

a. Spaced roof sheathing is permined when installed in accordance with IBG IBC Table $5-B-2 1507-8 & Table
23D 2304.7(1) & 2304.7(2) when the design roof live load or snowload is less than 30 PSE and spaced roof
sheathing is not prohibited by the required listing of the roofing material or by the designer.

b Draft siops conforming to BBE IBC Section 7083122 717.4.3 are required in antics of residential

occupancies, Draftstopping shall divide the concealed space inte approximately equal areas.

2{

Hi



b3

UBC3503 TBC 1508 and Table 35-4 1505.1: Roofs shalt conform o the provision of Section 1563 1505 & Table

1A LRC 1505,1 1BC except as herein modified: (Provisions in G8& IBC Chapter 15 which provide for less
somygent roof rattgs are not applicable.}

a Class A rating shal] be the minimum roofing/assembly in the unincorporated portions of Placer County. This
requirement includes Group R, Division 3, and Group U Cecupancies,

b. All pew construction. including additions, requires Class A roofing/assemnbly as a rmnimum. All re-roofing re-
guires Class A as a minimum. Re-roofing in excess of fifty (50) percent of an existing structure within any one-
year period wiil necessitate that the entire roof be a Class A roofing/assembly as & minimum.

The local fire authority having jurisdiction may have different requirements when adopted and enforced by the fure
dismrict pursuant to H&S Code 13869 7.

5. Slab Floor Woisture Protection.

IBC UBC Section 1266:-4 1914 - Additional designand construction requirements: Minimum Slab Provisions.
Add the following:

A munimum of four inches {4 of grave] shall be reqmred under all s!ab o grade construcuon wh l-::h will receive
ﬂO(lI Cﬂ\-lﬁ,l’ll’lg maleriais. Addd = 2 3 =

T. Fire Pratection tor Chimneys.
HRC 1BC Section 3405 2111.14.1 - Factory-built chimneys. Add the following:

(13 Abave 5000 fi. elevation, all factory built chimneys serving solid fuel appliances shall be exposed to the oceu-
pied space, excepl:

a. When installed in a chase which complics with B8& IBC Section 711; or which are sheetrocked on the inside
with 1727 sheetrock with tight joints.

b All shafts proiecting solid fue! chimneys shali be accessible for inspection and maintenance.
(Ord. 5373-B {part), 2005, Ord. 5268-B, 2003; Ord. 5200-B (part), 2002: Ord. 4959-B (part}. 1999: prier code § 4.20)
15.04.060 Building permits during construction of subdivision improvements,

A.  Nobuoilding permit shall be issued within a recorded subdivision or planned unit development until such time as all
improvements required by the agreement between the coumy and the subdivider have been completed and accepied by the
county, except that building permits may be issued prior to the acceptance of the improvements by the county as provided in
this section.

B, Forprojects at or below the elevation of five thousand (35,0007 feet, once the permit applications have met all other
requiréments for permit issvance, building permits with a restriction on non-occupancy of the structure will be isswed by the
building department if the following conditions are met as determined by the department of public-wosks Engineering apd
Surveying:

1. The final map of the subdivision or planned unit developiment has been approved by the board of supervisors and
dul:, recorded;
2. All pad grading required by the county has been completed,;
Roads serving the building lot have been paved;
Allunderground utilities are installed 1o the 1o lines;
Liility svstems have passed all required tests;

LI R - P |

21

U2



6. The subdivision developer, the contractor responsible for consmucting the subdivision improvements, and the
owner of record of the lot if title has been transferred from the subdivider. have each executed a release to the satisfaction of
the county specifically authorizing the issuance of a building permit. The release shiall hold the county, the serving fire en-
1ity and utility companies harmiess from any and all Dabiliny from damages or Iosses resulting from carly permit issuance.
The release shall also provide that the county will hold the subdivision developer responsible for all improvements regard-
less of the presence of house contractors, material suppliers, tradesmen, or public in the subdivision. The release shall also
hold the county harmless in the event that the subdivision improvements are not completed and the construction of the home
or other struchure is delayed and‘er prohibited;

7. The lpcations ol all structures and any required setbacks have been certified by a licensed survevor and have been sub-
mitted to the county.

C.  For projects above the elevation of five thousand (5,000} feet, once the permit applications have met all other re-
quirements for permit issuance, building permits, with a restriction that no construction beyond the foundation level and
rough framing is permitted, will be issued by the building department if the following conditions are met as determined by
the departrent of public works:

1. The final map of the subdivision or planned unit development has been approved by the board of supervisers and
duly recorded;

2. all pad grading required by the county has been completed,

3. Roads serving the building lot and firefighting water service have been constructed to a standard approved by the
serving fire district and the county;

4. The subdivision developer, the contractor respansible for constructing the subdivision improvements, and the
owner of record of the lot if title has been wransferred from the subdivider, have each excouted a release to the satisfaction of
the counry specifically authorizing the issuance of 2 building permit. The release shall hold the county, the serving fire en-
tity and utility companies harmless from any and alt liability from darmages or losses resuiting from early permit issuance.
The release shall also provide that the county will hold the subdivision developer responsible for all improvements regard-
less of the presence of house contractors, material supphiers, tradesmen, or public in the subdivision. The release shall also
hold the county harmless in the event that the subdivision improvements are not completed and the consguction of the home
or other structure is delaved andfor prohibied;

5. The locations of all structures and any required setbacks have been certified by a licensed surveyor and have been
submitied 10 ihe county;

6. Security inthe form of cash, certificate of deposit, or letter of credit (the latter two to be in a form acceptable to the
county) shall be deposited with the county. This secunity shall be in an amount equal to ene hundred cwenty-five (125) per-
cent af the value of the unlinished mfrastructure required under the subdivision agreement for the project. The amount of
the deposit shall be based on an estimate prepared by a registered ¢ivil engineer and approved by the communiry develop-
mentiresource agency. The final amount shall be determined solely by the community developmenttesource agency, An
additional agreement shall be entered nto between the county and the subdivider {and the property owner if a lothas been
sold) 1o establish the terms of the release of any deposits required under this section;

7. The building department shal] have approved a complete set of building plans;

8 The local serving fire district shall indicate, in writing, that it is satisfied with the provisions for fire protection,

Fach permit issued under this subsection shall contain the following note: “1tis expressly understood that no construction
excepl the foundation of the structure will be permined until all of the conditions of approval relating 1o the subdivision
shall bave been met.”

A processing fee, payable to the depariment of public works, shall be charged for preparing documents and processing
permits under this subsection (“high elevation processing fee™.) The high elevation processing fee shall be inaddition to any
other required fees. The high elevation processing fee shall be initially four hundred ninety doltars ($490.00) and shall be
subject 10 an annual consumer price index adjustment based on the State of California Department of Iidustrial Relations
Consumer Price Index - California for Al Urban Consumers. The high elevation processing fee also may be modified from
time to time by resolution of the board of supervisors.

D.  For model homnes, regardless of elevation, building permits with a restriction on non-gccupancy of the smucture,
onge the permit applications have met all other requirements for permit issuance, will be issued by the building department
if the following couditions are met as determined by the department of public works:

113



1. Conditions of subsections (BY 1), (B2, (BX6) and {(BW7) of this section have been satisfied,

2 All underground utility crossings within roadways have been installed and waterlines and fire hyvdrants serving
proposed model construction have been instalied to fhe satsfaction of the serving fure protection entity or the developer can
provide written evidence from the serving fire protection entity thal adequate fire protection can be provided for the modcl
homes;,

3. Developer agrees in writing to remove landscaping and level the mullipurpose easement to sidewalk grade at
developer’s own expense as required by the utility companies prior to utility trenching opetations,

4 Developer agrees in writing nod to convey title to model homes for occupancy prior to utilities and improvements
being fully installed and accepted;

5. Developer agrees in writing that a model home shall not be used for offices nor will public foot traffic be aliowed
throngh such homes until a “temporary certificate of occupaney™ has been issued by the building department, and, further,
that before a model home can be used for residence purposes a perrmanent certificate of sccupaney must be obtained;

6. Developer agrees in writing that model homes shall nat be connected to sewer laterals until all required sewer line
testing has been completed;

7. Lintilsuch time as the utilities are installed and passed to the lot lines, developer shall provide written evidence that
the county has been named as an additienal insured on the developer's liability insurance in an amount to be determmed.

E. Building permits issued under subsection B or C of this section shall be limited to twenty (20) percent of the total
number of lots in a subdivision or phase for projects of twenty (207 or more lots. For subdivisions of less than twenty (209
lots, the maximum number of permits under subsection B or C of this section shall be limited to four. The maximuem num-
ber of model home buldding permits issued upnder subsection D of this section for each unit of a subdivision shall equal ten
{104 percent of the number of lots shown on the final map of the unit o a total of fifteen (153 building permuts, whichever 1s
less: except that for subdivisions having less than thirty (30) 1ots the maximun number of model permits will be three. A
computed fractional number witl be rounded to the next whole number,

F.  Forall permits issved under subszction B or C of this section, no certificate of occupancy may be issued until the
subdivision improvements are accepted by the county and the final inspaction of the structureds) is completed. Each permit
1ssued pursuant to the provisions of subsection B or C of this section shall contain the following note: “Certificate of
Croeupancy shall not be 1ssued vntil all subdivision tnprovements have been approved by the Board of Supervisors and
other apencies invelved. No oceupancy 1s allowed until such approvals are given.™

G.  The conditons comtained in this section may be applied to subdivicion phases a8 approved by the county planning
commission. (Ord. 5373-B {part), 2003; Ord. 5200-B (part), 2002: Ord. 5043-B & 1, 2000: prior code § 4.21)

15.04.070 Builiding permits on agricultural property.
Add the following to ¥BC€ 1BC Section 105

No Building Permit shall be issued for a sile or building, which does not comply with the provisions of Section
16.04.060

{Crd. 5200-B (par), 2002: prior code § 4.22)

15.04.080 Fleetrical 2006 International Code Council Electrical Code Administrative Provisions.

The following amendments and additions are made to the 2006 International Code Council National Electrieal
Gode 1CC Electrical Code Adminisirative Provisions, published by the International Code Ceuncil {TCCY, All references

in the 1CC are to be changed to enly refer to those building standards adepted by the California Building Standards
Code

NEC [CC Administrative Code Provisions.
A, Chapter 11 —-Board-etAppeals Means of Appeal. Delete and replace with the following:

13

I



The Board of Appeals shall be as called out in the Placer County Code. They shall have the same pewer, and shall
be the same Board.

Chapter 10—Violations. (Ref. Sections 1.7 and 1.8, Chapter 1, Placer Counry Code.} Add the foliowing para-
graphs:

a. PENALTIES

Any person, firm, or corporation, violating any of the provisions of this Code shal] be guilty of a misdemeanor
ifirs1 offense may be regarded as an infraction pursvant 10 Anicies 1.16 and 1.24, Placer Counry Code) and upon
conviction thereof, shall be punishable by a fine of not more than $300.00 or by imprisonment for a pertod of not
more than 20 days, or by both such fine and imprisonment. Reference Article 1.24, Placer County Code,

b, VIOLATIONS

Every persen, firm, or corporation violating anv of the provisions of this Code shall be deemned guilty of a separate
offense for each day or portion thereof during which such violation continued and shall be punishable therefore as
herem provided.

¢. PROHIBITIONS

It is unlawful for any person, firm, or corporation, either as owner, architect, contractor, artisan, or ptherwise to do
or knowingly 1o cause or permit io be done any electrical wiring as defined in this code in such manner that the
same shall not conform 1o all of the provisions of this Code.

d. REPEAL OF CONFLICTING ORDINANCES

All ordinances or parts of ordinances which are in conflict with the provisions of this ordinance are hereby re-
pealed.

2. VALIDITY

If any section. sub-section, sentence, clause, or phrase of this ordinance is, for any reasom, held to be
unconstitutional or legally ineffective, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaiing portions of this
ordinance.

The Beard of Supervisers hereby declares that it would have adopted this ordinance and each section, sub-section,
sentence, clause, or phrase thereof, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences,
clauses, or phrases be declared unconstitutional or lepally ineffective.

NLECICC Admin Provisions, Chapter 4 —Permits s#suanes and Fees. Delete criteria regarding expiration and refer
to Placer Code Section 15.04.050.

NEC ICC Admin Provisions-—Section 404 —Fees. Delete criteria regarding fees and refer 1o Placer County Code
section 15.04.050.

NEC ICC Admin Provisions, Chapter 8 —Cannection-approval Service Utilities, Add the following:

a. Temporary ¢lectricai service may be authorized only during periods of consmruction or repair of a structure for
which a valid permit has been issued. or where the conditions of approval only authorize temporary service.

b. The Chief Building Official may withhold power from any dangerous building,

iOrd. 5200-B (part), 2002 prior code § 4.30)

24

15



15.04.090 Lniform Mechanical Code,

The following sections of the 2006 Usiesm California Mechanical Code Appenrdix Chapter 1 are modified by the
following additions and deletions:

A Section 114.4—Expiration. Delete subsections 114.4 and refer to Section 15.04.050 of Placer County Code,
B.  Secticm 115—Fees. Delete Section J15.2 and refer to Section 15.04.050 of the Placer County Cade.

{Ord. 5200-B (part), 2002: prior code § 4.35)

15.04.100 Adddittons-and-amendmentsto-the Uniform Plumbing Code™

The 2064 26 Califormia Plumbing Code is adopted by reference with amendments imposed by the state and as herein
moedified.

A Aappendiy 1 Section 102.0—Department Authority having jurisdiction. Add the following:

Unless otherwise provided for by law, the office of the Administrative Authority shall be the Building Department,
provided, however, that Environmental Health Services of the County of Placer, Department of Health and Human
Services shall, as necessary, conduct site evaluation{s), make plan check(s), site inspection(s) and construction
inspections. to determine type, size, and acceptability of any private sewage disposal svstems and shall be the
Administrative Authority for enforcing this section,

B. Section 102.3—Violations and penailies. Add the following: Ref. Articles 1.16 and £.24. Placer County Code.

Any person, firm or corporation violating any of the provisions of this Code shall be deemed guilty of a misde-
meanor (fust offense may be regarded as an infraction pursuant to Sections 1.7 and 1.8, Chpt. I, Placer Counry
Code) and wpon conviction thereof shall be punishable by a fine of not te exceed $300.00 or by imprisonment i
the County jail for not to exceed 90 days, or by both such fine and imprisonment,

Each separate day or any portion thereof during which any violation of this code accurs or coniinues shall be
deemed to constitule a separate offense, and upon conviction thereof shall be punishable as herein provided.

The 1ssuance or granting of a permit or approval of plans and specifications shall not be deemed or congirued 1o be
a permit for, or an approval of, any violation of any of the provisions of this code.

No permil presutning to give authority (o violate or cancel the provisions of this code shalt be valid, except insofar
as, the work or use which it authorized is lawful.

The issuance or granting of a permit or approval of plans shall not prevent the Administrative Authority from
thereafier requiring the correction of errors in said plans and specifications or from preventing construction opera-
ticns being carried on thereunder when in violation of this Coede or any ather Ordinance or from revoking any
Certificate of Approval when issued in erTor.

A Building Permit shall not be 1ssued for any struchwre until the proposed sewage disposal and water supply and.or
any permits whicl are required for sewage disposal and water supply have been approved by the County of Placer
Department of Health and Human Services, Environmental Health Services.

25

i



g

A certificale of ocoepancy shall not be issued until the sewage svstem and water supply swstem have been approved
by the county of Placer department of health and human services, environmental health services.

Plurnbing permits issued by the building department shall expire as determined by this code. Before such work may
be recommenced, a new permit shall be first obtained to do so.

Plumbing permits issued in conjunction with a building permit shall have the same titne Timitation as the basic
building permit.

Cost of Permit. 1TPC and U'MC fees are required for all plumbing and mechanical, as determined by this code.
Add a new paragraph to Section 26-15 101.4.1.2 1o UPC—Maintenance, of [legally installed work prohibited.
Tt shall be uniawfu] for any person to use or maintain any gas piping, or plumbing and drajning system or any por-
tion thereof which was unlawful at the time it was installed, aftered, or replaced and which would be unlawful
under this Code if so installed, altered, or replaced afier the effective date of this Code.

Board of Appeals. Add the following;

The Board of Appeals shall be as specified in the Placer Countv Code. They shall have the same powers and shall
be 1he same Board.

(Ord. 3200-B (part), 2002 Ord. 4959-B (part), 1999 prior code § 4.40)

*  Wote: The 197¢ Edinon of the Untform Plumbing Cade was replaced on January 2, 1974, by the 1973 Edinon of UPC by Ord  1694-B, the 1973
Fdition was replaced with the 1976 Edition by Ord 20395, August 24, 1976, the 1976 Edittun was replaced with the 1979 Edition by Ord 2604,
Cclober 16, 1979, Tor former provisions reparding Section 4 40, see Ords. 1061 and 129]

15.04.110 Ceenerally,

A

When any building is constructed, altered, converted maintained in violation of the provisions of this chapter, the
enforcement agency, after giving the owner written notice and a reasonable time to correct the violation, may
petition to the board of supervisors, requesting that notice of the violation be recorded in the county recorder’s
FHepetition shall be filed in wiplicate with the clerk of the board of supervisors and shall set forth the facts giving
rise 10 such violation.

Upon receipt of the petition, the clerk of the board of supervisors shall set a date for hearing on the petition by the
board of supervisors and shall mail a copy of the petition and notice of the hearing to the owner responsible for the
violation,

In passing upon such petition, the board of supervisors shall pass upon the touth of the allegations of such petition
and shall determine whether or ot notice of the violation shall be recorded by the clerk of the board of supervisors
in the county recorder’s office. {Ord. 5200-B (part), 2002: prior code § 4.200)

28

117



/I8



	1
	2
	3
	4
	5
	6
	7
	8
	9
	10
	11a
	11b
	11c
	12a
	12b
	13a
	13b
	13c
	13d
	14
	16a
	16b
	17a
	17b
	17c
	17d
	17e
	17f
	17g
	18a
	18b
	19a
	19b
	19c
	20a
	20b
	20c
	20d
	21a
	21b
	22
	23
	24a
	24b
	24c
	25a
	25b
	25c
	25d
	25e
	26
	27a
	27b
	27c
	27d
	27e
	28

