MEMORANDUM

COUNTY OF PLACER

ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES DEPARTMENT
PROCUREMENT SERVICES DIVISION

TO: Honorable Board of Supervisors
FROM: Jim Boggan, Purchasing Manager
DATE: January 22, 2008

SUBJECT:  Approve the Award of Competitive Bid No. 8756 to Baldwin Contracting {Lincoln},
Teichert Aggregates {Truckee), and Vulcan Matenals (Roseville & Grass Valley)
for Asphalt Concrete in the Maximum Aggregate Amount of $842,300.00

ACTION REQUESTED

Approve the award of competitive Bid No. 8756 for asphalt concrete to Baldwin Contracting
{Lincoln), Teichert Aggregates (Truckee), and Vulcan Materials (Roseville & Grass Valley) as
detailed in Exhibit A, and authaorize the Purchasing Manager to sign the resulting blanket
purchase orders {BPQO) in the maximum aggregate amount of $942,300.00.

BACKGROUND

The Department of Public Warks' Road Maintenance Division requires annual contracts with
primary and secondary material suppliers for asphalt concrete for their road maintenance
programs. Secondary suppliers allow the department to purchase material from an alternate
provider in the event that the primary vendor is not able to supply the product in the time
required. .

Invitation for Bids No. 9756 was mailed to twenty-one registered vendors and was advertised on
the County's website, A total of five bids were recerved. None of the respondents were certified
local vendors. The bids were evaluated by combining proposed material costs and the County's
round-trip hauling costs to determine a total cost per ton for each asphailt concrete type and
destination. Prompt payment discounts were also considered. Exhibit A is a summary of the
recommended awards. The lowest bids were submitted by Baldwin Contracting and Teichert
Aggregates. These contractors are the recommended primary material suppliers {93 percent of
the award), and Vulcan Materials is recommendead as the alternate provider {7 percent of the
award}.

FISCAL IMPACT

The BPOs resulting from this recommendation will be issued to Baldwin in the maximum amount
of $548 900.00, to Teichert in the maximum amount of $326.000.00 and to Vulcan in the
maximum amount of $67,400 for a maximum aggregate amount of $942 300.00, effective from
January 22, 2008 through December 31, 2008, Department of Public Works® Fiscal Impact
Statement is attached. '

Exhibit A - Recommended Awards
Exhibit B — Public Works' Fiscal Impact Statement

ce: Kevin Taber, Public Works Manager — Road Maintenance
Cynthia Taylor, Public Works Manager - Administration
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Pracer Gounly Bid No. 9756

Asphatt Concrele, Picked Ug

Award Recommendations

PRIMARY AWARDS

PRIMARY SUBTOTALS BY MATERIAL AND DESTINATION.

Vendor Froduct Destination Sublptals

Baldwin. Linzoln 174" P53 64-10 Lincaln 3 5,800 Co
Baldwin, Lincoln 144" PG 6410 Auburn 3 560040
Baldwin, Lincaln B PG E4-10 Lincaln 5 40.500.00
Baldwin, Lincoln 6" PG 410 Auburn b 33, 750,00
Baldwin, Lincoln 112" PG 64—‘10 .Lincoln ¥ 108,000.00
Baldwin, Lincsin 172" PG §4-11) Auburn ¥ 33.125.00
Baldwin, Lincoln 34" PG 8410 Lincoln 3 26.500.00
Baldwin, Lincein 34" PG 64-10 Auburn $ 1 28.500.00
Baldwin, Lincoln 144" P(3 B4-16 Auburn § 560000
Baldwin, Linccln 174" PG Bd-16 Colfax 3 560000
Baldwin, Lincoin 38" PG 64-16 Auburn 3 33.750.00
Baldwin, Lingoln 38" PG 84-16 Colfax i 5400000
Bakdwin, Lincoin 112" PG 64-16 Auburn 3 F33.125.00
Ealdwin, Lincaln 172" PG B4-16 Colfax ) 79,500 00
Baldwin, Lincoin 34" PG 6415 Aukurn £ 26.500.00
Baldwin, Lincoln 344" PG B4-16 Colfax % 53.000.00
No Bids Received 144" P(3 B4-16 Tahoe C
Teichert, Truckes 38" PG 64-16 Tahoe b3 7B6.800.00
Teichert, Truckee 1/2" P33 64-16 Tahpe £ £3.000.00
No Bids Received 14" PG 64-28 Tahoe

Teichert, Truckee WE' PG G4-28 Tahoe 3 89 100.00
Teichert, Truckee 12" PG 64-28 Tahoe b 73.250.00

PRIMARY RECOMMENDED AWARD AMOUNTS BY VENDOR

Vendot

Baldwin Contracting,

Lincgin

Teichert Aggregates,

Truckee

Vandor

Baldwin Cantrading,

Lincoln

Teicher Aggregates.

Truckee

TOTA.L PRIMARY AWARD AMOUNT

hiota

¥ 568,650.00

g 302.150.00

Total

3 409,877 12

3 325,944 31

Tax Yolal
S 4122713 $ . BOGEIZAR
7.250%
§ 237541 % 325,544 31
7.875%
Recommended
Award
* Factor [Rounded Lip)
080 % 548.900.00
1.600 .

$ 326,000,00

% B74,900.00

~ With the exceplion of Teicher! Aggregates, the Road Mainlenance
Division anticipates purchases lo be spiit approximately 90% and 10%

betvacn the primary and secondary supplisrs.

- Exhibit A
Page 1of 13
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Placer County Bid No. 9756
Asphall Concrete. Picked Up

Exhibit A
FPags 2of 13

Award Recommendations

SECONDARY AWARD

SECONDARY SUBTOTALS BY MATERIAL AND DESTINATION

SECPNDAR‘! RECOMMENDED AWARD AMOUNT BY VENDOR

{Primary and Secondary Combined)

Vendar Subtotal” Tax Total
Witcan Materials, % 30769375 5 22307830 % 330,001 .85
Roseville 7.250%
Wulcan Materialg,. I 320,383.75 £ 2362804 3 34402279
GGrass Valley 7.375% :
' Recommended
. Award
Vendor Total * Factor {Rounded Lp}
Vulsan Materials, 3 330,001 85 010 % 13,000.00
Roseaville
“ulcan Materials, & 34402279 0.10 $ 34,400.00
Grass Valley . ’
TOTAL SECONDARY AWARD AMOUNT % 67,400.00
COMEINED AWARD
TOTAL RECOMMENDED AWARD AMOUNT $ 94230000

T With the exception of Teicher Aggregates, the Road Maintanance
Division anficipales purchases fo be spiif approximaltely 90% and ﬂ_:r%

betwean the primary and secondary Suppliers.

Vendor Produci Desfinalion Subloials

Vulzan, Roseaville 114" PG 84-10 Lincomh % 5,550.00
Yulcan, Rosevile 14" PG 64-10 Ayburn & 8.550.00
Yulcan, Rosavilia 318" PG 64-10 Lincaln 3 45,750.00
Yulean, Rogeville 318" PG 64-10 Auburn % 38,125.00
Vulzan, Roseyille 112" PG 6410 Lincaln % 117,500.00
Vulgan, Roseville 112" PG B4-10 Auburn & 36 718.75
Vulcan, Roseville 4" PG 64-10 Linceln % 28.250.00
Vulcan, Roseville 314" PG 64-10 Auburn % 28.250.00
Viulcan, Grass Valey t/4" PG B4-18 Auburn 3 6,400 00
Yulean, Grass Valiey 1/4" PG 64-16 Colfax £ 5.400.00
Vulcan, Grass Valley  3/8" PG 64-18 Aubirn 3 37.812.50
Vulcan, Grass Valley B PG 64-16 Caolfax % 80,500.00
Vulcan, Grass Valley 172" PG 64-18 Auburn $ 36,406 25
Yulcan, (Grass Valley 172" PG 64-16 Colfax 3 87.375.00
Vulcan, (Grass Valley 34" PG 8418 Auburn 3 28.500.00
Yulcan, Grass Yalley 34" PG 64-16 Calfax 3 57.000.00
ho Bigds Received 114" PG B4-16 Tahoe

Ng Bids Received 38" PG 64-16 Taheoe .
No Bids Received 12" PG 64-16 Tahoe

N Bids Recewad 14" P35 64-28 Tahoe

No Bids Received V8" PG 64-28 Tahoe

Ng Bids Received 172" PG5 84-28 Tahge
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Placer County Bid Ng. 9758 DETAILED AWARD SUMMARY Exhitit &
Azpbat Concrets, Pickaed Lo Fage Jaf 13
Primagy Awards Sacondary Awpis
Prica Eshmdled Tatal Acdusied Price Exfwmated Toral Afyuses
Vs PRt Dastinaon oot Ten Tonnsogs Amant * Fachr Toi! e Produet Crstrration por Tavt Torinaad - Aiemdumf _ " Facmar Tatal
Baldwns, Linsaln 4 PL R 10 Lincgn T [~ o 11,20000 0% 3 55000 “Jylcan, Rosevilh 14" PG E1D Lecaln 5 EL 8 FIE 30500 6 3 655000
Balthwin, | insoln 1 PG B 1D Autiurn s 56 O % X000 _ 0% 0§ SEGOR Vulean Raseyds 17 PG B0 St 37 Ess 018 i3,10000 D50 % GEHIO
Ealdhwin, Litssedn FHT PG E4-1D  Lincpin ] EOE 1,50 & 4100000 05D 3 ATA0 DD Wulcan, Roaavls 38" PG 10 Lincaln 5 E1.0H 1500 & SO0 D5 3 A5 TS00D
Aakhean, Liegoln ‘BT PG G 10 Aubuis 5 4 O 125 3 EYSOOCD _ OS50 % 2RTnolo Vikean, Raaaviliy B PGS D Auhurn 3 51.00 1250 8 ¥ #5000 060 % 3312500
Balwin Lincaln 1027 PG 610 Lincaln H 53.00 * 000§ NFoane 05 3 108, 04 30 Wulizan, Rosgulke 10" PG A 10 [T 5 5 75 doo0 5 21500003  DS0 L R1R OO0
Baldwwy, Ll 1 PG G4-12  Byburn 13 -1 1250 § Ga 2500 DG ¥ A ZEH Wuledr Rastniln 112 PG EA-10 Aybum i 5875 125 § TIAITEQ DR I A TrATE
Eealdwin. Longakn Wk PG B 10 Lineoin 3 5204 1000 & L1000 5% %Y Vulehn, Rosowia 4" PG 641D Lrmealn 3 a5 1003 § o6 500 [ 050 % 28.250.00
Ealtwin, Linzoln 204" PR 64 10 Avburn $ USEO0b_ip0o § - sA00000 050 3 3650000 Wulgan, Raseviln 34T PG B4 1D Aubum 5 56,50 106 § 5550000 D50 8 2825000
Ealdwin, Linzo r4” PG E4-16 Aubrn 5 6 oh o i1zpa0  o& 3 SEMGD Walcarn, Grase Votay MTPGELE Aubutn 3 G4 0 203 8 12400 b3 bS50 } B.400.00
Bakgwin, Lincon 14" PG Ed- 16 Cofax $ 56 00 200 & 1,000.00 050§ 560000 Yurcan, Grass Vallyy 147 PGE 1B Colfax ] EA0D 202 % 1280000 D50 L BADIOD
Bakdwin, Lincok 3PS EA1E Auburn ) £4.00 [EI-IES ETEpO00 050 4 A tsopo Vukcan, Grast Valmy 3B FGA4E Aybure 3 5050 1950 § TEeE DM [REEETFEL]
Babdwin, Liniow AR PG EA-16  Coltex 3 b B 2000 3 La 0003 050 3 S4.000.00 Wukean Grass Vallay 38 PGE4 18 Calfar 3 50 50 2000 3 12003000 080 % &050A00
Bg'dwn. Lincnda 1:2° PG BB Auburn [ 4% 00 1250 &% E5 2800 050 3 3342500 Vidcan, Grass Valley 12" PG &L 1E Aulburp 3 5875 1,250 % TRIZ 5D 050 G ARG 2%
Galdwin, Lins! 172" PG B4-16 CoHax L I  siga 2,000 3% 1G000€0 0S50 5 790000 Mukcad GrazaWaley 1EPGG64IE  Caffox k] 525 3000 % 1TATH0.00 oM % ERITSOR
Egichwin, Liagoin 14" PG A6 Aubuin 3 5300 L0 4 Li0pddn o0 § ZESMWIOD vulcan. Fevss Valley 36T PG B G Auburn § 57 40 1000 ¥ SEOMGD 0 5 ZB.MMeO0
Euakehwin, b irood Jid” PG EA-15 Salfax 3 . 5100 200 G0N A 05 3 Sirapod Wulcan Grazs Valley 34" PGEA-16  Colae s 5700 2000 3§ MADDIGD 930 3 S7T00DED
Mo Award fia’ PG Ba 16 Tahea Na Awarid VAT PGEA 1 Tahos _
Technr, Trucken 38" Bi; Bd-16 Tahea % £.0D 1,200 & TG A G0 100 3 76 800.0% Mo Award LB PG AR Tanos
Teutharl, Truckas U PG 6415 Tahoa 3 £330 1,000 % G1OMON 100 % 83600 Ha Award TUZ PG4 BB Tahts
Hg fward 1" G R 2B TanRa M s ard 4" PG 6e23  Tahoe _
Teichen, Truckes - PG 648 Tahes 3 EZFE) 1300 3 Ba 10000 100 3 BS0000 b Aw bt IE FGGHFE  Tahos
Taigherd, Trocker 17" P 6428 Tehon 5 T * e FIEEOLA 100 % T3 ISAO0 Hp dwisd VEPG6828  Tahce
Frimary Asiard dmaunts by Yandor Saesndary Seidrd Som Vendor
i : REEtm i ndd Resommendad
¥endor Tubiowl Tax Todal " Factor  Awards [Reunded) Vandor Suibrterral Tun Tatal = Factpr  Awerd {Roundad)
Bakhain Coitracing, 5 SGBAOO0 54122713 § EFETL1 L X1 ¥ B34 B0.00 Waltan MEenEls,. i WTEYETS ¥ FTIOTET B ZMO0ES LR L} L] 3 3. 0
Leaealr T Il Raswwllg T 250,
Teched Aggregaies, § 30215000 32k T4 8 ML T - T28,000.00 Wuic By Malangls, 0 103375 3 JETIMH 3 MADI2TE iR L] 4 T AG0.00
Trutkae ' TEIA% : ' Grogs Veller T3M5%
) B4, 90000 FET, 400,00
TowsiRecommended dward Amoynt [Primiry ¢ S4CONary) ¥ MIINGD .

* For dubmn and Lingpin, PG G4 10 wet o uted alemaialy, bo ot 3t 1h8 1am e bime Far Ao 30d Colas, PG 64- 16 wil be uted plemaely, bud nod 3l fha camediFe, & S50 =old bemweanthe AC fypes webe assemnd for award nur-pmes

' Tha Read Madnissgncs Chizion pnleipalas purchages (o be spin appromm ety 0% and 10% between Baldwin Coneracting [pwnary supnhary and Yulkan Malena's senondany supglers)
Taschwst Aggregales-Mariis Vallwy is the anty Suppiir dor the Tahoe 3iee



Placer County Bid No 8756 Bid Evaluation
Asphalt Concreta, Picked Lip

Exhibit A
Faga 4 of 13

t : 1/4" PG 64-10 -
Matenal Rofarence Prica for 1/4™ PG 64-10

Bidder Granlte Telchad Vulcan Vulcan Baldwin

Constniction ASgeanates Matarialy Muaterals Contracting
Plant Lacahan Fic L nga, Sa Truckea CA  Grass Mailey. &4 Raosevila CA uncoln, BA
LA ce.r'!n'ﬂed"" ) WNo Ha
Temms ™ ] ' Met 30 Net 10th
Buf Price per Ton Ho Bid Mo Bid M Bid 1 6550 % 58.00
Tax Rafe . ' T.250% T.250%
Tax Amaonl ’ § 475 & 408
Sublotat - 7o % 6006
LR Amoun! ’ 5 . &
Tenns Dese. * 3 - & -
"Rararance Price g Bid No thd RoBia . % 76255 50.0F

Lombinad Material and Haulirg Cost for 1/4" PG 6430
Minimum Quantity per Load = 5 Tons

County's Estimated Hauling Cost par Hour = $84_00/Hour
County's Haul Cost par Ton per Hour = §84.00/Hour divided by § Tons = $18.80 per Ton per Hour

Vulcan Materials, Rosevillg

Auburn : 5 85.57 2

Ref Price = ] 025 .
Trip Time Hauwl Cos! * Haui Cost Total Cost per Tan
Destnatisn . frowund frin, brs] per HaunTon per Tan [Ref_ Cost + Hawt Cost)
Lincaln .o Q7o S 3 16 80 = £ 1nmw 1 H2.01
Auburn Q.60 b ] 1680 = § 1512 1 8537
Baldwin Contracting, Lingoln
Ref Frce = $ . BROB .
np Time Haul Cost Haut Cast Toral Cast per Tan
Destination dround dp, s per HourTon per Ton (Ref Cogt+ Hayl Costh
Lincoin azs x 5 16 89 = % 4 20 3 64 26
Auburn . a.8p b3 3 16,80 = % 1344 - T3 50
Ranki Dastination for 174" Hi 64-10
. Baliwin Contracting, Lincoln
Destination Tatal Cast pear Ton Rank
Lingaln 4 ) B4 28 1
Auburn % 73.50 1
Vulean Materials, Roseviiie
Destination Toral Cost par Tan Fank
Lincoin 4 820 2

© Discount not used in guraluation if less than 10 days
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Pracar County Big No. 9756
Asphalt Concrete, Picked Up

Bid Evaluation

Exhibit A
FPage Gof 13

3/8" PG 6410

Material Reference Frice for 316" PG 64-13

Bidder Granile Telanart Vulcan Vulcan Baldwin
Conetruction Apgregates Miterals Malarials Cardracting
Flant Latahon Rud L rvsia, G Truckss. C4  Grass Valley T Rosewilla CA Lingaln, (A
LY certifieg? Mo ho o[+
Tarms * Net 30 Het 30 Met 101h
8id Price per Ton $ 55.00 No Bid Mo Bid % 8100 % 54.00
Tax Rale TIa0% 7230% 7250
Tax Amoun! 5 4,26 & 442 & 352
Subtatal 5 5226 5 6542 & IF.82
LVF Amount -3 - 5 - 5 .
Termg Disc. ™ % - i 5 - § -
Referance Price 3 58.26 WO Bid Mo Bid ] E542 & 57 92

Combined Material and Hauling Cost for Ha™ PG B4-10

Minimum Quantity per Lead = 5 Tons
County's Estimated Hauling Cost per Hour = $84.00/Hour
County's Haul Cost per Ton par Hour = $84 00/Hour divided by & Tons = $16 80 per Ton per Hout

Granlte Construction, Rio Linda

Ref, Frice = 3 59 26 .

Trip Tame Haul Cost Haw! Cost Total Cost per Tan
Deshinabion fround trip, hrsh par HoprTan par Ton {Ref Cost + Haw! Cast]
Lincoln +.50 X 5 1680 = 5 25.20 ¥ B4.4%
Aubum 2.00 S 5 16,50 = § 3360 3 82 BE
Virlcan Materials, Rosevilia
Refl Puce = ¥ 63.42 )

Trig Tirme Haut Cost Haul Cost Total Cast per Ton
Destination frovnd fnp, hes) per HoprTon per Tun Rel Cos! + Haul f
Lincaln 070 x § 16.80 = 5. 11.76 % 7718
Auburn G.90 ¥ 5. 18.80 = 3 1512 k] 80.54
Balawin Contracting, Lincoln
Raf Price = 3 57.82 :

Trip Time Haul Cost Raut Cost Tolal Cost per Ton
Oespnation {round fnp, kst per HourTon par Ton (Ref. Sost + Haul Cesi)
Lincain 0.25 X 3 16 80 = ] 420 3 G212
Albun .80 X 3 16,80 = % 13.44 ¥ T13E

Ranklngs by Destination for 3/8™ PG 64-40
. igranite Construction. Rio Linda Baldwin Contracting, Lingaln
Deshraton Fotal Cost per Tan Fan - Total Cost gper Ton Bark
Lingeln . - 2 84 45 3 ¥ 8212 1
Aubum ¥ 8k BB 3 % .38 !
Yulcan Materials, Ruseville

Destin Tota! Cosf per Tan - . Rank
Lisieain $ ¥Te 2
A ubirr 1 80 64 2

* Discount not used in evaluation if lass than 10 days



Fiacer County Bid No. 9756
Asphalt Concreta, Picked Up

Bid Evaluation

Exhibif A

Page Sof 13

172" PG 6410

Biader

Matarial Refarance Prica for 1j2" PG §4-10

Granite Teichart Vulcan Vialean B thardr

Conatrustion Aggragates Matarals Malarials Contracting
Plant Lacation R0 anda, Ch Trachee, Ca Grass Vallky. G4 Rosevills, DA Lincoin, Ca
L WE cartitpd ? Ho Mo Ho
Terms * Met 30 et 30 Het 10t
Bid Price per Torn ¥ 5375 Mo Bid Mo Bid 3 875 B 5300
Tax Rate T THUSL T.250% T250%
Tax Aot LS 417 < 426 % 334
Subtotal % 5792 3 G301 § 56.84
LWF Amount § . § . % .
Tarms Disg. * 3 - 3 . £ -
Refarence Foce 3 a7.92 No Big Ha Bid [ CEX-TI 55 84

Grapite Construction, Rio Linda

Mintmurn Guantity per Load = 5 Tons
County's Estimated Hauling Cost per Hour = §84 00/Hour .
County's Haul Cost per Ton par Hour = $84.00/Hour divided by § Tons = $16.80 per Ton per Hour

Combined Matarial and Hauling Cost for 1/2"' PG 64-110

Ref, Prge = | -1 £7.92

Trip Time Haul Cost Hauf Cost Tata! Cost per Ton
Peshination fraund trip, hrs] par HourTon per Ton {Rat. Cogl + Hau! Qo
Lincoin 150 « 5 16.80 = - 2520 3 8312
Aubwirn 200 [ g 16.80 = 3 3380 3 §1.52
Vulzan Materials, Rosevillg s
Ref Price = § 63,01 .

Trip Tifne Haw! Cost Haul Cost Total Cost per Tam
Dasimation {rownd irip_frs) per HourTon ) per Ton [Ref Tosl + Hau! Cost]
Lirsiin 0.6 X -4 16,80 = § 11.76 -4 7477
Auburn 090 % b 16.80 = < 15.12 $ 7813
Baldwin Contracting, Lincoln
Ref Price = ¥ 5654

o Time Hau! Cost Hau Cost Totel Cost ger Ton
Destinatizn (round inp, hrs) per Hour/Ton par Ton (Ret_Cast + Haul Cosf)
Lineair 0.2% ] -] 16.80 = & 4.20 -] 61,04
Auburn Q.80 x 1 16.80 = 5 13144 3 Th2a

nkipgs. tination for 1/2" PG 64-10
e Constr Linda Baldwin Contracting, Linsain
Dastingtion Tatal Cost par Ton Ramk Tolal Cost per Ton Rank
Linaoin ] Bz 3 ] 51.04 1
A S a1 52 3 ¥ FO.28 1
Vulcan Materials, Roseville

Destination Tots! Cgst per Ton Fank
Linca'n k1 T4I7 2
Adrbiun 3 TE 13 Z

* Discourd not used in svaluation if less than 10 days

41



Placar Courty Bidd No. 9756
Asphall Concrole, Pickad Up

Bid Evaluation

Exhibit A
Fage 7 of 13

r

3/4" PG 64-10

Matorial Reference Prics for 34" PG 64-10

Bigger Granite " Telchart Yulcan Yulean Bakdwin
Canatruction Agonagatan 14 Mutarizla Contractng
Piant Locaticn Ais binda, CA Treckee Ca GrassVatey, & Rosev.ls CA Lincain, CA
LVP cartified? Hu "N Mo
Terms * Het 30 . Met 30 Ket 10th
Bid FPrica per Ton 5 §3.25 Mo Bid No Bid 3 5650 % §3.00
Tax Rale 7.T50% 7.250% 7.250%
Tax Amouni % 4.13 H 414 5 kx:L}
Suhtatal % 57.38 % 6060 % 5684
LY Amount $ - . - - 0% -
Tamhs Cige. * 5 - ] - $ -
Refarence Price 5 57.38 Her Bd No Bid [ 6060 % A6.84

Combined Material and Hauling Cost for 3{/4" P15 §4-10

Minimum Guantity per Load = 5 Tens
County's Estimated Haullng Cost per Hour = $84 00/MHour
County's Haul Cost par Ton per Hour = $84 00/Hour divided by 5 Tons = $16.80 per Ton per H|:~l..ir

Granite Congtruction, Ric Linda

Ral Frige = 3 Lt
' Trip Time Haut Cos! Haw Cast Tokal Cost per Ton

Deshnation {round &ip, frs} per HounTon per Ton {Rel Cos! + Hawl Cast}
L:nceln 1.50 ¥ ] 16.80 L 5 2520 £ g2458
Auburn 2.00 H £ 186 &g = - 32 a0 I 0 98
Vulcan Materials, Roseville
Ref Price = § B0.60

Trip Time Hawt Cost Haul Cost Toral Cost per Ton
Destination fround Wip, hrs) per Moo Ten par Ton {Ref Cost + Haw Cosi)
Linesin 070 b4 § 16.80 = 3 11.76 ¥ 72.38
Aubum .80 X -] 16.80 = %3 1512 - 7872
Balgwin Confracting, Lincaln
Ref Priga = L] A6 84

Trip Time Hauwl Cast Hau! Cast Totat Cost per Ton
Destinalion [rond trip, hres) per Hour/Tan aer Ton. {Ret Cogt+ Haul Cosf)
Linegaln nas | L 5 16.80 = b 4,20 $ B1.04
Aubunn 0850 X - ] A8.80 = § 13 .44 3 T028

Rankings by Dastination for /4" PG §4-10
Granite Constiugtion, Rio Linda Baldwln Cantracting, Lincoin
Dresnnation Todal Cos? Ten Fank Total Cost per Ton Fank
Lincaln 5 a5 3 % §1.04 1
Aubuim % .98 k| 5 7028 1.
Vulgan Materials, Roseville

Degfination Total Cos! per Ton Rarni
Lingain b 7236 2
Auburn -4 THTE 2

* Discount nef used in avaluation If fess then 10 days




Placer County 8id No. 9756

Bid Evaluation Exhibiit A
Asphalt Concrete, Picked Up Page 8 of 13
| 114" PG 64-16 ]

Matarlal Referance Price jor 1/4" FG 64-16

Biader Granite Taichan ulcan Vultan Baldwin

- Construcdon Aﬂmgi.ta: Halarakn Matwriale Coplracting
Flant Locaton Hio unda, CA Truckes, To, Grass atay, CA  Rosewile, C& Lingen, GA
LVF certifipd? Ne © WNe
Terms * Hel 33 MNet 101h
Bid Frice per Ton No Bad Mo Bid 3 £4.00 Mo Bud 3 £8.00
Tax Rate T.ATE% T.250%
Tax Amount 3 472 § 4.08
S_HMOIEJ ] 6372 $ &0.06
LVFP Amount 2 - g -
Tams Disg. ~ 3 - £ .
Reference Price No Bid Mo Bid § G8.72 Mo Bigt 5 50 05

Combined Material and Hauling Cost for 1/4™ PG 64-15

Minimum Quaniity par Load = £ Tons
Gounty's Fstimated Hauling Cost per Hour = $84 00/Haw
County's Haul Cost par Ton per Heur = $84 00/Hour divided b'_.r 5 Tons =$1 5 a0 per Ton per Hour

Yulcan Materials, Grass Yalley

8#1.08 1

Raf Price = % 6872 :
Trip Time Haul Cost Haul Cast Taal Cost per Ton
Destination [round g, hes) per Hourf Torn ger Ton [Raf Cost + Haul Costh
Tahoe Extecds 1-1/2 hour roundtip travel tima limit. . '
A burn : : ' 1.00 W -3 16 80 = LB 16 89 ] B5 52
Colfax ) . 1.00 ) % 5 16.8¢ = & 15 & % B5.62
Baldwin Cantracting, Lincaln .
Rel Frice = 5 B0.06
. Trip Tt Hau! Cost Hauwl Cost Tatal Cost per Ton
Destination frond frip, hrs) per HourrTan pger Ton {Ref_Copsd + Haw! Cosl)
Tahce Exceeds 1-1/2 haur roundtrip travel tme limit.
Aubum 0.20 L ¥ + 168D = b 13.44 i 7350
Coalfax 1.25 3 $ 16.80 = k] 21.00 § #1065
Rankings by Desti for 114" PG &4-1
. N Material rass Vall
Destingtion Tatal Cos! per Ton Rank
Tahoe Exceeds 1-1/2 hour roundtrip ravel ime dmit
Auburn . 2 8552 2
Colffax -] #5582 2
_ Baldwin Contracting, Lincoln
Dashnaton Tolal Cost per Ton Rank
Tahoe Exceeds 1-1/2 hour reundirip travek time it
Aubum : 5 F3.50 1
Colfax 5

* Discount not uzed in evaluabion if less than 10 days
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Placer Counly Bid No, §756

Big Evaluation

Asphalt Concrole, Proked Up

Exhibit A
Pagae 9 of 13

3/8" PG 64-16

Matarial Raforenca Price for 18" PG G416 '
Bidder Gradiite * Talehant Wulean Wukcan Bualdwhn
Conshruclion Aggregates Matarials Materlals Contracling
Plant Lecanan Ao Linda, CA Trzzhee Db Grasg Vacey, GA o Roseule GA Leain Ch
LVP cerbfied? No Mo Mo Mo -
Terms " Net 360 1-§12% 160th Nat 30 Net 18R
Bid Frice per Ton i E500- % 0 G400 3 6. 50 Mo Bid $ 54.00
Tax Rate 7.0E0% T.B75% 7.375% 7.250%
Tax Armount 3 428 3 S04 0§ 446 & k7]
Sublotal % 5026 % Bada § &4 86 g 5782
LVE Armount 3 - 3 - H - & .
Terms Qige. ~ % - $ 104 5 - 5 -
Reference Price 5 3926 & 6800 £ G4 98 No Bid 5 57 02
Combined Material and Hauling Cost tar 38" PG 64-16
Minlmum Quantity per Load = § Tons
County's Estlmated Hauling Cost per Hour = 384 .00/Hour
County's Haul Cost par Ton per Hour = $84.00'Hour divided by 5 Tons = 316.80 per Ton per Hour
Granite Construction, Rlo Linda
Ref Frice = 5 50 24
Trp Time Haw! Cost Haut Cost Tofal Cast per Ton
Bestnation [round trin, hrsl per HourTon par Tan (Ref_Cost + Haw! Cast)

" |Tahwe Excesds 1-172 howl raUndtrip ravel Lime simil :
Aubum pgeln] * § 15 89 = % 3360 § 02,88
Colfax 250 b $ 16 89 = % 42.00 3 101.26
Telchert Aggregates, Truckes
Rel Price = H 68.00

Tnp Twne Haul Cost Hael Cost Totat Cosl pevy Tan
Destinghon {rapnd g, hrs per HourTon par_Ton {Rat. Cast + Haw! Cosl)
Tahoe 0,80 X € 16 80 = £ 13.44 .3 8144
Aubuam Excaods 1-1/2 howr roundinp travel time lirmit. :
Coltan Exceads 1-142 hour oundtrip travel time ot
Yulgan Materials, Grass Valley
Rel Frice = ¥ 54 365 L
Trig Time ' Hati Cost Haut Cost Tatal Casl par Ton
Destinafigo wip f ) per HourTen par Tan {Ref. Cost + Hawt Cosl)
Tahoe Exceeds 1-1/2 hour roundirip trave! time hmit. .
Auburm 1.00 x 3 1580 = 1 16.80 ) B176
Calfax 1040 x 3 16.80 = 5 165.80 % B175
Ba'dwin Contracting, Lincoln
Ref, Prica = E 57.92
) Trp Tma Haul Cast Hawl Cost Total Cos! par Ton
Destingahon fround inp, hre) per HaTon par Ton [Ref Cosl + Haw Cosfl
Tahoe Exceads 1-142 hiwr roundtng irave] lime |umit,
Auburn D& x % 16.80 = £ 1344 3 71.368
Colfax 1.25 x -1 18,80 = § 1.0 3 78.92
- Rankings by Destinatlen for /8" PG E4-16
. Granite Constructicn, Rie Linda Jeichent Aggregates, Truckas
Lestingtion Total Cost per Ton Fank Totkal ¢ T Rank
Tahoe Excends 1-42 hour roundtip ravel ime lirmt 3 144 1
Auburn : % 3286 3 Exceeds 1-1/2 hour reundinp travel time fimit.
Cofax . b 101 2% k] Exceeds 1-1/2 hour roundtnp iravel ume imet.
Vulcan Matepials, Grass Valle Bakdwin Contracting, Lincoln
Dastination . Tojas r T Bank Totat Cost per Ton Fank
Tahoe Excends 1.1/Z houwr rounoinp travel yme limil.  Excesds 1.162 Bour roundtrip traves ime limil
Aubum 5 8176 2 3 71.36 1
Colfax § 81.78 2 1 18.%2 1

©* Diseount nol used in evaluation if less than 10 days
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Placer County Bid No. 9756

Bid Evaliiation

Asphaft Concrete, Picked-Up

Exhibit A
Fage 10 of 13

1/2" PG 64-16

Material Referance Price for 1/2" PG 64-18

Bitidter Granite Taictwart Wultan Vulgan Baldwin
Canstnsction Aghrigates Kateriale Makgrialy Contrasting

Flan! Loegton Rig Lewla. GA Truche, A Grass Valley, G2 Rosgwlle, G2 Lincaln, CA

LVF centiffed? [ [=] Mo Ne Mo

Terms * Met 30 1-112% 108 Mel 30 Bt 10 _

Bid Price par Ton $ 53756 % B300 % 458 25 Mo Bid : 53.00

Tax Rale T.750% 7.875% 7.375% 7 258%

Tax Amount -1 417 & 455 % 43D % 384

Subtatat % 5792 % 6756 % G258 3 E6. B4

LR Amount ) - 3 - H - ¥ -

Terms Digc = 3 - 5 1.02 % - - ] -

Raference Price H 5782 § 6654 3§ 52.55 Na Bid g SE B4
Combined Material and Haullng Cost far 112" PG §4-16

Minimum Quantity per Load = 5 Tons

County's Estimatec Hauling Cest par Hour = $64.00/Hour

County's Haul Cost par Ton per Hour = 2884 00/Hour divided by 5 Tons = $16.80 per Ton per Houwr

Granlte Construction, Rio Linda

Ref Frce = 3 5792 .

Trip Time Haul Cost Haw' Cost Totat Cost per Ton
Lestination frovnd trip_higl - per HowrTon per Ton {Rat Cogt + Hau! Cost)
Tahoa Exceeds 1- 142 hoye roundtnip travel ime limit.

A 2.00 PO 5 15.80 = % 3360 -1 91.52
Colfax 2.50 ) x 5 158D = .5 42.00 3 99.52
Teichert Aggregates, Truckee

Ref Price = 3 55.94

Tap Time Haut Cost Haul Cost Tatar Cast per Ton
Degtination fraund trig, hres . per Hour Ton per Ton {Ref Cost + Hawl Cost)
Tahos 0.80 ' x § 16.80 = § 13 44 5 B0.38
Aurbilarn Excesds 1.1/2 nour roundtrip travel time limit.

Colfax Excerds 1142 hour rqundtrip travel time lrrt.
Wulcan Materlais, Grass Valley
Ref. Frice = 5 62,85 .

Trig Trme Haul Cost Hauwi Cost Tatal Cogt par Ton
fPesunation {round frp hrg} per HourTon per Ton (Raf Cost + Haol Cost)
Tahoe Exceeds 1-1/2 hour reundinip travel lime limil. :

Aubuin 1.00 X 3 15.80 = £ . 168D < 7435
Colfax 1.00 % g 16 40 = 5 16.80 3 79.35
Baldwin Centracting, Lincaln

Ref Frice = 5 56,84

Teip Tima Haul Sost Haul Cost Tolar Cost per Ton
Deglination {round trp, nrs) per HourTan per Tan (Raf Cost » Haul Cost)
Tahoe Exteeds 1.1/2 hour roundtng Wavel tirne limit . ]

Auburn [eR-14 Y 3 16.80 = £ 1344 3 D28
Colfax 1.25 % § 1860 = 5 21.00 § 7784
Rankings by Destination for 1/2”7 PG §4-16

. Granlte Congtruction, Rlo Linda . Teichert Aggregates ches
Daghimation Total Cost par Ton Fank Talai Cost per Tont Rank
Tanoe Exceeds 1-1/2 hpur roundip trave! Gime hmit. 3 A 38 1
Aubum 5 9152 3 Expeads 1-1/2 houf roundtrip travef tirme limit
Colfax H 99492 3 Exoeads 1-1/2 hour roundtrip dravel tima limit.

Vulgan Materials, Grass Yalley Baldwin Contracting, Lincoln

Dagtinatinn Tatal Cost per Ton Rank Total r Tan Rank
Tahoe - Exceeds 1-1/2 hour roundtrip Travel time hmit. . Excesds 1-1/2 hour roundyip travel fime limit.
Auburn % 7435 . z ) § 7028 1
Cobfax b 7525 i 5 7754 1

* Discowf nol used in geaivation if iass than 10 days

1



Piacer County 8id No. §756 Bid Evaluation ' L Exhibit A

Asphalt Concrale, Ficked Up _ : Fage 11 of 13
| 314" PG 64-16 . |
Material Referance Price for 3/4" PG 64-16

Gicider Granie Talchard Yulcan 'U'\-.Ilﬂlﬂ Baldwin

Conalrustian Aparegates Malariais Materlals - Lontracking
Plant Locadion o Linda, C& Trochee, TA  Grass Valley 4 Rosawille, CA vndaln, Ca
L WP cerlifigd? Mo Mo No Mo
Terms * el 34 14172% 10t | MNet 30 NeL 10h
Eid Frce per Tan § 5325 % 6200 % 57.00 Mo Bid -4 53.00
Tax Ralz 7.750% 7Fa75% T ITEY% 7 250%
Taw Ampunt g 413 % 4B5 § 4.20 3 184
Sublotal 5 5738 & E623 § 61.20 5 5684
LUP Amount i - % - ¥ - % -
Terms Disg. * 3 ] 100 % - - -
Reference Price § 5738 % g562 8§ §1.20 Ho Bid 3 5654

Combined Matarial and Hauling Cost for 314" PG 63-18

Minimum Cuantity per Load = § Taris
County's Estimated Hauling Cost per Hour = 384 00/Hour
County's Haul Cost per Ton per Hour = $84.00fHour divided by 5 Tons = §16.80 per Ton per Hour

Granite Construction, Rlo Lingda

Rel Priceg = § 57.38 . .
: Trig Time Hauw Sost " Hatd Cos! Total Cost per Tor
Dreshination . {round trig, kel per HourTan par Ton [Raf_Cost+ Haul Cost)
Aubuorn 200 ® 3 15 80 = 3 3360 3 a0.98
Coltax 2.50 X $ 16.480 = S 42.00 b3 a9.38
Telchert Aggregates, Truckee
Dhgstination .
Auburm Exteeds 1-1/2 hour roundtnp travel irme ket
Codfax Esgeeds 1.1/2 hour roundtnp travel trne limit,
Yulcan Materials, Grass Valley
Ref Price = . % 81.20
Trp Time Hat Cost Haul Cost Total Cast par Ton
Destnation [rowund g, hes) ger HoyriTon per Tan {Ref Cost+ Haul Cesl)
Aubuen 1.00 X § 16.60 = 5 16580 b TB.00
Collax S1.ma . X 5 16.80 = 3 1680 i 7800
Baldwin Contracting, Lincoln
Ref Price a 5 56 B4 .
’ Trip Time Haul Cost Haut Cogt Totat Cost per Ton
Destinakion [round fap firgt : per HopgTon por Ton iftaf, Cost + Haul Onsit
Aubiutn R X § 16 &0 = § 13.44 3 T0 28
Collax i 1.26 ¥ 1 16.80 = % C2103 ) -3 TF.B4
Rankings by Destination for 314" PG 6416 )
Granite Conatructipn, Rle Linda Baldwin Contracting, Lincoln
Lestinalita - Total Cosl par Ta Rk Toxfo Cpst per Toe Rank
Aubum . 5 LR k| ¥ 028 1
Colfax ’ $ 9438 3 $ 7764 1
" Yulcan Materlals, Grass Valley
| Desttation Jotar ot per Tan Rani
Aubum § 7800 2
Colfax k3 78.00 2

* Discoun nol used in avalfuation if fess than 10 days 5 A



Piacar Counly Bid No. 9756 Bid Evaluation ' . Exhibit A

Asphalf Concrete. Picked Up - Page 12of 13
( 1/4" PG 64-28 : . |
Matarial Refarance Price for 1/4" PG 64-28
Bidder Granta Taichen WVukean Vutean Ealdhwein
Construction Aggregates Materials Matartaly Cantracting
Plant Lecahon - Rooada, CA Trigxes, Ch GeassVallay. A Rosey b CA Lincen, CA
LW cartified? No
Terms * Mal 1Hh
Bid Frice per Ton Ko Bid No Bid - Ho &g Mo Bid ¥ 55.00
Tau Rale . ' ' 7.250%
Tax Amouni b 4.7
Suhtotal 3 G874
LVP Amount o 5 -
Temns Dise, ™ ) 5 .
Reference Prce NG Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid E 54 71

Combingd Material and Haullng Cost for 3/4" PG §4-16

Minimum Cuantity per Load = 5 Tons
County's Estimated Hauling Cost per Hour = 384.00/Haur
County's Haut Cost per Ton par Hour = $34.00/Hour divided by 5 Tens = $16.80 per Ton per Hour

Baldwin Contracting, Lifcaln

Destination
Tahos Exceads 1-4/2 hour roundUhip travel fime i
3/8" PG 64-28 I
Material Rafsrance Prica for 3/8" PG 64-28

Budger Granks “Twichert Vulcan Vulean Balchwin

Constructlan Aganrgaley Taburials Materidla Eontracting
Biant Lacalion Fio unda, Ca Treckas, A Grassvallay CA Rosavila Ga Lincain Ghy
LVP cerdfied™ He - Ha
Terms * 1-17&% 1tHh MNel 10th
Bid Price par Ton W By % T4.25 M Bid No Bid g 61.00
Tar Rale 7HTSY 7.250%
Tax Amaun! 5 585 -3 442
Subtatal % BO.10 3 G542
LVF Amount i 3 . 3 -
Temms Disc. * £ 1.28 3 -
Aefarence Prce Mo Bid 5 78.50 Ko Brd Mo Bid 3 G542

Combined Material and Haullng Cost for 3/8" PG §4-28

Minimum Quarntity per Laad = £ Tons
Gounty's Estimated Hauling Cost par Hour = $84.00/Hour
County's Haul Cost per Ten per Hour = $84.00/Hour divided by 5 Tons = $16.80 per Ton per Hour

Teichert Aggregates, Truckee
Rel Prce = ] TE. 2

. ' Trp Time Haul Cost Haul Cost Yotar Cosgt par Ton
Pestioation {round Irip, hrs per Hour/Ten per Ton (Rl Cost + Hawl Casll

Tahoe . D80 . x 3 16.80 = ¥ 1344 b 52.34

Baldwin Contracting, Lincoln

Destination
Tahoe Exceads 1-1/2 holr roundiip trave! time limit.
Rankings by Destination for 3/8" PG 64-28
Taichert & ates, Truck
Dastination Total ot per Ton Hank
Tahoe 3 9234 1

* Discount nof used in avaluation if 1ess thap 10 days \55



Pracer County Bid No. 9756 Bid Ev'a‘.‘&aﬁgn ' Exhibit A

Asphait Concrate, Piched Lip Fage 130f 13
| ' 1/2" PG 64-28 |
Material Reference Price for 1/2"” PG 64-28
Bidder Granke Telchart Vulcan Yulean Baldwin
Construction Aggrigits Materidly Matarinis Coniracting

Plant Localion R Linga. Ca Truckms ©A  Grass Welley CA Rosawnlie, T4 Lingain, A

LY comfind® Ha . No

Terms 1-12% 10th Het 10th

Bid Price per Toa M B 3 73125 Mo Bid Mo Bid 3 B1 Q0

Tax Rate T.B7S% T 250

Tax Amourt ] 577 . $ 4,42

Sutintal 5 79.02 ¥ G542

LVP Amoprt -3 . k2 -

Terms Cisc. * 5 1.1% 3 -

Referente Frge Ma Bid ] 77.83 Ko Bid W Bid 3 6547

Combined Material and Hauling Cost for 1/2" PG 64-28

Minimurn Quantity per Load = 5 Tons
County's Estimated Hauling Cost per Hour = $84.00/Haur
County's Haul Gost par Ton per Hour = $84 00/Hour divided by 5 Tons = 216.80 per Ton per Haur

Taichert Aggregates, Truckes

Ref Free= :] 7r.83
Trpg Time Hawl Cost Haul Cost Tatal Cast per Ten
| Destinalion froung fnp, hes) per HourTon per Ton fRef. Cost + Haw Cost)
Tahoe : 0B x 3 1680 = 3 13.44 ] $ 5127
Baldwin Contracting, Lincoln
Desinakon )
Tahoa . Excesds 14102 hour roundtrp ravel tme kmit.
- Rankings by Destination for 1/2" PG 64-22

Teichgrt Agaregates, Truckes
Destingtion . Total Cogt per Ton Rarnk
Tahge . $ ot 27 1

* Diseount nof used in ovaluation if less than 10 days : : 5 /_}



FISCAL IMPACT STATEMENT

TC.;r: " Honorable Board of Supervisors
FROM: Ken Grehm, Director
DATE: January 22, 2008

SUBJECT: Fiscal impact Statement
RQ048669 for Asphalt Concrete Purchases

Fiscal Impact Statement Examples

The department has budgeted appraopriately for this purchase and funding is available in the FY 2007-08
department budget. g :
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