COUNTY OF PLACER
Community Development Resource Agency

Michae! J. Johnson, AIGP { BUILDING
Agency Director Bob Martino
Chief Buitding Official
MEMORANDUM
TO: Henorable Board of Supervisors
FROM: Bob Martine, Chief Building Official
Building Department
DATE: April 7, 2009

SUBJECT: Placer County Local Building Code Amendment Clean-up of Article 15.04 of the Placer
County Code.

ACTION REQUESTED:
The Building Department of Placer County recommends the Board adopt an Ordinance
amending Article 15.04 of the Placer County Code and a Resolution adopting findings pursuant to

Health and Safety code Section 17958.5 authorizing lacal modifications to the California Building
Standards Code.

BACKGROUND:

On January 1, 2008, Placer County was mandated to enforce the 2007 California Building
Standards Codes, based on the 2006 Edition of the International Building Codes. In order 1o
seamlessly transition Placer County's existing local amendments into the new Califernia
Codes, the Placer County Board of Supervisors adopted the 2007 California Building Code on
November &, 2007, with local amendments, for an effective date of January 1, 2008.

ANALYSIS:

Since adaption of the 2007 California Building Code, the Building Department and building
community have been working to understand and implement many of the new code
requirements. The California Building Code, now based on the International set of codes, has
presented challenges for the continuing and consistent application of Placer County specific
requirements, due to the differences in code philosophy, As with any new document, within the
process of becoming more familiar with the differences, nuances and complexities of this code,
instances have come to staff's atiention where additional language, clarification, and
corrections to the local provisions are needed.

There are also recognizable differences between this code and past codes whereby some of
the previous provisions that served as the core for the implementation of the County's local
requirements no longer exist. As an example,

+ The adopted code does not address certain requirements of the siate's accessibility
reguirement making it necessary to insert language into the County’s Building Code to
insure proper compliance.

191



« Permit and plancheck expiration timeframes have been addressed to maintain
consistency with historical and cuirent county paoficy.

+ Swimming pocl barrier requirements are inconsistent with California law.

+ Snow-load design criteria requirements have changed making it necessary to expand
Placer County site specific snow loading.

These changes constitute the administrative needs for the department to continue with
enforcement requirements, and assist in insuring uninterrupted application of the current code
with no additional costs or new regulatory burdens associated with these revisions.

As noted in the attached Exhibits, other minor technical changes are proposed to assure
consistency with adopted state regulations. These proposed changes will allow the County to
implement its Building Code in a manner consistent with state law and in a manner consistent
with past County practice. There will be no fiscal impact to the county due to these
modifications and these changes will aid the design and building community with cost-effective
design criteria.

FISCAL IMPACT:
Adoption of the revisions to local amendments would have ne fiscal impact.

Chief Building Officiat
Aitached to this report for the Board's information/consideration are:

Attachments: Exhibit 1- Ordinance amending Placer County Code, Chapter 15, Relating
to Local Code Modifications and Requirements.

Exhibit 2 ~ Resolution adopting Express Findings pursuant to Health and
Safety Code Section 17958.5 authorizing Local Modifications to the -
California Building Code Standards.



Before the Board of Supervisors
County of Placer, State of California

In the matter of: Ord. No.:
FIRST READING:

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING PLACER COUNTY SECOND READING:
CODE, CHAPTER 15, RELATING TOQ LOCAL :
CODE MODIFICATIONS AND REQUIREMENTS.

The following Ordinance was duly passed by the Board of Supervisors of the County of

Placer at a regular meeting held , by the following vote on

rofl call:
Ayes:
Noes:
Absent:

Signed and approved by me after its passage.

Chairman, Board of Superviscrs
Alttest;
Clerk of said Board

Ann Holman

THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF PLACER, STATE OF CALIFORNIA,
DOES HEREBY DOES ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Article 15.04 of the Placer County Code is hereby amended and
reinstated in its entirety as described on attached Exhibit A.

EXHIBIT 1 )q’j



Article 15.04

BUILDING AND CONSTRUCTION CODES ADOPTEDY

Sectlions:
P5.04.080 Adoption.
15.04.020 Waiver of fees.
15.04.330 Compiiance by specral districts.
L5.0:4.040 Aduption and authorization for amendments to the uniform fire code.
15.64.050 Construction—BRuildings.
L5.04.060 Building permits during construction of subdivision improvements.
15.04.070 Building permits on agricultural property.
15.04.080 Elcetrical.
15.064.0%0 Uniform Mechanicul Code,
1504, 100 Additions and amendments to the Uniform Plumhbing Code.*
[3.04.110 Generally.

The 1958 Edtion of the Unifm Bolding Code {UHC) was adepted 5-19-53 by Crdinance 335-H For other provisians see Oedimanges 413-B,
1%9.0_165-B, 480K

The 1238 Fdinor of de Uieform Boilding Code (URC) was replaced on 9-16-64 by (he 1964 Edrzan LDC \-\'Il‘h Ordinanze 663-1 Fer ather
previsioags see Ordmanees $37-11 54008, 359-B, 584.B, 571-B, 8208, 660-B.

The 19ad Bdiw of the Uniform Bailding Ceds (UBCY was replaced on 1O-19-67 by the 1967 Tditon UBC with Ordinanse 963-8 Far other
previzions see Ordinances 670-00 924-B, 1061-H 1206-B, 1351-B, 1303-B, 13348

The 1907 WTC wis replaced on [1-00-7T0 by ke 1970 UBC with Ordinanes 1342-B For other provessaons see 1383-8, 1333-8, 1411-B, 13174,
H6K-B, L474-H 1492.03 1498-B, [552-B 1333-Bis92-B

The 1970 URBC was repiaced oo (2-02-T4 by the 1973 UBL wieth Ordinance 1694-13 For other provasions see L7473 17455, 17388, 1772-3,
1840-5, 1338-B, 18431, 18a2-00, [R81-8, [R34-B, 15871 1906-1, 1907-8, 19158, 193003, B-1920

The 1973 UBC was replacel on G9-24-70 by the 1970 UBC walk Onbnanes 2053-10 Foe other proviaioes see 212128, 2122-8, 1U39-8, 2193.H.
2303-B, 2324-H, 235700, TLUES1E, 2434-3, 2454, 2480-1, 437-R, 200908, 24858, G0H, 1610, 75768 2508-B, 26438

The 1975 LB wus replacet on 11-[6-79 by the 79 U wilh Crdinance 2664-18 For otker provasions see 2717-014, 2826.8, 38876, 248943,
FOA-D, 2068-B, 2SR 3014, 6K, WERE, 3028 306-B, 31098, J120-B, 315-B, 31A0-B F20G-RO3I0R-E, 3220-B. 3285-0
3234-13 32BE-ER, 329T-BADV0-TE 332000 3324.8, 33241 3137-B, 1338.B, 3340-R 5359-0 3260-B 34276 3120, 5481-5.35LT-H

The F97% UBC was replaced or 061543 by ahe 1982 DBC wath Ordinance 3572200 Yor other pravisaaons see 33763 36518, 30850, 3637-B,
3T03-B 57000

The 19232 UBC was replaced on £2 11-24-85 by the 1985 UBC wih Ordinance 5736-B Fur alher provisions ses 3805-H, 3862.8) 38988,
SH0G-13. 3901 -B, 3906-B, 33170 3910.5 3947-B d075-13, 40§53

The £983 CHC was replaced on 91-01-93 by the 1225 1UBC wak Cranance 423313 Far other gronisions see 4133-B, $185-1 4222-5. 4239-8,
2850, A312B, 43530 Fha LOR- RO arrrophveddon-Glabd o e phu e 00 D500 '

The 1988 LR was iepluced an 3-14-92 by the 1991 UBE with Ordmance 843214
The 19910 UG was replaced o 1-1-94 by the 195 VI with Crdinance J685-T4
The 1994 U was coplased on July 1, 1999 by the 19597 UBC, wuh Cridnzance 4939-8

The 1997 URC was replaced on November. 6, 2007 by ahe 2007 California Buildieg Code, with Ordipance 3490.H

EXHIBIT A qu)



15.04,010 Adoption.

Pursuant 1o authority of Government Code Section 30022.1 et seq., no less than one copy of cach primary code and
cach sccondary code periaining thereto, all certified lo be true copies by the clerk of the board of supervisors, haviog
been filed in the office of the ¢lerk of the board within the time required by law, the latest published editions of each of
the following codes, and all volumes thereof and amendments thereto, are, in accordance with the California Health and
Safely Code, adopted by reference and modified herein, including International Building Code Appendix Chapter 1 -
Adrministration, Appendix B - Board of Appeals, Appendix C Group U — Agricultural Buildings, Appendix [ - Patio
Covers, and Appendix ) Grading. '

A

Internationzal Building Code 2006 cdition as adopted in The Califorpia Building Standards Code {The 2007
California Building Code), which adopts those standards with state agency maodifications within the scope of
their authority.

Wational Electrical Code 2005 edition as adopted m The Califorma Building Standards Code (The 2007 Cali-
fornia Electric Code), which adopts those standards with state agency moditfications within the scope of their
authority, published by the National Fire Protection Association, Caiifornia Admimustrative Code, Provistong
for the Wational Elecirical Code, 2007 Edition, published by International Cede Council {ICC).

Uniform Plumbing Cede 2006 cdition as adopted in The Califernia Building Standards Code, including appen-
dices {The 2007 California Plumbing Code), which adopts those standards with state agency modifications
withian the scope of their authority, published by the International Associalion of Plunibing and Mechanical Of-
hicials,

Umform Mechameal Code 20006 edition as adopted in The Califerrua Building Standards Code, including ap-
pendices (The 2007 Califorma Mechanical Code), which adopis those standards with stale agency modifica-
tions within the scope of their authority, published by the International Assaciaticn of Pluntbing and Mechani-
cal Officials (IAPMG),

Intentational Existing Building Cade 2006 as adepred in The California Building Standards Code (The 2007
Calitarnia Existing Building Code), which adopts those standards with state agency modifications within the
scupe of their authority and as limited by Health and Safety Code 19360 et seq., published by ICC.
International Fire Code 2006 edition including Appendices’ as adoepted in The California Building Standards
Cade {The 2007 Califormia Fire Code), which adopts these standards with state agency modifications within
the scope of their authority, published by ICC.

International Property Maintenance Code 2006 Ldition, published by ICC, as medified by The Califurnia
Health and Safcty Code, Title 25 of the Califomia Code of Repulations, and as further modified i Artigle
15.56.

The following codes and standards arc adopted as reference documents and may be used by the chief building
official n accordance wilh California Building Code Sections 194,10 and 104,11 in a case by case rcview
process: Uniform Building Code 1997 edition, Uniform Swimming Poal Code, Spa & Hot Tub Code, pub-
lished by LAPMO; published supplements to the International Codes; ‘The Internanonal Residential Code; The
2006 Intermational Fuel Gas Code; The Urban Wildland Interface Code, published by the Internalional Fire
Care Institute; The Umiform Sign Code, published by ICBO; IBC Appendix Chapters; National Fire Prolection
Association Standards; the Uniform Solar Energy Code, as published by [APMO; American Nabional Sian-
dard, published by American Natienal Standards Institute, Inc.; Masonry Fireplaces, Masonry Instilute; and
other Nationally recopnized Standards. (Ord. 5200-B (part), 2002: Ord. 4959-8 {part), 1999: prior code § 4.1}

15.04.020 Warver of fees.

It is vealized that in regard to certain pareels of land, and ownerships thereof, it may work a particwlar hardship for
the awner to conform 1o the fee requirements of this article, For that reason, an owner may make a written application
1o the board ol supervisors for waiver of the fec provisions of this article. (Ord. 5200-B (part), 2002: prior code § 4.3)

Y7



15.04.030 Compliance by special districts,

Each special district within the county ol Placer with an clected governing board, including, but not linuted to, dis-
tricts, cemetery districs, reereation and park districts, utility districts, and sanitary districts, shall comply with all Cali-
fornia  Industry Codes as heretofore or hereafter adopled by ordinance of the Placer County board of supervisors; pro-
vided however, that each such special distriet 15 at its option delegated full autherity 1o enforce each such code for s
own projeets without oblaining a permit from, paying fees to, or obtaining inspections by the building department of
the county of Placer. Special districts which require that the county enforee the California Industry Codes shall pay the
normal fees, (Ord. 5200-1 {part), 2002: prior code § 4.3)

15.04.040 Adoption and authorization for amendments to the International Fire Code.

Al

E.

. Internatienal Fire Code {TFC) as adopted above with approved amendments and appendix chapters, and all

State Firé Marshal codes delegated to local agencies, are to be enforced by the Chief of each fire district, €54,
or as designated by contract. [n the absence of the above, the Office of Emergency Services shall act as the
County Fire Marshal, Where provisions in the IFC conflict with State statotes/regulations or County ordi-
nances, meluding but not limited to the Placer County Land Development Manual, the State statute/repulation
or County ordinance shall povern.

Pursuant 1o State Health and Safety Code Scetion 138697, all fire distnict amendments (o the IFC will be valid
after such amendments are first avihorized by the fire district board and then approved by the board of supervi-
s0rs.

Section 103.1 of the IFC, Department of Fire Prevention — Gencral, 15 amended by adding:

The Chicf of & fire department/district, with the written approval of the Board of Directors of the particular fire
department is authorized to make and enforce such rules and repulations for the prevention and control of fires
and fire hazards as may be necessary from lme to time to carry out the intent of this Cade, Three centified cop-
ies of such rules and regulations shall be filed with the Clerk of the jurisdiction and shall be in elfect immedi-
alely thereafter. Pursuant o State Health and Salety Code Section 13869.7, rules and repgulations that involve
building standards will be valid when approved by the Board of Supervisors.:

Section 108 of the IFC, Board of Appeals, is amended by adding:

Tn arder 1o determine the suiability of altetnate materials and type of construction and to provide for reason-
able interpretation of the provisions of this code, there is hereby appointed a board of appeals conststing of the
board of directars of each fire pratection district fer matters within their jurisdiction and the Placer County
Building Board of Appeals in the remaining areas of the County. The Chief shall be an ex-officio member of
the Beard and shall act as secretary to the Board. The Board shall adept reasonable rules and repularions for
conducting its investigations and shall render all decisions and findings in writing to the chiel with a duplicate
copy o the appellant and may recommend to the Exccutive Body such new legislation as 18 consistent
thercwidh,

Appendix Chapier | Section 109.2 of the IFC, Nence of Violatien, 15 amended o add the lollowing:

The Chicf of any fire department/district within the county or histher authorized representatives shall have au-
thority to enforce this code and issue citations for vielations in their respective jurisdiction.

The follewing is added 10 Section 202 — Defimitions of the TFC:

Fire Hydrant shall mean a hydrant supplied by a 6 inch or tarzer branch line, one or more pumper connectian
(4%7 inch) and 2 or more 244 inch outlets, capable of supply required fire flow [or at least 2 hours.

Section 903.2 of the [FC, All occupancies except Group R, Division 3 and Group U Occupancies, is amended
to read, Where Required, add the lollowing:

An approved automatic sprinkler system shall be installed where the occupancy/building has 3,600 or more
square feet of 1otal floor area, cxcept where other sections of the IFC or the California State Fire Marshals
regulations, andfor lecal fire disirict ordinances applicable to a project are more restrictive, then the more re-
siriclive shall apply. Where additions increase the total size of the building t 3,600 square feet or more, the

14



addition and the existing occupancy/building shall be provided with an approved automatic sprinkler system.
[ire separation areas shall not be used 1o reduce this requicement.

Section 903.4 of the 1FC, Sprinkler System Monitoring and Alarms, is amended to read:

All valves coniroliing the water supply for auiomatic sprinkler sysiems and water-flow switches on all sprin-
Kler system s shall be electrically supervised. Valve supervision and water-flow alarm and wrouble signals shall
be distinetly difterent and shall be amtomatically transmitted to an approved central station.

EXCEPTION: Group R, Division 3 Occupancies will only be monutered if required by the local jurisdiction,
Section 907.2 of the IFC, Where Required - new buildings and shuctures, is antetded to read:

All eccupancics except Group R, Division 3 and Group U occupancies shall have an approved automaue fire
alarm system installed when the cccupancy/building has 1,500 square feet or mare of tofal floor area unless
other sections of the IFC or California Stare Fire Marshals regulations are more restrictive, then the more re-
strictive shall apply. Fire alarms systems shall be in accordance with Section 907 of the IFC or NFFA 72
(1995 if the specific occupancy is not covered in the IFC. Additionally, all A, E, H and I occupancics shall
have an automatic smoke/heat detection systiem installed in additon to any other sysienys) required by this
code, when required by the local authority having jurisdiction. Where additions increase the total size of the
building to 1,500 square feel or more, the addition and the existmg occupancy/building shall be provided with
an approved automalic smoke/hear dewection system,

Secction 3404.2.9 5. 1of the IFC: “Locations where above ground tanks are prohibited™ is antended to read:
Storage of Class | and Class I flanamable liquids in aboveground tanks outside of builldings is prohibited
unless approved by the Fire Chief having jurisdiction, using standards not less than the IFC or recognized
cquivalent,

Section 3406.4 of the {(FC, Bulk Plants or Termrunals, is anended to read:

No new bulk plant shall be constructed within the limits ¢stablished by the Flacer County zoning ordinance, as
linuts of the districts in which such plants are prohibited. Where allowed portions of properties where tflam-
mable and combustible liquids are reccived by tank vessel, pipelines, tank cars or tank vehicles and are stored
ar blended in bulk for the purpose of distributing such liquids by tank vessels, pipelines, tank cars, tank vehi-
cles or containers shall be in accordance with IFC Section 3406.4

Scciion 34011 of the 1FC, Scope and Application, 1s amended by adding the following:

It shall be unlawful 1o store flammable liquids as defined in Chapter 34 of the [nternational Fire Code includ-
ing gasoline and other motor fuels, in above ground storage containers, either portable or installed, 0 a RS,
RM, RA, RF, F or AE zoned area on a parcel of less than ten (10) acres. In areas where above ground storage
15 permitted, minimum distances from property lines and struciures for a tank of any Lype shall be not less than
50 feer. The himitations/prohibitions of this section shall also apply to arcas in Sguaw Valley designated as
Low Drensity Residential (LDR), High Censity Residential {HDR), Forest-Recreation or Conservation Pre-
setve, In addirion, the limitations! prohibitions of this section shall apply to areas in the Lake Tahoe Basin
which are designated as Tourist! Residential, Toutist, Residential, Recreation and Conservation.

Any above ground storage must be approved, in writing, By an official of the appropriate fire protection de-
pariment/disrrict. This section shall not be applicable to portable containers suitable for such storage of 5 gal-
lons or less.

Section 2301 of the IFC, General, 1s amended by adding the following:

Tires: No person shall pile, cause to be piled, or maintain any pile of tites (of any manmefactured material) at a
height greater than ten (10} fegt, excepr in approved horizontal storage racks, measured in all cases from the
ground level, Tires shall be neatly piled and in na case shall any one pile oceupy more than two hundred (200)
square feet of floor or 1ot area. An aisle of at least ten' (10) feet shall be maintained at all times between the
piles in such a manner as to allow free access,

Appendix C, Table C1035.1 of the IFC, Number and distribution of fire hydrants, is amended to read:

147



TABLE € 105.1
NUMBRER AND DMSTRIBUTION OF FIRE HYDRANTS

FIRE-FLOW MAXIMUM DISTANCE FROM ANY |
REQUIREMENT AVERAGE SPACING RETWEEN | POINT ON STREET OR ROAD
{gpm) HYDRANTS™* (feer)” FRONTAGE TO A HYDRANT?
MINIMUM NO.
X 385 for |fmin. OF HYDEANTS X 3048 for mm
1,000 - 1,750 2 300 250
2,000 - 2,250 2 300 | 735
2,500 3 300 235
3,000 3 300 275
3,500 - 4,000 B 4« 300 20
4,500 . 5,000 5 0 B 180
5.500) - 6 300 180
6,000 i 6 250 150
6,500 - 7,000 7 , 250 150
7500 or mere 3 or more” 200 12{}

1. Reduge by i00 teel for dead-end streets or rouwds

Whers gtroets are provided witl median dividers sehich can be erossed by Nrefighlers pulling hose lines, or arterial streets are phgvaded with four

ot mue radfic Jancs and have a traffic count of more than 30000 vehicles per day, hydrant spacing shall aversge 3040 teet (132.4m) on each side

of tlhe sieecl and be arranged o an allornaieg basis up W a fre-low reguirement of 7,000 gallons per minute (246 49351 min. ) and ) e (122

it gher fiee-low reguirements.

I Wherg new water mains are exionded aleng streets where hydranes are not needled for pratection of structurcs or similar five problems, fre hy-
drants shall be provided at nor less than 10000t (3035m) spacing 10 providy for ransportation hazamds.

4. Readigy by S0foel (13 240 miny) Boe dead-emd sirects or roaids. .

5 Une hydrant for each 1000 gallons per minme (3785 L/mincy or fracion therenf.

. Spacwig niay be incrozsed o SO0 far Single Family Dwelling Residenta] Sub-Thvisions.

[

{Ord. 5200-B (part), 2002: Ovd. 4935-B (part}, 1999: prior code § 4.10)

15.04.050 Construction—Buildings.
The tollowing sections of the International Building Code are modified by the following additions and delctions:
A Board of Appeals.

Appendix Chapter 1 Section 112 - Board of Appeals. Replage with the follawing:

{1) Created
There is hereby created in the County a Board of Appeals,

2} Composition: Appoinimeit
The Board of Appeals shall consist of nine members, not officials of the county, who are qualified by experi-
ence and training to pass upon malters pertaining o building construction, Two members of the board shall be
physically disabled persons and two members shall be Fire Officials or Fire Marshals in the county. The Chief
Building Official or his designee shall be an ex-officio non-voting member. The Board shali be appointed by
the Chairman of the Board ol Supetvisors with the approval of the Board of Supervisors.

(3 When Legally Constitered



(5)

(6}

(7

B.

The Bourd of Appeals shall be lepally consuruted to have jurisdiction te proceed to act upon the appointment
of the members thereof as hereinabove stated and cvidenced by an order of the Board of Supervisors duly en-
tered upon the Minutes of such Board.

Ternis of Office: Removal of Members; Filling Vacancies

a.  Non-disabled Members: The term of office of eagh member shall be four (4) years and until the first ap-
poinlment and qualification of his suecessor, The first members of the Board shall classity themselves by lot
so that the terms of office of two (2) menthers is two (2) years and of three {3) members four (4) years. Any
member, even though he/she serves for a term, may be removed by the appoiniment authority wn‘hcut cause.
A vacancy is filled only [or the unexpired term.

b, Disabled and Fire Official members: The ternis of office of each disabled member and Fire Official mem-
ber shal] be four (4) years and until the first appointment and qualification of his successor. The fiest members
representing each group shall classily themselves by lot so that the term of office of one member is two {2)
vears and of the other member four (4) years. Any member, even though he/she serves for a torny, may be re-
moved by the appointing authority without cause. A vacancy is filled only for the unexpired term.

Conmpensation of Members, Traveling Expenses -

All members of the Board shall serve withowt compensation. The members of the Board shall receive their ac-
tual and necessary travel expenses o and trom the place of meeting of the Board and while traveling in con-
nection with the business of the Board.

Powrers and Duties

The Board of Appeals shall:

a. Hear and determine appeals from Code interpretations of the Chief Building Officia) or his'her assignee.
Determination of appeal by Board of Appeals is final.

b.  Have the authority to determing the suitability of, and authorize the substitution of, materials and types of

conslruction equipment 1o those specified by this Code atd the State Housing Law on a project specifc

basis. Dctermination of appeal by Board of Appeals is final.

Act as an advisory body to the Beard of Suporvisors on all matters pertaining to the construction industry,

d. Promulgate rcasonable rules and regulations for conducting its hearings and meetings. Betermination-of

appeal-by-Poard ol Appealsisfinal:

[l

Applications 1o the Board of Appeals shall be made to the Building Department on forms provided by them
and shall be accompanied by o non-refundable fee as required by this cede. All appeals shall be filed within
thirty (30} days of the decision of the enforcement agency.

Violations,

Appendix Chapter 1 Section 113 - Yielations. IBC Section 113.1, add: Replace with the following:

Any person, Hirm, or corporation violating any of the provisions of this Code shall be deemed puilty of a rmis-
demeanar, { first offense may be handled s an infraction pursuant o Sechon -85 Chpt 1 Article 1.24, Chap-
ter 1, Section 1.24.010, Placer County Code} and each such person shall be deemed guilly of # separate offense for

each and every day or portion thereof during which any violation of any of the provisions of this Code is commit-
ted, continued, or permitled’and. upon conviction of any such violations such person shall be punishable by a fine
of not more than $300.00 or by imprisonment for not more than six (6) manths, or by both such fine and impris-
otnment. (REF: Sectoni-Tand-Secton-1-8-Chaptert Article 1,24 Chapter 1, Section 1.24.010, Placer County
Code, for general penalty provisions ) Any punishmsnt under this seclion does not waive any requirements for
Code compliance.




14.

15,

16.

15.

19,

20.

Zi.

C.

Work Not Requiring a Building Permit:

Appendix Chapter 1 Section 103 - Permits, Deiete [BC sectton 1G5 1.1 and 105,13

Work exempt from pérmil. Add IRC Section 1052 (14 - 22) to tead as follows: (Sce IBC Section 105.2 for para-

vraphs 1 throughl3)

Agricultural buildings or stuctures as defined in IBC Section 202, on any property “zoned F, RF, AE, ar RA,
consisting of 10 or more acres” or California Land Conservation properties, when such property and build-
inggs) are primarily used for agncultural putposes or when such buildings or structures are necessary to the ag-
ricultural development or use of such property, arg exempt from a building permit when they comply with this
section. The provisions of this section shall not include the owner's oy lessee’s dwelling or private garage, ef
any human habitation which is held out for rent or lease or sale. An owner or lessee of such propenty may ob-
tain the services of the Building Depariment for buildings herein exempt, provided he/she applies for 2 bnld-
ing permit and pays the fees therefore. All buildings exempted under this section shall still be governed by the
provision of the Placer County Plumbing, and Electrical Codes. A setback verification pernut for a struciure,
wot herein exempted, will be isswed for an agricultural building in the above zones wpon presentation of an ac-
ceptable plot plan, {2 copies), a departmental approval form indicating Planning Department approval, which
may also require approval by the Agricultural Commissiongr, and payment of the current prescribed recording
and handling fee,

Second exit seasonal snew tunnels for dwellings whiclt comply with Placer Countly Zoning requirements, are
temporary buildings and are excmpted from building permit requirements.

Gantry cranes and similar equipment used in conjunction with a valid building permit and removed upon
expiration of the permit or completion of the work covered by the permit.

Radio and 1ekevision antennas which do not exceed 43 feer in height and ground suppeoried dish antennas not
cxceeding 15 feet in height above finshed prade in any position.

Sheds, setf-contained portable offices, or storapge buildings, and other structures incidental w and for work
authorized by a valid building permit. Such structures tust be removed ypon expiration of the permit or com-
pletion of the work covered by the permit,

- Playground equipment.

Exception: Cemmercial sites shall be accessible and play surfaces shall meet minimuin Stake of Califor-
nia_regquiremenis,

Wire fences not over 12 feet in height for residential uses and other fences not over six feet in height.

Repairs which invelve only the replacement of component pants or existing work with simiilar materials only
for the purpose of maintenance and which do net aggregate over 1,000 in valuation in any 12-month period
and do not affect any electrical of mechanical nor more than two squares of roofing,

Repairs exempt from penmit requirements are minot and shall not include any addition, change or modifica-
tiort in use or in construction. The determination of the applicability of this excmption shall be within the dis-

cretion of the Chief Building Official.

Specifically exempt from permit requirements without limit to valuation are:

A00



{2) Panting and decorating.
(h) Installation of Aoor covering.

fc) Cabinel work, pxcept when cabinet work contains plumbing, electrical or is requircd by CBC
Chapter 11 to be accessible.

Decks and platforms accessory to R-3 gecupancies 1ot more than 30-inches abeve grade and not used as
part of the required exiting system.

D. Permit Issuance.

Add 1o Chapter 2 Section 202 Definilions:

BEDROOM: A room that meets the minimum dimension. area, and height reguirements for a hahitable
ronm as specilied in Section 1208.3 and that has an adjeining area or space that may be utilized as a
closet. whether or not the room is actually utilized for sleeping purposes.

Appendix Chapter | Section 1053 Application for Permit:
Add ihe Tollowing to IBC Seetion 105,31, Action on Application:

a.  Prior wo the ssuance of any butlding permut, approval from the Fire District ts required for fire code llems
adopted by State law, County Code or by the Fire District when approved by the Board of Supervisors.

b, Prior to issuance of any building permit, a certificate of compliance is required from school districts (ex-
cept where exempt by State law) and from fire districts where a capital facilities plan has been approved by the
Buoard of Supervisors.

Change IRC Section 1055, Expiration, o read as follows:

Unless otherwise awthorized, every permit issued by the Building Official under the provisiens of this Code
shall expire and become null and void 1wo years from the date of issuanee. The Chiel Building Official may
issuc & permit for a lesser time period when necessary to abate dangerous or sub-standard conditions. This
lesser time period may be appealed by the owner. Any permittee, holding an unexpired permit, who requests
in writing, qualifies for ane ¢xtension of 3 current {2 year} permit for one year. Upon approval of the Building
Ofticial a sccond one-year exiension may be granted. The fee for extension shall be as prescribed in the Build-
ing Drepartment Fee Schedule,

BGefore any work can be recommenced on an expired permit, a new pormit shall be oblained. The Cades in ef-
fect at the time a new permuit 15 issued shall be the Codes which apply to thut permit through the point of com-

pletion ar expiration, whichever occurs first.

Change [BC Section 108.3.2. Time limitation of application, t¢ read as follows:

An application for a permit for any work shall be deemed to have been_abandoncd and expired 1
vear after the daie of filing, unless such application has been extended prior to that time. Any apphi-

cant, who requests in writing, prior to the expiration qualifies for a single one vear extension. Upon
approval of the Building Official a second one-vear extension may be granted. The fee for extension

shall be as prescribed in the Building Departmeni Fee Schedule.

A0



1.

2.

All permits issued under the provisions of the Placer County permit allocation ordinance, Placer County Code,
Article 15.24, and those permits extended between the dares of July 28, 1982, and the date of Ordinance 3681,
will expire concurrently with the expiraiion of their respective TRPA permiit. All permit holders who desire o
extend their permits beyond August 1, 1986, musi pay the prescribed fees listed below 1o cover the cost of
admimistration, wmspection, and/or plan check,

app}m-&s—we#as—a—p}anehetHeeﬂd—p}an—eheek—amem—eades alse&pply [‘.qﬁhiy {30} percent of the unused
portien-afthefeespaid may-beapplied to-the extension,

b-Pemstis isrsued O mtay%%hﬁm%mmmmm}mw

{he&mm&amp!ehng—m%mspeﬁmﬂ&ﬁaﬁ}dauﬂ%&%%ﬁmswnm} shat-bepaid:
& a. PPermits issued afier the date of Otdinance 3681 shall have the same time frame constraints and expiration
dates as those esiablished by TRP A,

2. b, Building permits will not be issucd unti! approvals have been obtained from all county departinents.

memmmmimmmﬂm-ﬁams

E. Permit Fees.
Add to Appendix Chapter | Section 108 2 - Schedule of Permut Fees

All building vaiuation fables shall be as determined by the chief building official based vpon the ICBO Building
Standards valuation dara dated April 2002 and adjusted each January 31 according to the “Staze of California De-
partment of General Services California Construction Cost Index (CCCIY” eor as authorized by applicable laws,
Waluativns not lisied in the ICBO Bulding Standards Valuation Data shall be valued per the Building Valuation
Dar Supplerental. The Building Valuation Data Supplemental may be cxpanded administratively by the Chief
Building Official in ovder ro clarify or cover additional types of work and situations. Fees based on hourly rates shall
be adjusied by the chiel building official cach January 31st according to the State of California Department of Indus-
triat Relations “Consumer Price Index - California for Ail Urban Consumers (CPIY™ for tlw inost recently available
twelve (12) month reporling period. Any fecs also may be madified fron time to time by resolution of the board of
supervisors, The chiel building official shall maintain the current fee schedule; the chief building official shall make
the current fee schedule available for public review upon request.

The valuation to be used in computing the building permit fee shall be the wetal valuation of all construction work
tor which the permit is issued, as well as all roofing, mechanical, electrical, plumbing, heating, air conditioning, ele-

vatars, fite extinguishing systems, racking systems, and any E:-lher permmanently installed equipment affixed to the
building or structure,

Delete Appendix Chapter 1 Section 108.3 - Building Permit Valuations.
Amend Appendix Chapter 1 Seetion 108.2 = Schedule of Permit Fees. Add:

Building Department Fees shall be as prescribed in the Building Department Fee Schedule,

A3



[
H

Fee Table,

Scotton 108.2 - Permit fees - Fee tables, Add:

tee Tables 3-A & 3-B shall be used for the calculation of fees as prescribed in the Building Department Fee Sched-

ule

G.

Other Building Permit Fees.

A reinspection fee may be assessed for each inspection or reinspeetion when such portion of work for which an
inspection is called is not complete or when comections called for are not made. This section is not in b inter-
preted as requiring reinspection fees the first time a job is rejected for failure 10 comply with the requirenients
of this code, but as controlling the practice of calling for inspections belore the job is ready for such inspection.
Reinspection fees may be asscssed when the inspection record card is not posted or otherwise available on the
work site, the approved plans are not available to the inspector, for failure to provide aceess on the date for
which the inspection is requested, or for deviating from plans requiring the approval of the building official

o instances where reinspection foes have been assessed, ne additional inspection of the work will be per-
formed until the required fees have heen paid.

Residential partial inspections and phased projects idenfified during the inspection process that reguire
additional inspections shall pay the ice prescribed in the Building Department Fee schedule, The nuni-
bker ol inspections shall be determined by the senior inspector or supervising staff,

When services for inspection or plan review are provided to the County by a consultant, the rate the applicant
shall be responsible 10 pay will be as determined by the contractual agreemient between the county and the con-
sultant. These fees apply in addition to any fees due the county.

Subsequent standard plans are not acceptable when they differ from the prior set of plans that were submirted,
including but net limited to, 1.e., different subdivision, different snow load, different topography, different soils
conditions, dilferent building in any respect. The standard plan approvai shall be reviewed uhe year from date
ol application to verify compliance with any newly enacted requirements, which may be subject to additional
plan review and associated fees. Decause of snow conditions and differing exposure coefficients, standard
plans are not acceptable above five thouwsand (5,000) feet clevation.

The cost of inspection services provided by the building department that do not relate to the pormits discussed
in section E, T, or (¢ and to which no lee 15 specitically indicated, will be charged the [ee prescribed in the
Building Department Fee Schedule. In instances where inspection Irips are reguired oulside the county, the fee
prescribed in the Building Department Fee Schedule {plus any addirtonal costs to the Coumy) will be charged
dwring narmal business hours,

Mobile bome installation fegs shall be based upon the latest version of Title 25 of the California Administra-
tive Code.

Expired Penmits.

P
&



=

In-l

1.

a. The cost of a new (two-vear) pernut 1o complete a partially completed structure shall be the estimated cost to
complele inspections at a rate prescribed in the Building Department Fee Schedule, per inspection trip, but not
to excecd the aimount of the origmal building permit fee, and any applicable plancheck fees, plus the prescribed
adnumistrative fee,

b. Permits nay be granted an administrative ninety (90) day extension without fees upon approval of the chief
building official or assignee.

A grading fee as presciibed in the Building Department Fee Schedule (community development/resource
agency) will be charged of all new single-family dweilings and mobile homes an private property outside the
TREA area. This does not include additions or replaccment maobile hames when the same installation pad is be-
ing used.

A fire-safe regulation fee as prescribed in the Bullding Department Fee Schedule will be charged on all single-
family dwelling applications except for additions/remnodels and replacements of exisung legal dwellings. This
fee is not applicable for projects in the North Tahoe Fire District.

Permil investigation fees (double fees) shall be assessed when work ig performed withour a permil. The fee
shall be based on the computed cost of the permit fee, plancheck, plumbing, elecirical, and mechanical fee.
Exceplions: '

a. When work was necessary in the opinign of chief building official to comrect an immediate hazard and an
application is filed for a permit within the next three normal county werkdays.

b. When work was performed by a previous owner and the current owner did not create the vielation and is
obtaining proper permils) to correct the violation.

c. The property owner_has voluntarily contacted the building {Ienarlment to remedy unpermiited con-
struction that would have normally required a building permit at the time the work was performed.

Permit Fee l-::templiuns-and Refunds,
Appendix | Section 108.6
Add the Tollowing to IRBC Section 108.6;

Excmpiion from Fecs.

Fhe-County-of Placer orany Department, Board o Officerthereof acting on behal Fofsaid-county, anyMu-

picipal-or Quast-municipaleerporation—orsovermmentshall-not-be-reguired-to-payunyfeesrequired-by this
Cerdde-

The huilding official shall net authorize refunding of any fre paid except on written application filed by the
ariginal pernuittee not later than the date of expiration of the plan revicw or building permit, as applicable.

Inspections.
Appendix 1 Section 109 - Inspeciions.
Add the following to [BC Seetion 1091, General:

Cxcept where special inspection is specified in Section 1701, the building official may authorize allemative -
speeton procedures requiring declarations from duly licensed professionals.

Ll

404



Certificate of Occupancy.
Appendix 1 Section 110 - Certificate of Occupancy.
Add the following to 1BC Section 110.1, Use and occupancy:
Certificales of occupancy will not be issued without approvals of alt appropriate County departments and the
Fire Departnent/Distriet when such depantments/districts have conditions of approval made part of the permit

by the Board of Supervisans,

Such 3 certificate shall not be issued untl compliance with all County requirements has been met. Occupying or
using a structure without this approval shall constitule a public nuisance.

Add the following o 1BC Scetion 110.2 Certificate Issued: and delete iten 10,

The certificate of occupancy shall be posted in a conspicuous place on the premises and shall not be removed
except by the building official, '

Exception: The Certificate of Qecupancy need not be posted in U and R-3 cccupancies.

Smoke Detectors.
Scetion 907.2.10 Single- and Mulliple-station smoke alarms.
Add the following to IBC Section 907.2.10, Location within dwelling units:
Smoke alarms in additions and remodels are to be interconnected to alarms in the existing structure when the wir-
ing for such alarms is exposed in the construction/remadel, or when otherwise accessible through an attic, crawl
space, or basement. Note: The local fire authority having jurisdiction may require additional safeguards when

adopted and cnfced by the fire depariment/district pursuant to H&S Code 13869.7,

Residential Swimming Pool and Spa Barriers.

Amead 1BC Bection 310442 e 2-Changetoread-as-follows;
The-poolshatHre-equip
Amend IBC Section 310%.4.4 2 Trem 3 1. Chartetoreadasfollows: Add:

A barrier shall be provided for pools. Where a wall of a Group R, Divizion 3 Occupancy {including attached
parage) serves as part of the barrier required by section 3109.4.4.3 and contains door openings between the dwell-
ing unit'garage and the outdoor swimming pool that provide direct access to the pool, the residence shall be
equipped with exit alarms on those doors providing direct aceess to the pool. Doors provided with alarms shall
make continuous and audible sounds throughout the dwelling for a2 minimum of 30 seconds within 7 sec-
onds. and shall be capable of providing & sound pressure level of not less than 85 dBA when Lhe door and
its screen, if present are opened or left afar. The alarm shall automatically reset under all conditions. The
alarms may be cquipped with 3 means o temporarily deactivate the alarm for a single opening. This de-
activation mechanism shall be at least 54 inches above the door threshold. Alartns may be battery operated
or may be connected to the electrical wiring of the building. The alarmis) can be individual alarmgs) at each
door.

AW



Amend 1BC Section 3109.4.4.2 3 Ttem 5. Change to read as follows:

5. Inall cases, ownersinccupants are responsible for maintaining all reguired enclosures/barmiers and safety clements.
Anend IBC Section 3109.4.4.3 ltern 2. Change to read as follows:

2. The top of the barrier shall be at least 60 inches above grade measured on the side of the barrier that faces
away fom the swimming pool. Any gates other than pedestrian access gates shall be equipped with lockable
hardware or pudiocks and shall rernain locked at al! time when not in use. A permanent sign shall be posted

which reads: “this access to be kept locked at all nmes.”

3. Diriveway eates that are part of the enclosure are to be electronically operated and automatically close
within one minuie of heing opened. .

M, Outdour Lights Serene Lakes.

Section 312 -- Utility and Miscellaneous Group U Add the following as new subsection 312.2, Ouwdoor
liphtis/Serene Lakes: '

Any garage constructed afier March 1, 1985, in the Serene Lakes Subdivision will be required to provide an
exterior light installed on the street side of the garage. This light shall be controlled by a photo cell and shall be
in operation between the months of November through March,

N. Suil Types Conventional Construction.
IBC Section 23081, 1-- Portions exceeding lHmitations of conventional construction.  Add the following:
Structures which otherwise qualily, tor Conventional Construction may utilize soil profile types C or D based
an the desipn professionals assessment of the site in combination with public records maps, such as maps from
the California Division of Mines and Geology. This does not apply where a soils report identifies conditions
sufficient to classify the site as E or F as defined in the 2006 IBC.

O Building Addresses.
Scction 502.2 - Address Numbers, Add as a new gection ta read as follows:
Approved numbers of addresses sholl be placed on all new, remodeled and aliered buildings {commercial
and/or residential) in such a position as o be plainiy visible and legible from the street or road frenting the
property. Whenever the mimbers on the building will not be clearly visible from the access street or road front-
ing the property, the numbers will be placed at the siteet or aceess road in 2 manner which is clearly visible
from both directions of travel on the road/streel. Said numbers shall be a minimum 3 inch lotter height, 318
inch stroke, reflectorized, and contrast with their background, or may be a mininwm § inches high and contrast
with their background,

P. PMacer County Snow and Wind Design.

Wind and Snow Design Criteria.

1. Permus will net be perrutted in high or moderate hazardous arcas or sites as identified by Piacer County Code,
Chapter 15 or Article 12.40 such as avalanche, flood, mud-slide or other degipnated hazardous areas unless an

13

ADb



6.

architect, civil or structural engineer licensed in California certified that the strucwure will be safe under the an-
ticipated hazards, and the structure complies with anticipated loads and conditions.

Exception: Struciures exempt from the avalanche standards as described im Article 12.40, Placer County Code.

Those stouciures which have received a structuwral design approval from Placer County as well as those which
are repetitive in design and have received a structural design approval may at the pernuttee’s oplion, use either
the existing snow design criteria or the snow design criteria in this subseciton for a peried of time not to ex-
ceed one year from the effective date of the ordinance codified in this subsection.

Notice to buitders—Warning. New structures which are in a partially completed state during the winter months
will probably experience severe damage from snow, ice, and wind. It will be the responsibiity of the pernuties
to ensure that his or her partially completed strueture is such as to resist all of the winier weather elements af
Placer County.

IBC Sectiom 1608 - Snow Loads is adopted with the following:
a. Add the following to detemiine snow loads action on structures in Placer County:

NOTE: Occasionally there may be large local deviations from the typical data from which this Code was de-
veloped, When applying these values to structures the desipner should make every effort to determine if the
tabulated values should be adjusted because of local wpographic effecis. Loads for structeres which have an
inherent need for a high desree of safery, or long Life span, should be carefully evaluated. and the designer
should always exercise his best professional judpment. The following snow load and design requirements are a
NI

Amny stress increase for load duration allowed by the NDS per IBC Section 2306.1 may not be wsed above
50007 elevation unless an architect, civil or structural engineer, licensed in California can show that the design
load will not exceed two (23 months™ duration during the Life of the structure,

Scisinic loading for snow leads shall conply with ASCE-7 Section 12.7.2.

Rool and snow loads for all mobile homes, mobile home accessory buildings, commercial coaches, and factory
built housing shall comply with the snow loading for other structures. (Exceplion: Maobile homes in mobile
home parks and mobile homes where Pg s less than 100 PSF shall cormply with Title 25 of the California Ad.
ministrative Code.)

TEC Chapter 16, Section 1698 is amended to read by adding:
1. Where Pfis greater than or equal to 30 P.5.F., all building exits shall be located where not subject to or pro-
tected from sliding or impact snow and ice. All building eaits shall mean all required exits in Single Family

Dwvellings and appurtenant strucloves, and all building exits in all other occupancies,

2. All unheated overhangs shall be designed for ice dams and accumulation by multiplying the Pfby 1.5, Heat
sirips ar ulher exposed heat methods may not be used in lieu of this desipn.

3. Where Pgis 100 P.S.F. or greater, hot or cold mop underlayment roofing is required as noted in CBC Sec-
tion 1507.2.8.2,

[BC Section 1608, Add the following:

Ab7



Design Requirements for Conventional Construction Structures:

Structures normally governed by Section 2308, which are located in areas where the roof snow load exceeds
50 pounds per square foot, shall have both the gravity and lateral structural system designed by duly licensed
design professionai(s). Such structures, which otherwise qualify (or Conventionat Light-Frame Construction in
Seclion 2308, may utilize soil profile types of C of D based on the design professional’s asscssment ol the sile
in combinatien with public record maps, such as maps from the California Division of Mines and Geology.
This does not apply where a soils report has identified soils conditions sufficient to classify the soil type as E
or F as defined in the 2006 1BC

[BC Section 1608 —Ground snowloads. Add (he lollowing:

TABLE A-16-C
GROUND ]
ELEVATION ARGVE  SNOWLOAD Pg SNOW DENSITY  MAXIMUM ANTICIPATED
SEA LEVEL {P.S.F) D (PCF} SNOW DEPTH Dg
Use IRC Table 160701
| Up 1o 660
: 1,000 ft. 104
1001 — 1600 {t, (*) 20# 20,0
1,607 - 2,500 ft. (**) 204 20.0
2,501 - 3,000 fi, 554 200 1.0 fi.
3,001 - 3,500 ft. T4 20.0 IR I
2501 - 4,000 fl LO0H 20.0 S0 f.
4,007 - 4,500 fi. 1604 27 6.5 It
4,501 - 5,000 ft. 200# 24.5 82 ft.
5,001 - 5,500 fi. 2608 26.7 9.7 fi.
5,501 - 6,000 ft. 3158 27.0 1.7 fi.
6,001 - 6,500 fi. 1754 29.6 12.7 ft.
6.501 - 7,000 it 4306 30.1 14.3 fi.
7,001 - 7,500 ft. 490 30.6 16.0 ft.
7,501 ft. up 545% ) 2.4 168% i

(*}(**} Bee notes below

Applicable West of the West Scction line of Scctions 20, 29, and 32 of Township 17 North, Range 16
East and Sections 5, §, 17, 20, 29, and 32 of Township 16 North, Range 16 East and Sections 4, 3, 2, 11, 14,
23, 26, and 33 of Township 15 North, Range 16 East and Scctions 2, 11, 14, and 23 of Township 14 Nerth
Range 16 East,

TABLE A-16-D
ELEVATION ABOVE  GROUNDSNOW  _SNOWDENSITY ~ MAXIMUM ANTICIPATED |
SEA LEVEL LOAN Pz (P.SR) __ D(PCF) ____ SNOW DEPTH Dg ]
5,001 - 5,500 1305 236 5.5t
5,501 - 6,000 100# 23.8 7.9 ft
6,000 - 6,500 _ 245 245 10.0 i
6,501 - 7,000 3004 25.0 12.0 ft.
7.001 - 7,500 3608 25.2 14.3 1.
7,501 - 8,000 400 255 15.7 fi.
8,001 ft. up 445 25.7 17.3 1, ;

15

A0Y



Applicable East of the East Section line of Sections 20, 29, and 32 of Township {7 North, Range 16 East
and Sections 5, 8, 17, 20, 29, and 32 of Township 16 norih, Range 16 East and Sections 4, 3,2, 11, 14,23 26,
and 15 of Township 15 I\m‘[h Ranf:c i6 East and Secrions 2, 11, 14, and 23 of Township 14 North Range 16
Euast,

Note:_All elevations shall comsider the minimum design live loads indicated in Table 1607.1 slong with
allowable redoctions to determine the most restriclive desien eriteria.

i*) Raof load reductions for any structural member based an section 1607.11.2 are not permitted above
1,000 fi. elevation, Interpolation mav be made at 100 I, increments {any fraction of 100 0. will be Lon-
silered as 100 1)

(**) Roof live load reductions specified in section 1607.11.2 are not permitied above 1,600 ft. elevation,
Interpolation may be made at 100 It increments (any {raction of 10D ft. will be considered as 100 £t

M@H&Hﬂ&h&éﬁd%ﬁmﬁeﬁﬁmu—mﬁﬁmﬂmﬁm&

hasfedﬁn sectioﬂ—lr-&{i? 11 2—&{—&1]{}! pe%mﬂ{ed-ahew—l—{i{i&{r elevatmn Imew&lﬂhen-may be- mad&at—l@@—rl-n—
ereneptsfany-fnstion-of 00—l ba considerad a5 1009

The ground snow leads within Sections 20, 29, and 32 of Township 17 North, Range 16 East and Sections
5,8, 17, 20, 29, and 32 of Township 16 North, Range 16 East and Sections 4, 3, 2, 11, ¥4, 23, 26, and 35 of
Township 15 North, Range 16 East and Sections 2, 11, 14, and 23 of Township 14 North Range 16 East shall
be based upon a straight line proportion between the values shown in Tables A-16-C and A-16-D based upon

- the distance of the sile from the transition zone,

IBC Chapter 16, Seetion 160%. Add the following Tahle A-16-E:

TABLE A-16-E*

{IMPACT LOADS TO BE USED IN CONJUNCTION WITH THE 2007 CBC CHARFER- 23 AND CURRENT

I IMPACT BEFORE (MPACT

v VERTICAL DIFFERENCE | GPPER FACTUR LOWER ROOF OR

i BETWEEN ROOFS GR ROOF DECK LOAD TOTAL DESIGN LOAD LOWER

+ STRUCTLRES LOAD | {Fr} ROOF OR DECK (DOWNWARD)**

| _Less than or equal to 5 g PL {Upper) 0.0 Bf{Lower} 1 BoPl{Lower)

! Greater than .5 Hp but less 0.4 PI{Lower) P=[PF {Uppcr) = 0.4] +P{{Lower)
than ar ¢qual to 107" PT, (Upper)

. Gireater than 107 but |¢ss 1.0 Pf {Lawer) Py=[IG {Uppee) = 1.0] + Pr{lLower)

! than or cgual o 130" Ff {Upper)

| Greater thom 18707 Pf, {Uppery | === | Pt { Lower) |_Special Analysis Required

Saew wiloadig need b be comsidered where the upper rool stope s less than 2:12.
Daesigne up-Tezt byl (retound) is calculated by the ollowing:

{Fonmula 20-3)
P = Impact factor = I'f {upper)

Design snow load shall not be osed to resist 1.

Pfs = Designed roof foad with poch reducion.
See RO Chapler 16 for ather symbol cxplanation.

TRC Seetion 1609 3—Basic wind speed. Section 1609.3 and Figure 1609 are modilied to read as follows:

A0Y



The basic wind speed® for Placer County shall be as follows: )
3 sec. gust per section 1609.3

FLEVATION ABOVE MEAN SEA LEVEL, | BASIC WIND SPEED {fastest mile)
| Up to 5000 feet 1 85 mph
5001 1o 7000 feet 25 100 mph
T001 1o 3000 feet . 04 105 mph
800! and Up 356 116 mph
Q. Plumbing and Mechanical Requirements in_ Snow Areas. for Loeations—Above Five-Fhousand
{5000} Feet Elevation,

AN new pas installations shall have equipment listed and approved for the conditions of anticipated use. Where
expnsed to snow and ice, the equipment shall be listed for those conditions. Placer County building depariment
dogs not repelate the mstallation of liquefied petroleum gas (LPG) tanks; however, location of (1LPGY tanks
shall be m accordance with the Uniform Mechanical Code and the Iniernational Fire Cade, the local fire de-
partment and/or the State Fire Marshal and the Tnternational Fire Code. Until fire districts adopt approved sian-
dards, the requirements in Placer County Code Articles 1512 and 15.16 or NFPA pamphier 38, at the discre-
tion of the fire chiet, are enforerable by the fire chiefs in areas above five thousand (5,000) foot elevation,

At or above five thousand (5,000} foot elevation, warter supply piping shall be protecied from freezing by a
minimum of thirty-six {36) inches of carth covering or equivalent insulation. Piping which is subject to freez-
ing shall not be insralled in unheated arcas or outside walls. Exception: In walls or floots adjacent to heated ar-

eas when the structural design necessitales, piping may be instalied within the assembly on the heated side of
at least R-19 insulation

The vater supply system, including hot and cold, shall be designed and insialled for winterization and freeze
protection, such as altowing for routine drainage of the system o prevent ficezing. The water supply shall be
equipped with a readily accessible shul off valve. Valve(s) and‘or drain port{s) when used shall be readily ac-
cessible, insulated for protection from freezing, and shall be protected from the potential for back fNlow.

All pas meters, valves, and equipment shall be protectzd from sliding, drifting, and intpact snow and ice. There
shall be a gas shut off valve at cach stmcture which is supplied with gas which is on the outside of the building
and 15 readily accessible at all times. Where Pg is one hundred (100) PSF or greater, there shall be a sipn di-
rectly above the shut off valve which is readily visible and located above the maximum amticipaled snow
depth,

Badfgrm California Flumbing Code Scetion 906 is amended to add subparagraph 906.8 1o read as follows:

All plumbing veats, B-vents, chimneys, and mise. obstruclions projecting through the roof shall be pro-
tected from damage by sliding snow or ice. These congitions apply whenever the roof slope is 3 units
vertical in 12 units horizontal {25% slope) or greater, except for those projections within 36 inches
of the ridge. This shall be accomplished by using suys, formed mel puards (“Cnickets™), saddles, or
other methods approved by the Building Official. This section shall apply at elevations above 5006 4,000
feet.

R. Roof Construction and Fire Retardant Requirements,

IBC Section 2308108, 1B Secuon 1503, and IBC Section 1310 Change IBC Sections 23058.10.8, 1503 and
Section 1310 - Revoefing by adding fellowing paragraph:

17

A1



a. Spaced roof sheathing is permitted when installed in accordance with [BC Table 1507-8 & Table 2304.7(1}
& 2304.7(2) when the design roof live load or snowload is less than 20 PSF and spaced roof sheathing is not
prohibited by the required listing of the roofing material or by the designer.

b. I3rafl slops conlfornung to IBC Section 117.3.3 & 717 4.3 are required in the floor/ceiling assemblies and
attics of residential occupancies. Drafi stopping shali divide the concealed space into approximately equal ar-
€as.

IBC 15415 and Table 1505.1: Roofs shall conform to the provisien of Section 1505 & Table 1305.1 IBC except
as herein modifed: (Provisions in IBC Chapter 15 which provide for less stringent roof r&nng& are not applica-
ble.)

a. Class A rating shall be the munimum roofing/assembly in the unincorporated pertions of Placer County. This
requirement includes Group R, Division 3, and Group U Occupancies.

b. All new construction, including additions, tequires Class A reofing/assembly as a mininwm. All re-roofing
requires Class A as a minimun. Re-roofing in excess of fifty (30) percent of an existing structure within any
one-year period will necessitate thar the entive roof be a Class A roofing/assembly as a minimum.

The local fire authority having jurisdiction may have different requirements when adopted and enforeed by the
firc district pursuant to H&S Code 13869.7.

Foundations and Slab Floor Maisture Protection,

1BC Sectinn 1805.2 — Depth of Footings. Add the following exceptions:

Exceptions: 1. A one-story wood ar mctal framed building not used for human occupancy and not over
4 viquare feet in 1lgor arca may be constructed with walls supported on a wood foundation platie when

approved by the building official. Provisions to address uplift shall be ineluded in the submittal,

Woad posts or poles ymbedded in earth shall be pressure treated with an aporoved areservative. Stecl

posts or poles shall be protected as specified in Section 1808.2.17

IBC Section 1914} - Minimum Slab Provisions. Add the following:

A minimum of four inches (47} of gravel shall be required under all slab on grade construction which will re-
ceive fleor covering materials.

Fire Proteetiondor-Chimheys

-

(H-bove S000-felevation—at-factoey buichiraneys serving solid-foelappliances -shall-be-exposed tathe

mmﬁnmmﬂ*ﬁwm%}tmwm&ﬂ va-Hw instde
with- 2 sheetrock-with-tiphijoints
bAllshafls pretectinpselid-fuelchimneysshall be sccessible forinspectionand-maintenance:




15.04.060 Building permits during construction of subdivision impravements.

A.  No building permit shall be issued within a recorded subdivision or planned unit development until such time
as all improvements required by the agreement between the county and the subdivider have been complered and ac-
cepted by the county, except that building permits may be issued priot 1o the acceptance of the improvements by the
county as provided in this section.

B. Tor projects at or below the clevation of five thousand (5,000) feet, once the permit applications have met all
other requirements for permit issuance, building permits with a restriction on non-occupancy of the structure will be
issued by the building department if the following conditions are met as determined by the departnient of Engineering
and Surveying: '

[.  The final map of the subdivision or planned unit develapitent has been approved by the board of supervisors
and duly recorded;

2 All pad grading required by the county has been complered:

3. Roads serving the building lot have been paved,

4, All underpround utilities are installed to the lot lines;

5. Urility systems have passed all required ests;

6. The subdivision developer, the contraclor responsible for constructing the subdivision improvements, and the
owner of record of the lot if tithe has been transfemed from the subdivider, have each executed a release 10 the satisfac-
tion of the county specifically authorizing the issuance of a building permat. The release shall hold the coumty, the serv-
ing fire entity and ulility cornpanies harmless from any and all liability from damages or losses resulting from early
permiit issuance. The release shall also provide that the county will hold the subdivision developer responsible for all
improvenents regardless of the presence of house contractors, material supplicrs, adesmen, or public in the subdivi-
sion, The release shall alsa hald the county harmless in the event that the subdivision improvemoents are not completed
and the construction of the hame or other structure is delayed and/or prohibited,

7. The locations of all structures and any required setbacks have been certified by a licensed surveyor and have been
submitted to the county.

. For projects above the elevaton of five thousand (5.000) feet, once the penmit applications have met all other
requirements for permul issuance, building permits, with a restriction that no construction beyond the foundation leve]
andronph-Famineispermitied, will be 1ssued by the building depariment if the following conditions are met as deter-
mincd by the departmient of public works:

1. The final map of the subdivision or planned unit development has been approved by the board of supervisors
and duly recorded,

2. All pad grading required by the county has been completed;

3. Roads serving the buiiding lot and fireAighting water service have been constructed to a standard approved by
the serving fire district and the county;

4. The subdivision developer, the contractor respensible tor constructing the subdivision improvements, and the
owner of record of the lot if title has been wansferred from the subdivider, have each executed a release to the satisfac-
tion of the county specifically authorizing the issuance of a building permit, The release shall hold the county, the serv-
ing fire entity and wiility companies harmless rom any and all hability from damages or fosses resulting from carly
permul issuance, The release shall also provide that the county will held the subdivision developer responsible tor all
improvemeiits regardless of the presence of housc conttactors, matertal suppliers, tradesmen, or public in the subdivi-
sion, The release shall also hold the county harniless in the event that the subdivision improvements are not compleled
and the construction of the home or othet Structure 18 delayed and/or prohibited,

5. The lucations of all structures and any required setbacks have been certified by a licensed surveyor and have
been submiited to the county; )

6. Securily in the form of cash, centificate of deposit, or letter of credit (the later two to be in a farm acceptable w
the county} shall be deposited with the county. This security shall be in an amount egqual o enre hundred twenty-five
(123} percent of the value of the unfinished infrastructure required under the subdivision agreement for the project. The
amount of the deposit shalt be based on an estimate prepared by a rewistered civil engineer and approved dy the cont-

Al



munity developmentitesource agency. The final amount shall be determined solely by the community develop-
menbresource agency. An additional agreement shall be entered into between the county and the subdivider {and the
property owner if 2 lot has been sold) 1o cstablish the terms of the release of any deposits required wnder this section,

7. The building department shall have approved a complete set ol building plans;

8. The local serving fire district shall indicate, in writing, that it is satisfied with the provisions for fire protection.

Each permit issued under this suhsection shall contain the following note: "It is expressly understood (hat 1o con-
struction cxcept the foundation of the structure will be permitted until all of the conditions of approval telating 1o the
subdivision shall have been met”

A processing [ee, payable to the department of public works, shall be charged for preparing documents and process-
ing permits under this subsection {“high elevation processing fee™.) The high clevation processing fee shall be in addi-
tion te any other required fees. The high clevation processing fee shall be initially four hundred ninety dollars
($490.00) and shall be subject to an annual consumer price index adjustment based on the State of Calilornia Depart-
ment of [ndustrial Retations Consumer Price index - California for All Urban Consumers, The high elevation process-
ing fee also may be modificd from time ta time by resolution of the board of supervisors.

D.  For madel homes, regardless of elevation, building permits with a resimiction on non-occupancy of the struc-
ture, once the permit applications have met all other requirements for permit issuance, will be issued by the bulidm;;,
department it the following conditions are met as determiined by the depaitment of public works:

1. Conditions of subscctions {B){1), (B)(2), (B)(6) and (BY7) of this section have been satisficd;

2. Al underground utility crossings within roadways have been installed and waterlines and fire hydrants serving
proposed model construction have been installed to the satisfaction of the serving Nire protection entity ar the developer
can provide written evidence fiom the serving fire protection entity that adequate fire protection can be provided for the
model homes;

3. Developer agrees in writing to remove landscaping and level the multipurpose easement Lo sidewalk grade ar
developer’s own expense as required by the utility companics prior 1o utility trenching operations;

4, Developer agrees in writing not to convey title to model homes for occupancy prior to utilities and improve-
tments being fully installed and accepied;

5. Developer agrees in writing that a mode] home shall not be used fer offices ner will public foot traffic be al-
lowed through such homes until 8 “temporary ceraficate of occupaney™ has been issued by the building department,
and. turther, that before a model home can be used for residence purposes a permanent certificate of oceupancy must be
obbaned;

6. Developer agrees i wriling that model homes shall not be connected to sewer laterals wnril all Tequired sewer
line testing has been completed;

7. Until such time as the utilities are installed and passed o the 1ot lines, developer shall provide written evidence
that the county has been named as an additional insured on the developer’s liability insurance in an amount to be de-
terihined. .

E.  Building permits issued under subsection B or C of this section shall be limated to twenty {20) percent of the
total number of lots in a subdivision or phase for projects of twenty {207 ot more lols. For subdivistons of less than
twenly (20} [ots, the maxinunn number of permits under subsection B or C af this section shall be limited 1o four. The
naximum number of model honwe building perrnits issued under subsection 1 of this scction for each unil of a subdivi-
siont shall equal ten (10) percent of the number of lots shown on the final map of the unit or a total of fiftecn {15) build-
ing pemntts, whichever is less; excepr that for subdivisions having less than thirty (30} lots the maximum numbgr of
madel pernuts will be threc. A cormputed fractional number will be rounded to the next whole nunber.

F.  Forall perouts issued under subsection B or € of this section, no certificate of occupancy may be issued uniil
the subdivision improvements are accepted by the county and the final inspection of the structure(s) is completed. Fach
pernut issued pursuani to the provisions of subscetion B or € of this section shall contain the following note: “Certifi-
cate of Occupancy shall not be issued until ali subdivision improvements have been approved by the Roard of Supervi-
sors and other apencics involved. No occupancy is allowed untit such approvals are given,”

. The conditions contained in this scetion may be applied to subdivision phases as approved by the county plan-
ning commission. {Crd, 53738 (party, 2005; Ord. 5200-B (part}, 2002: Ord. 5043.B & 1, 2000: prier code § 4.21)

20

A3



15.04.0H) Building permits on agricultural property.
Add the following to 1BC Sectian 105:

No Buiiding Perimit shall be issued for a site or building which does not comply with the provisions of Section
16.04.060,

{Crd. 3200-B (part), 2002; prior code § 4.22)

15.04.080 2006 International Code Council Electrical Code Administrative Provisions.

The following amendments and additions are made (o the 2006 International Code Council Electrical Code
Administrative Frovisions, published by ihe International Code Couneil (ICC). All references in the ICT are (o be
chanpeed o only refer to those building standards adopted by the California Building Standards Code.

WEC ICC Admimistrative Code Provisions,
A, Chapter 11—Means of Appeal. Detete and replace with the following:

The Board of Appeals shail be as called out in the Placer County Code. They shall have the same power, and
shall be the same Board.

B. Chapter 10—Violations. (Ref. Sections 1.7 and 1.8, Chapter 1, Placer County Code.} Add the following para-
graphs:

a. PENALTICS

Any persor, {irmy, or corporation, vielating any of the provisions of this Code shall be guilty of a misdemeanor
{nrst offense may be regarded as an infraction pursuant to Articles 1.16 and 1.24, Placer County Code} and
upon conviction thereof, shall be punishable by a fine of not mare than $300.00 or by imprisonment for a pe-
riod of nor more than 90 days, or by both such fine and imprisonment. Reference Ariicle 1.24, Placer County
Code.

b, VIOLATIONS

Lvery person, firn, or corporanon viglating any of the provisions of this Code shall be deemed guilty of a
separate offense for cach day or portion thereof during which such violation continued and shall be punishable
thercfore as hercin pravided,

c. PROHIBITIONS

Tt 15 unlawful for any person, Ninm, or corporation, either as owner, architect, conrracror, artisan, or otherwise 1o
do or knowingly 1o cause or permit to be done any ebeetrical wiring as defined in this code in such manner that
the sume shall not conform o all of the provisions of this Code.

d. REPCAL OF CONFLICTING ORDINANCES

All ordinances or parts of ordinances which are in conflict with the previsions of this ordinance are hercby re-
pealed,

e. VALIDITY

21

A4



If any section, sub-section, sentence, clause, or phrase of this ordinance is, for any reason, held to be unconst-
tutional or lepaltly incifective, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this ordi-
nange.

The Board of Supervisors hereby declares that it would have adopted this ordinance and each secrion, sub-
scction, sentence, ¢lause, or phrase thereof, irespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections,
sentences, clauscs, or phrases be declared unconstivutional or legally incffcctive.

C. NEC [CC Admin Provisions, Chapter 4—Permits and Fees. Delete criteria regarding expiration and refer to
Placer Code Section 15.04.050.

0. NEC ICC Admin Provisions—Section 404—Fees. Delete criteria regarding fees and refer to Placer County
Code Scction 15.04.050.

E. NEC ICC Admin Frovisions, Chapter 8— Service Uulities, Add the following:
a. Temporary clectrical service may be authorized only during periods of coustruction or repair of a structure
for which a valid permil has beew issucd, or where the conditions of approval only authorize mporary service,
b. The Chief Building Official may withhold power from any dangerous building,
¢. An area clear of obstructions shall he maintained at electrical service panel’s Jocations ahove 3,500
font elevation or where the pround snow load is greater than 70 psf,
{Ord. 5200-13 {part), 2002: prior code § 4.30)

15.04.090 Eatferm California Mechanical Code.

The following sectians of the 2006 California Mechanical Code Appendix Chaprer | are modified by the following
additions and deletions:

A, Section |14.4—Expiration. Delete subsections 114.4 and refer to Section 15.04.050 of Placer County Code.
1. Section 115—Fees. Delete Section 115.2 and refer to Section 15.04 050 of the Placer County Code.
(Ord, 5200-B (part), 2002; prior code § 4.35)
15.04. 100 Yaiform California Plumbing Code.*
The 2006 California Plumbing Code is adopled by reference with amendments imposed by the state and as
herein medificd.
A Appendix 1 Section 102.0- -Authority having jurisdiction. Add ihe following:
Unless otherwise provided for by law, the oftice of the Administrative Authority shall be the Building Depart-
ment, provided, howevet, that Environmental Health Services of the County of Placer, Department of Health
and Human Services shall, as necessary, conduct sile evaluation(s}, make plan check(s), site inspection{s) and
CORSLruCIion Inspections, 1o determiine type, size, and acceptability of any private sewage disposal systems and
shall be the Admunistrative Authornity for enforcing this section.
B. Scction 102.3—Violations and penalties. Add the following: Ref. Articles 1.16 and 1.24, Placer County
Code.

Any person, lirm or carporation violating any of the provisions of this Code shall be decmed guilty of a mis-
demeanor (first offense may be regarded as an infraction pursuant to Sections 1.7 and 1.8, Chpt. 1, Placer

22

AL



County Code) and upon conviction thereof shall be punishable by a fine of not to exceed $300.00 or by impris-
onment in the County jail for not to exceed 90 days, or by both such fine and imprisonmen,

Each separate day or any portion thereof during which any violation of this code accurs or continues shall be
deemed to constitute a separate offense, and upon conviction thereof shall be punishable as herein provided.

The issuance or granting of a pevmil or appreval of plans and specifications shall not be deemed or constued
to be a permit for, or an approval of, any violation of any of the provisions of this code,

No permut presuming Lo give authority 10 violale or cancel the provisions of this code shall be valid, except in-
sofar as, the work or use which it authorized 15 Tawtuol. :

The issuance or granting of a permit or approval of plans shall not prevent the Administrative Autherity from
thereafter requiring the correction of errors in said plans and specifications or from preventing construction op-
erations being carried on thereunder when in vielation of this Code or any other Ordinance or from revoking
any Certificate of Approval when issued in error.

A Building Permut shall not be isswed for any structure untid the proposed sewage disposal and water supply
and/or any permits which are required for scwage disposal and wartcr supply have been approved by the
Counly of Placer Department of Health and ITuman Services, Envirenmental Health Services.

o

A certificate of aecupancy shall net be issued uniil the sewape system and water supply system have been ap-
proved by the county of Placer department ol health and human services, envirenmental health serviees.
Plumbing permits issued by the building department shall expire as determined by this code. Before such work
may b recommenced, a new permit shall be first obtained to do so.

Plumbing permits issued i1 conjuniction with a buulding permit shall have the sare time limitation as the basic
building permit,

D Costof Permut. UPC and UMC fees are required for all plumbing and mechanical, as determined by this code,
L. Adda new paragraph o Section 101.4.1 2 to UPC- - Maintenance. Hlegally installed work prohibited.
It shall be uniawful (or any person o use or maintain any gas piping, or plumbing and draining system or any
portion thergol which was unlawful at the fime il was installed, aliered, or replaced and which would be unlaw-
ful under this Code if so instalied, altered, or replaced after the effective date of this Code.

F. Board of Appeals. Add the following:

The Board of Appeals shall be as specified in the Placer County Code. They shall have the same powers and |
shall be the sarme Board., -

{Ord. 3200-B (part). 2002: Ord. 4959-B (part]), 1999: prior code § 4.40)

* Mote: The 1970 Edimen ol the Uniform Fluntbing Code was replaced on Fanuary 2, 1973, by 1he 1972 Edition of UPC by Ord, 1084-13; the 1973
Laditioa was replaced with the 176 Edition by Ord. 2035, Augost 24, 1976, the 1976 Lditon was replaced walh The 1979 Eddion by Ond. 2604,
Cciober 16, 1979, Fur Jormer provisions reparding Section 4.0, see Onds. LOG] and 1291,

1504110 Generally.

A When any building 1s constructed, altered, converted maintained in vielation of the provisions of this chapter,
the enforcement agency, after giving the owner written notice and a reasonable time 10 cotrect the viglation,

23

Alb



may petition to the board of supervisors, requesting that natice of the violation be reeorded in the county re-
corder’s office,

The petition shall be ftled in triplicate with the clerk of the board of supervisors and shall set forth the facts
giving rise to such violation.

Upon receipt of the petition, the clerk of the board of supervisors shall set a date for hearing on the petition by
the board of supervisors and shall mail a copy of the petition and notice of the hearing to the owner responsible
for the violation,

In passing upon such petition, the beard of supervisers shall pass upon the truth of the aliegations of such peti-
ten and shall determine whether or not notice of the vielation shall be recorded by the elerk of the board of su-
pervisors in the eounty recorder’'s office. (Ond. 5200-B {part), 2002; prior code § 4.200)

24

Al



Before the Board of Supervisors
County of Placer, State of California

In the matter of: Ord. No.:
FIRST READING:
A RESCLUTION ADOPTING EXPRESS SECOND READING:

FINDINGS PURSUANT TO HEALTH &

SAFETY CODE SECTION 17958.5

AUTHORIZING LOCAL MODIFICATIONS

TO THE CALIFORNIA BUILDING STANDARDS CODE

The following Resolution was duly passed by the Board of Supervisors of the

County of Placer at a regular meeting heid , by the

following vote on rall call:

Ayes;
MNoes:
Absent:

Signed and approved by me after its passage.

Chairman, Board of Supervisors

Altest:
Clerk of said Board

Ann Holman

BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE COUNTY OF PLACER, STATE
OF CALIFORNIA, AS FOLLOWS:

1. WHEREAS, before making modifications or changes to the California
Building Standards Code, Health and Safety Code Section 17958.5

AlY

EXHIBIT 2



requires the Board of Supervisors to make an express finding that such
modifications or changes are reasonably necessary because of local
climatic, geological or topographical conditions, and

2. WHEREAS, the County of Placer encompasses a variety of climactic zones
and elevations from near sea level to over 10,000 feet in elevation,
including some of the heaviest snowfall areas in the United States, all of
which gives rise to the need for a variety of building requirements
especially applicable to the need of each zone, and

3. WHEREAS, the County of Placer contains a diversity of soils types,
geologic structures and geomorphologic conditions that can affect the

need for special building and testing requirements for structures in
different parts of the County, and

4. WHEREAS, the terrain of Placer County varies from néarly level farmland
in the West to extremely steep mountains in the East with numerous
tivers and streams flowing through the County that create differing

impediments to public safety access to areas of the County that may be
inhabited, and

5. WHEREAS, the Board of Supervisors has identified certain changes to the
California Building Standards Code, which are necessary for the
preservation of the public health and safety and welfare due to, the
unique local climatic, geological and topographical conditions found
within Placer County,

NOW, THEREFORE, the Board of Supervisors of Placer County does hereby
resolve that the foregoing recitals are true and correct, and the findings set
forth herein are complete and adequate pursuant to Health and Safety Code
section 17958.7 (a) for the purposes of approving the County’s
amendments to the California Building Standards Code as set forth in
Ordinance No.

AL






	01

	02

	03

	04

	05a

	06

	7a

	7b

	8a

	8b

	9a

	9b

	10

	11

	12

	13a

	13b

	13c

	14a

	14b

	14c

	15

	16a

	18a

	18b

	18c

	18d

	18e

	19a

	19b

	19c

	20

	21

	22

	23a

	23b

	23c

	24

	25a

	25b

	25c

	26

	27a

	27b

	27c

	27d

	27e

	27f

	27g

	27h

	28a

	28b

	29


