
MEMORANDUM 
COUNTY OF PLACER 
ADMINISTRATIVE SERVICES DEPARTMENT 
PROCUREMENT SERVICES DIVISION 

TO: Honorable Board of Supervisors 

FROM: Jim Boggan, Purchasing Manager fl5 
DATE: May 24, 2011 

SUBJECT: Approve the Award of Competitive Bid No.1 0056 to Blain Stumpf Trucking for 
Aggregate Materials and Hauling Service in the Maximum Amount of 
$328,225.00 

ACTION REQUESTED 

Approve the award of competitive Bid No.1 0056 to Blain Stumpf Trucking of Shingle 
Springs for aggreg.ate materials and hauling services as detailed in Attachment A in the 
maximum amount of $328,225.00, and authorize the Purchasing Manager to sign the 
resulting blanket purchase order (BPO). 

BACKGROUND 

The Department of Public Works Road Maintenance Division requires annual blanket 
purchase orders for the purchase and delivery of various types of aggregate materials on 
an as-needed basis for various road maintenance projects. Bid No.1 0056 was distributed 
via the County's E-Bid system to seventy-eight potential bidders and was also posted on 
Procurement's website. A total of seven responsive bids were received. Local vendor 
preference was considered but did not affect the outcome. Blain Stumpf Trucking was the 
lowest bidder for six of the seven bid categories. The Road Maintenance Division 
determined that award of a single BPO to Stumpf would streamline contract administration, 
thus minimizing overall cost to the County. Attachments A and B summarize the 
recommended award and bidder rankings. The complete bid evaluation is on file with the 
Clerk of the Board. 

FISCAL IMPACT 

Upon your Board's approval, a BPO will be awarded to Blain Stumpf Trucking in the 
maximum amount of $328,225.00 for the period of May 24,2011 through March 31,2012. 
The Department of Public Works' Fiscal Impact Statement is attached. 

Attachments: A - Recommended Award 
B - Rankings 
C - Public Works' Fiscal Impact Statement 

cc: Kevin Taber, DPW Road Maintenance 
Cynthia Taylor, DPW Administration 



Bid No.1 0056 - Aggregates Recommended Award Attachment A 
Exhibit A 
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Recommended Award (Blanket Purchase Order) 
BID NO_10056 - AGGREGATE MATERIALS 

Blain Stum~f Trucking, Shingle S~rings 

Material Price Material Delivery Price Delivery Estimated Extended 
Destination Per Ton Sales Tax {S.25%} Per Ton Sales Tax {S.25%} Tonnage Price 

Categ0rl A - 3/4" Class II Aggregate Base 
Roseville $ 8.56 $ 0.71 $ 7.78 $ 500 $ 8,525.00 
Granite Bay/Cavitt Stallman $ 10.09 $ 0.83 $ 5.71 $ 500 $ 8,315.00 
Lincoln $ 6.96 $ 0.57 $ 6.72 $ 1,000 $ 14,250.00 
Auburn $ 10.17 $ 0.84 $ 5.11 $ 1,500 $ 24,180.00 
Foresthill $ 10.17 $ 0.84 $ 6.15 $ 1,000 $ 17,160.00 
Colfax $ 10.17 $ 0.84 $ 7.83 $ 1,000 $ 18,840.00 
Categ0rl B - 1/2" Crushed Drain Rock 
Roseville $ 8.56 $ 0.71 $ 7.78 $ 250 $ 4,262.50 
Lincoln $ 8.56 $ 0.71 $ 6.72 $ 250 $ 3,997.50 
Auburn $ 13.38 $ 1.10 $ 5.11 $ 250 $ 4,897.50 
Foresthill $ 13.38 $ 1.10 $ 6.15 $ 250 $ 5,157.50 
Colfax $ 8.56 $ 0.71 $ 11.04 $ 250 $ 5,077.50 
Categ0rl C - 3/4" Crushed Drain Rock 
Roseville $ 8.56 $ 0.71 $ 7.78 $ 300 $ 5,115.00 
Granite Bay/Cavitt Stallman $ 8.56 $ 0.71 $ 8.84 $ 100 $ 1,811.00 
Lincoln $ 8.56 $ 0.71 $ 6.72 $ 1,000 $ 15,990.00 
Auburn $ 13.11 $ 1.08 $ 5.11 $ 1,000 $ 19,300.00 
Foresthill $ 13.11 $ 1.08 $ 6.15 $ 300 $ 6,102.00 
Colfax $ 8.56 $ 0.71 $ 11.04 $ 200 $ 4,062.00 
Cat!!Q0rl 0 -1-1/2" Crushed Drain Rock 
Roseville $ 12.84 $ 1.06 $ 6.93 $ 300 $ 6,249.00 
Lincoln $ 12.84 $ 1.06 $ 5.79 $ 500 $ 9,845.00 
Auburn $ 12.84 $ 1.06 $ 5.11 $ 500 $ 9,505.00 
Foresthill $ 12.84 $ 1.06 $ 6.15 $ 300 $ 6,015.00 
Colfax $ 12.84 $ 1.06 $ 7.83 $ 300 $ 6,519.00 
Cat!!Q0rl E - 4 x 12 Rie Rae 
Roseville $ 12.03 $ 0.99 $ 10.60 $ 200 $ 4,724.00 
Lincoln $ 12.03 $ 0.99 $ 10.60 $ 200 $ 4,724.00 
Auburn $ 12.03 $ 0.99 $ 8.48 $ 200 $ 4,300.00 
Foresthill $ 12.03 $ 0.99 $ 12.88 $ 200 $ 5,180.00 
Colfax $ 12.03 $ 0.99 $ 8.66 $ 200 $ 4,336.00 
Categ0rl F - 4 x 12 Cobble 
Roseville $ 9.63 $ 0.79 $ 9.16 $ 200 $ 3,916.00 
Foresthill $ 9.63 $ 0.79 $ 16.94 $ 200 $ 5,472.00 
Categ0rl G - 5/16" x 8 Chies 
Roseville $ 16.85 $ 1.39 $ 6.87 $ 250 $ 6,277.50 
Lincoln $ 16.85 $ 1.39 $ 7.95 $ 1.000 $ 26.190.00 
Auburn $ 16.85 $ 1.39 $ 10.13 $ 1,000 $ 28,370.00 
Foresthill $ 16.85 $ 1.39 $ 12.04 $ 500 $ 15,140.00 
Colfax $ 16.85 $ 1.39 $ 10.60 $ 500 $ 14,420.00 

Total Amount $ 328,225.00 
Total Recommended Award to Blain Stumpf Trucking $ 328,225.00 

J. Manning 4/29/2011 q fc 



Bid No. 10056 - Aggregates RANKINGS 

WESTERN PLACER COUNTY 

Category A - 3/4" Class II Aggregate Base 
Destination: Roseville. Granite BaY/Cavitt Stallman. Lincoln. Auburn. Foresthill. Colfax 

Bidder Mine 10 Information 

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs 

2 Hansen Bros., Grass Valley 

3 Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter 

4 Foster & Son Trucking, Nevada City 

5 Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln 

6 Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn 

7 Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacrarnento 

Category B - 1/2" Crushed Drain Rock 
Destinations: Roseville, Uncoln, Auburn, Foresthill, Colfax 

Bidder 

J. Manning 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs 

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter 

Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln 

Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn 

Hansen Bros., Grass Valley 

Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento 

Foster & Son Trucking, Nevada City 

Western Aggregates -10 #91-58-0001 (A.l, A.3), 
Teichert Aggregates (Perkins) - 10 #91-34-0006 
(A.2), Teichert Aggregates (Cool Cave) - 10 #91-
09-0005 (A.4, A.5, & A.6) 

Hansen Bros. (Mule Canyon Rd.) -10 #91-29-0006 
(Al - A.6) 

Westem Aggregates - 10 #91-58-0001 (Al, A.2, & 
A.3), Hansen Bros. (Mule Canyon Rd.) -10 #91-29-
0006 (A.4, A5, & A.6) 

Hansen Bros. (Mule Canyon Rd.) - 10 #91-29-0006 
(A.l -A.6) 

Western Aggregates - 10 #91-58-0001 (Al, A.2), 
Knife River Hallwood -10 #91-58-0002 (A.3, A.4), 
Teichert Aggregates (Perkins) -10 #91-34-0006 
(A.5, A.6) 

Western Aggregates - 10 #91-58-0001 (A.l, A.3), 
Teichert Aggregates (Cool Cave) -10 #91-09-0005 
(A.2, A.4, A5, & A.6) 

Granite Construction (Bradshaw) -10 #91-34-0043 
(Al - A.6) 

Mine 10 Information 

Western Aggregates - 10 #91-58-0001 (B.l, B.2, . 
& B.5), Teichert Aggregates (Cool Cave) - 10 
#91-09-0005 (B.3, B.4) 

Westem Aggregates - 10 #91-58-0001 (B.l - B.5) 
Teichert Aggregates (Hallwood) - 10 #91-58-0006 
(B.l -B.5) 
Western Aggregates -10 #91-58-0001 (B.l - B.5) 
Hansen Bros. (Mule Canyon Rd.) - 10 #91-29-0006 
(B.l -B.5) 

Granite Construction (Bradshaw) - 10 #91-34-0043 
(8.1 - B.5) 

Hansen Bros. (Mule Canyon Rd.) -10 #91-29-0006 
(B.l -B.5) 

Name of Hauler 

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs $ 

Hansen Bros., Grass Valley $ 

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter $ 

Foster & Son Trucking, Nevada City $ 

Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln $ 

Robinson Sand & Gravel, Aubum $ 

Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento $ 

Name of Hauler 

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs $ 

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter $ 

Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln $ 

Robinson Sand & Gravel, Aubum $ 

Hansen Bros., Grass Valley $ 

Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento $ 

Foster & Son Trucking, Nevada City $ 

Attachment B 
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Combined Total Price 

91,270.00 

96,850.00 

105,005.00 

105,775.00 

114,610.00 

117,810.00 

133,130.00 

Combined Total Price 

23,392.50 

27,632.50 

28,827.50 

32,217.50 

32,960.00 

33,580.00 

35,667.50 

4/29/2011 



Bid No.1 0056 - Aggregates RANKINGS 

Category C - 3/4" Crushed Drain Rock 
Destinations: Roseville, Granite Bay/Cavitt Stallman, Lincoln, Auburn, Foresthill, Colfax 

Bidder Mine 10 Information 

2 

3 

4 

5 

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs 

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter 

Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn 

Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln 

Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento 

Foster & Son Trucking, Nevada City 
Hansen Bros., GrassValley 

Category 0 -1-1/2" Crushed Drain Rock 
Destinations: Roseville, Lincoln, Auburn, Foresthill, Colfax 

Bidder 

2 

3 

4 

5 

J. Manning 

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs 

Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn 

Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln 

Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento 

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter 

Foster & Son Trucking, Nevada City 
Hansen Bros., Grass Valley 

Western Aggregates -10 #91-58-0001 (C.l, C.2, 
C.3, & C.6), Teichert Aggregates (Cool Cave) -
10 #91-09-0005 IC.4. C.5\ 

Western Aggregates - 10 #91-58-0001 (C.1, C.2, & 
C.3), Teichert Aggregates (Cool Cave) -10 #91-09-
0005 (C.4, C.5, & C.6) 

Western Aggregates - 10 #91-58-0001 (C.1 & C.3), 
Teichert Aggregates (Cool Cave) -10 #91-09-0005 
(C.2, C.4, C.5, & C.6) 
Western Aggregates -10 #91-58-0001 (C.1 & C.2), 
Knife River Hallwood -10 #91-58-0002 (C.3 & 
C.4), Teichert Aggregates (Perkins) -10 #91-34-
0006 (C.5 & C.6) 
Granite Construction (Bradshaw) - 10 #91-34-0043 
(C.1 -C.6) 

Mine 10 Information 

Teichert Aggregates (Cool Cave) -10 #91-09-
0005 (0.1 - 0.5) 
Westem Aggregates - 10 #91-58-0001 (0.1 & 0.2), 
Teichert Aggregates (Cool Cave) -10 #91-09-0005 
(0.3, 0.4, & 0.5) 

Teichert Aggregates (Hallwood) -10 #91-58-0006 
(0.1-0.5) 

Granite Construction (Bradshaw) -10 #91-34-0043 
(0.1- 0.5) 

Teichert Aggregates (Hallwood) -10 #91-58-0006 
(0.1 - 0.5) 

Name of Hauler 

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs $ 

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter $ 

Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn $ 

Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln $ 

Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento $ 

Name of Hauler 

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs $ 

Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn $ 

Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln $ 

Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento $ 

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter $ 
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Combined Total Price 

No Bid 
No Bid 

52,380.00 

58,142.00 

62,577.00 

64,071.00 

73,273.00 

Combined Total Price 

38,133.00 

42,484.00 

44,578.00 

No Bid 
No Bid 

50,550.00 

51,358.00 

4/29/2011 



Bid No.1 0056 - Aggregates 

Category E - 4 x 12 Rip Rap 
Destinations: Roseville, Lincoln, Auburn, Foresthill, Colfax 

~ 

Foster & Son Trucking, Nevada City 

2 Hansen Bros., Grass Valley 

3 Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter 

4' Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs 

5 Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn 

6 Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln 

7 Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento 

RANKINGS 

Mine 10 Information 

Hansen Bros. (Taylor Crossing Rd.) - 10 #91-29-
0007 (E.1 - E.5) 

Hansen Bros. (Taylor Crossing Rd.) - 10 #91-29-
0007 (E.1 - E.5) 

Hansen Bros. (Taylor Crossing Rd.) -10 #91-29-
0007 (E.1 - E.5) 

Hansen Bros. (Taylor Crossing Rd_) - 10 #91-29-
0007 (E.1 - E.5) 
Teichert Aggregates (Cool Cave): 10 #91-09-0005 
(E.1 - E.5) 

Western Aggregates - 10 #91-58-0001 (E.1, E.2, & 
E.3), Knife River Hallwood - 10 #91-58-0002 (E.4 & 
E.5) 

George Reed Inc. (Jackson Valley Quarry) - 10 #91· 
03-0020 (E. 1 - E. 5) 

Name of Hauler 

Foster & Son Trucking, Nevada City 

Hansen Bros., Grass Valley 

Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter 

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs 

Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn 

Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln 

Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 

$ 
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Combined Total Price 

22,276.00 

22,562.00 

22,896.00 

23,264.00 

28,600.00 

40,706.00 

43,342.00 

• - Bid Attribute No.4 of Bid No. 10056 states that "The County reserves the right to award to other than the lowest bidder per category if,. in the County's sole judgment, awarding to another bidder will 
result in more favorable pricing and/or reduce the County's overhead costs for contract administration." 

Category F - 4 x 12 Cobble 
Destinations: Roseville, Foresthill 

Bidder 
Rank 

1 Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs 
2 Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter 
3 Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn 
4 Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento 

5 Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln 

Foster & Son Trucking, Nevada City 
Hansen Bros., Grass Valley 

Category G - 5/16" x 8 Chips 
Destinations: Roseville, Lincoln, Auburn, Foresthill, Colfax 

Bidder 

2 

3 

4 

J. Manning 

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs 

Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento 

RObinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn 

Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln 

Foster & Son Trucking, Nevada City 
Hansen Bros., Grass Valley 
Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter 

Mine 10 Information 

Western Aggregates -10 #91-58-0001 (F.1 - F.2) 
Western Aggregates - 10 #91-58-0001 (F.1 - F.2) 
SRI Supreme -10 #91-58-0022 (F.1 - F.2) 
SRI Supreme - 10 #91-58-0022 (F.l - F.2) 
Teichert Aggregates (Perkins) -10 #91-34-0006 
(F.l - F.2) 

Mine 10 Information 

Granite Construction (Bradshaw) - 10 #91-34-
0043 (G.1 - G.5) 

Granite Construction (Bradshaw) - 10 #91-34-0043 
(G.1-G.5) 

Granite Construction (Bradshaw) -10 #91-34-0043 
(G.1-G.5) 
Teichert Aggregates (Hallwood) -10 #91-58-0006 
(G.1-G.5) 

Name of Hauler 

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs $ 
Sutter Transfer Service, Sutter $ 
Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn $ 
Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento $ 

Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln $ 

Name of Hauler 

Blain Stumpf Trucking, Shingle Springs $ 

Hastie's Capitol Sand & Gravel, Sacramento $ 

Robinson Sand & Gravel, Auburn $ 

Larry Newman Trucking, Lincoln $ 

Combined Total Price 

No Bid 
No Bid 

9,388.00 
10,176.00 
12,202.00 
13,888.00 

14,074.00 

Combined Total Price 

90,397.50 

97,005.00 

100,617.50 

118,550.00 

No Bid 
No Bid 
No Bid 

4/29/2011 



TO: 

FROM: 

MEMORANDUM 
DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS 

County of Placer 

Honorable Board of Supervisors DATE: 

Ken Grehm, Director 

SUBJECT: FISCAL IMPACT STATEMENT 
Annual Aggregate Materials and Hauling Contract 

Attachment C 

May 24,2011 

Sufficient funding has been budgeted in the amount of $328,225.00 in the FY 2011-12 
Roads Aggregates and Oils Budget in Fund 120. 

lOO 
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